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Summary 

Climate change and violent conflicts are making 
the fight against poverty harder. Capital flows are 
more difficult to control. The eyes of the world are 
on these challenges. This creates opportunities for 
a Norwegian development policy that takes a stra­
tegic approach to climate change, conflict and cap­
ital, which are key factors affecting development 
and the fight against poverty. Norway can add 
value in the global efforts to address these issues. 

Although the world’s rich and poor are becom­
ing increasingly intertwined in a complex global 
economy, the goods remain unevenly distributed. 
Norwegian development policy is designed to chal­
lenge the unequal distribution of power within and 
between countries, as well as the conditions that 
underpin injustice, oppression and discrimination 
– at every level. A principal task of Norwegian 
development policy is to help countries gain con­
trol over their own development, and to help indi­
viduals gain control over their own lives. Our 
efforts are based on solidarity. The fight against 
poverty, our commitment to the UN Millennium 
Development Goals and the belief in a UN-led 
world order stand firm. We pursue a rights-based 
development policy that aims to assist states fulfil 
their obligations and enable individuals to claim 
their rights. 

Through its development policy, Norway influ­
ences factors that promote or impede develop­

ment. Norway has already initiated targeted 
efforts in key areas such as good governance, 
human rights, education, health, and gender equal­
ity. The results of Norwegian aid are good, but aid 
is just one of several development policy tools. In 
order to respond adequately to complex chal­
lenges, we have to use a range of other tools as 
well. We need to make active use of aid and diplo­
macy in a mutually reinforcing way. In Norway, for­
eign policy and development policy have already 
become more closely linked, but there are a 
number of other policy areas that also have signifi­
cance for developing countries. Thus, it is neces­
sary to view domestic policy and our development 
policy more coherently. 

National action and global constraints 

A national development process cannot be engi­
neered by external actors. This white paper exam­
ines national opportunities, as well as the responsi­
bility individual developing countries have for 
shaping their own future. There are three elements 
that the Government considers crucial for develop­
ment: a functioning state, an active civil society, 
and a viable private sector. Developing countries 
must make their own choices and set their own pri­
orities regarding the development of social serv­
ices, democracy and policies for promoting 
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employment and economic growth. Norway can 
support these processes by providing funding and 
expertise. 

Every nation state operates within global 
framework conditions. Our development policy 
contributes towards ensuring that global organisa­
tions and processes have a clear development per­
spective that can expand room for action at national 
level where necessary, for example by promoting 
better terms of trade or better access to loans and 
capital. At the same time, binding international 
agreements, such as the international human 
rights conventions, are designed to strengthen the 
position of individuals. 

The major global challenges cannot be 
addressed by any one country on its own. They can 
only be addressed through closer international 
cooperation and a better global order. This white 
paper employs the term «global public goods» to 
describe a number of conditions that are essential 
for development, such as a stable climate, interna­
tional peace and security, control over infectious 
diseases, and a well-functioning global financial 
system. The global nature of these goods makes it 
difficult to apportion responsibility and costs for 
strengthening and securing them. 

Norway will promote the development of an 
international policy for strengthening global public 
goods that includes strategies for funding and for 
the redistribution of power. This raises questions 
about the use of aid for such purposes that need to 
be clarified. Many measures, such as those 
employed in the fight against malaria, serve both 
to strengthen global public goods and to promote 
national development. Such measures can be 
funded through the aid budget. Others, such as 
capital injections to stabilise the international 
financial market, cannot be considered aid, even 
though they too are important for poor countries. 

In this white paper, the Government advocates 
the development of an international system for 
identifying, and maintaining an overview of, the 
various countries’ contributions to the funding of 
global public goods. This would help to increase 
political focus on the need for funding. 

Climate change 

Climate change is making the existing obstacles to 
eradicating poverty even greater. Without an inter­
national effort to assist developing countries in 
adapting to climate change, global poverty will 
increase. This is primarily a matter of reducing 
poor countries’ vulnerability to the impacts of cli­
mate change. Norway’s efforts in the fight against 

poverty will also seek to address the problems 
caused by climate change. In order to be robust, 
environmental policy – in both rich and poor coun­
tries – must be linked to an economic policy that 
promotes employment and growth in income and 
production. The establishment of a ministerial post 
whose portfolio includes both environment and 
development has made it easier to ensure coher­
ence and coordination across policy areas. 

We will gradually see a substantial rise in 
greenhouse gas emissions from the major emerg­
ing economies. Rapid population growth will exac­
erbate the situation. But it is primarily the rich part 
of the world that must shoulder responsibility for 
climate change and address its impacts by demon­
strating that climate-friendly economic growth is 
possible. Recognition of this fact, combined with 
emission cuts at home and effective support for 
economic growth in poor countries, will provide 
the foundation for a global climate policy that 
includes all the countries of the world. 

The scale and speed of climate change make it 
imperative for the international community to 
reach early agreement on a common agenda, but 
with varying forms of action. Poor countries with 
far lower emissions levels than ours will not be will­
ing to sacrifice their own economic growth for the 
sake of the global fight against climate change. 
This is why Norway and other rich countries must 
implement concrete measures that make it attrac­
tive for partner countries to choose climate-
friendly development options. 

The Government of Norway’s International Climate 
and Forest Initiative 

Through its climate and forest initiative, Norway 
has taken a leading role internationally in protect­
ing tropical forests. This initiative is part of overall 
efforts to secure global public goods. It is playing 
an important catalytic role by encouraging multilat­
eral organisations and other countries to take part 
in urgently needed global action to prevent climate 
change. The initiative is designed both to facilitate 
the inclusion of emissions from deforestation and 
forest degradation in a new global climate regime 
and to support national development processes. 
Projects under this initiative must promote sustain­
able use and conservation of tropical forests. They 
must improve the living conditions of indigenous 
peoples and safeguard their rights, protect biodi­
versity, and reduce global emissions of green­
house gases. The Government has therefore 
decided to use funds allocated over the aid budget 
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for projects under this initiative, in cooperation 
with the recipient countries. 

Conflict 

Most of the armed conflicts in the world today take 
place in poor countries. Poverty in itself is not a 
cause of conflict, but the majority of armed con­
flicts are to be found in the poorest parts of the 
world. Efforts to resolve conflicts and build peace 
also help to combat poverty and to pave the way for 
development. 

Armed conflicts entail security policy chal­
lenges that extend to areas and populations far 
beyond those that are directly affected. Neigh­
bouring countries and whole regions can be desta­
bilised and, at worst, drawn directly into the con­
flict. Some conflicts can have global repercussions. 

The civilian suffering caused by armed conflict 
is enormous, and women and children are espe­
cially vulnerable to abuse and sexual violence. The 
objective of humanitarian efforts is to save lives 
and relieve suffering. The current situation where 
civilian personnel are increasingly regarded as tar­
gets on a par with military personnel is creating 
new dilemmas. The UN is the international actor 
that has made most progress in developing an inte­
grated approach to peacebuilding. Peace and rec­
onciliation efforts are based on respect for and pro­
motion of human rights. The Government will con­
tinue to give priority to efforts in fragile states. 

Capital 

As a result of rapid growth in the world economy, 
the total gross national income of developing coun­
tries has doubled over the last five years. This has 
had positive ripple effects in the form of reduced 
poverty and higher living standards for millions of 
people. However, the financial crisis and the global 
downturn will lead to serious setbacks in the fight 
against poverty. It is not possible to foresee the full 
consequences of this. 

Developing countries must be given greater 
access to global capital, better opportunities for 
value creation, and more control over their own 
economic resources. The Government will inten­
sify efforts to support such developments, for 
example by stimulating trade, promoting invest­
ment and facilitating remittance transfers from 
migrants. At the same time, it is important to com­
bat illicit financial flows from developing countries, 
which are estimated to total as much as NOK 4000 
billion a year. The fight against tax havens will be a 
key element in these efforts. 

Aid is an important source of funding for devel­
opment. Aid is unique in that it is a source of fund­
ing that both donors and recipients have control 
over, and can thus be administered strategically. 
The Government will use aid tactically as a devel­
opment policy tool to mobilise other resources, 
and to influence national and local development 
processes. Aid is also an important factor in vari­
ous international contexts, and can be used to influ­
ence international framework conditions for devel­
opment in poor countries. 

Migration and development 

The Government will highlight the development 
policy aspects of migration. Migrants send large 
sums of money back to their countries of origin – 
amounting to nearly three times as much as total 
global aid. And migrants who return to their home 
countries take back valuable work experience and 
skills. On the other hand, the need for qualified 
workers in Western countries has led to a loss of 
vital resources in many developing countries in 
what is known as the brain drain. Migration is 
expected to become increasingly significant for 
development in the future. Norway intends to play 
a proactive role in efforts to establish an interna­
tional framework for ethical recruitment of health 
workers from developing countries. The Govern­
ment will seek to facilitate better systems for remit­
tance transfers by migrants to their home coun­
tries. The Government also intends to involve 
migrant communities more closely in development 
cooperation. 

Consequences 

With a view to taking a more strategic approach to 
development, Norway will focus on the compara­
tive advantages of the various channels for provid­
ing aid and on ways to ensure that our policy pro­
duces the best possible results. Pursuing all our 
development policy goals through all the channels 
available is neither strategic nor effective. 

Norwegian aid constitutes only 4 per cent of 
total international aid. It is important to see our 
efforts in the context of contributions made by 
other donors. In order to increase the overall effec­
tiveness of global aid, it is vital to ensure a good 
division of labour between the various actors. This 
will have consequences for Norway’s policy, such 
as: 
•	 In sectors where many donors are already 

involved, and Norway does not have special 
expertise that is in demand, Norwegian aid will 
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primarily be channelled through multilateral 
organisations. This applies in particular to sec­
tors such as health and education, and to parts 
of other sectors such as governance, agricul­
ture and general capacity and institution build­
ing. The shift towards multilateral channels 
does not mean that these sectors have lower 
priority. The total Norwegian aid to these sec­
tors will be maintained at least at the 2008 level. 

•	 Bilateral aid, primarily government-to-govern­
ment, will be increasingly focused on areas 
where Norway has recognised expertise. Nor­
wegian support must be requested by, and pro­
vide added value for, the partner country. 
Relevant sectors include climate, the environ­
ment, sustainable development, peacebuilding, 
human rights and humanitarian assistance, oil 
and clean energy, women and gender equality, 
good governance and the fight against corrup­
tion. 

•	 Norway will move issues of significant political 
priority higher up on the agenda by providing 
funding to, and participating actively on the 
governing boards of, multilateral organisa­
tions. This applies in particular to climate pol­
icy and Norway’s climate and forest initiative, 
various peace initiatives, gender equality, man­
agement of non-renewable resources, and 
efforts to combat illicit financial flows. 

•	 The gradual shift in focus to countries that are 
emerging from armed conflict, and to coun­
tries that are facing particular challenges relat­
ing to climate change, will continue. This 
applies to all channels for Norwegian aid. 

•	 Environment and climate change is the sector 
where funding will increase most in the future. 

Towards a more coherent, development-friendly 
Norwegian policy 

In 2006, the Government appointed the Norwegian 
Policy Coherence Commission to examine the 
practical political opportunities for achieving 
greater policy coherence in relation to interna­
tional development. In its report Coherent for 
development? (NOU 2008:14), the Commission 
examines Norwegian policy in a number of differ­
ent areas, including trade, investment, financing 
for development, climate and energy, migration, 
transfer of knowledge and technology, and peace, 
security and defence. The report sets out several 
proposals for bringing Norwegian policy as a 
whole into line with Norway’s development objec­
tives. The committee was divided on many issues. 
This shows just how challenging the ambition of 
achieving greater policy coherence is. 

The report, together with responses from the 
round of consultations on this document, forms 
part of the background material for this white 
paper. The Government has already initiated and 
implemented measures in several of the areas cov­
ered by the report, and new measures have been 
proposed for other areas. The very broad approach 
of the report means that it is relevant not only for 
this white paper, but also for a number of other 
ongoing processes. The task of making Norway’s 
overall policy more development-friendly is a diffi­
cult and long-term process. The white paper pro­
poses the establishment of a system of annual 
reporting on the coherence between Norway’s 
domestic and development policy. This would cre­
ate a framework for further discussion of the pro­
posals put forward by the Policy Coherence Com­
mission and of other important issues that can 
increase coherence in the years ahead. 
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1 Introduction  

World poverty is no coincidence. It is a result of 
international power structures. Of poor policies 
and poor leadership. Of historical trends and con­
flicts. Of oppression and discrimination. Although 
the world’s rich and poor are becoming increas­
ingly intertwined in a complex global economy, the 
goods remain unevenly distributed. The disparity 
between those who have most and those who have 
least has never been greater. 

International human rights form the normative 
basis for Norway’s development policy. This policy 
aims to assist states in fulfilling their obligations 
and enable individuals to claim their rights. The 
white paper On equal terms: Women’s rights and 
gender equality in development policy (Report No. 
11 (2007–2008) to the Storting) was an important 
step forward in Norway’s systematic efforts to 
address the need for change in power structures at 
all levels. The perspectives in that white paper and 
the subsequent recommendation of the Standing 
Committee on Foreign Affairs are to be taken into 
consideration in all aspects of Norwegian develop­
ment policy. 

Norway’s efforts to promote international 
development are based on the principle of solidar­
ity. There is broad support for our development 
policy and the aid we provide among the Norwe­
gian public and in the Storting. The government 
budget for 2009 represents a milestone in this 
respect: we will spend 1 per cent of gross national 
income (GNI) on development in poor countries. 
In addition, Norwegian NGOs raise funds totalling 
several hundred million kroner. 

Through its development policy, Norway influ­
ences factors that promote or impede develop­
ment. Aid is one important development policy 
tool. Norway has already initiated targeted efforts 
in key areas such as good governance, human 
rights, education, health, and gender equality. The 
results of Norwegian aid have been good. How­
ever, the Government believes that the results of 
both its overall development policy and its specific 
aid efforts could be even better with a more strate­
gic approach. 

Addressing climate change, resolving violent 
conflicts and improving the management of finan­
cial flows will be of crucial importance for the 

future of developing countries. Here Norway has 
the opportunity to take responsibility at the inter­
national level. We can make a difference. The Gov­
ernment believes that the time is ripe for a 
stronger policy for addressing climate change, 
conflict and capital flight in a development policy 
perspective. 

Climate change is already high on the interna­
tional agenda. Scientific research leaves no doubt 
about the reality of man-made climate change and 
the seriousness of the situation. Changes to our liv­
ing conditions will spin out of control. We will be 
fighting a losing battle against poverty. At the same 
time, there is broad popular support across 
national borders for measures to address climate 
change. Politicians all over the world are facing 
demands for action. This raises the hope that new 
political approaches and technological innovation 
can alleviate the situation and create new opportu­
nities for growth, especially in developing coun­
tries. We must make use of this room for action,  
and put efforts to stabilise the global climate sys­
tem at the centre of development policy. 

Most of today’s violent conflicts are in poor, 
fragile states. Conflict exacerbates poverty and 
reverses development. Several of these conflicts 
have spillover effects far beyond the areas directly 
involved, and are attracting widespread interna­
tional attention. Peace needs to be firmly rooted in 
the population, and negotiations must be followed 
up with tangible improvements to living condi­
tions. Norway has a long tradition of contributing 
to peacebuilding. We also have credibility as a 
development actor. This gives us opportunities to 
pursue a policy that highlights the links between 
security and development. 

Globalisation brings a number of advantages, 
but it also creates challenges. For example, it has 
become far easier to move capital from one coun­
try to another. This means that it is relatively sim­
ple to transfer large sums of money out of poor 
countries and into what are known as secrecy juris­
dictions or tax havens. Substantial amounts are lost 
through corruption. Opportunities to make huge 
profits very fast are resulting in overexploitation of 
developing countries’ natural resources. Globalisa­
tion also leads to increased migration. Migrants 
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send large sums of money to their families in their 
countries of origin. Other forms of capital are also 
transferred to developing countries, for example 
through grants, loans and investments from grow­
ing economies such as China and India. 

The Government considers it important to 
ensure that developing countries are given greater 
access to global capital and better opportunities for 
value creation. We believe it is important to pursue 
an active policy that steers financial flows in a more 
development-friendly direction and stops illegal 
capital flight out of poor countries. This is particu­
larly important now that the financial crisis is 
undermining the economic forces for develop­
ment: trade and investment are falling and less pri­
ority is being given to aid. 

In order to further strengthen its strategic 
approach to development, the Government will 
focus its efforts on areas where Norway has recog­
nised expertise, and where Norwegian efforts are 
in demand and can give added value for the partner 
country concerned. It is by combining Norwegian 
know-how and political will that we have the best 
prospects of success. In recent years, we have 
achieved the best results when we have made opti­
mal use of our international engagement and the 
full breadth of our foreign policy and development 
policy apparatus to promote bold, innovative politi­
cal initiatives. The debt relief campaigns and the 
fight against landmines and cluster munitions are 
good examples of the contribution Norway can 
make by combining political courage with the 
resources and expertise needed to succeed. 

Closer links between development policy and 
foreign policy 

This white paper represents a step forward in the 
process of integrating development policy and for­
eign policy. Our development policy involves us in 
processes and funding mechanisms that have a 
place within a wider political framework. Both giv­
ing and receiving reflect political priorities. This 
means that some of the themes dealt with in this 
white paper will also be discussed in the forthcom­
ing white paper on our foreign policy priorities. 
Work on the two white papers has been closely 
coordinated so that they complement each other 
while at the same time functioning as independent 
documents. 

The central aim of our foreign policy is to safe­
guard Norwegian interests. In development policy, 
the focus is on poor countries’ interests. However, 
these interests coincide in many areas. Climate pol­
icy is one. A stable climate is in everyone’s inter­

ests; it is a global public good. Climate change con­
cerns people all over the world. Although rich and 
poor countries are being affected differently, we 
have a common interest in gaining control over cli­
mate change. Here, our mutual dependence across 
national borders is clearly apparent. Human rights 
is another area of common interest that Norway 
promotes through both foreign and development 
policy. In the long term, a stable international legal 
order – which is in Norway’s interests – can only 
be developed by countries that respect fundamen­
tal human rights. But there are other policy areas 
where the interests of poor and rich countries are 
in direct opposition to each other. Certain issues 
relating to migration and trade are examples here. 

An approach that includes an emphasis on com­
mon interests can further enhance understanding 
of and support for an active foreign and develop­
ment policy, and can open up opportunities for new 
forms of cooperation. The Government believes 
that it is important for development policy to pro­
mote global public goods. However, the focus on 
safeguarding common interests and seeking to 
strengthen global public goods does not mean that 
the Government wishes to use development policy 
to further Norwegian economic interests or any 
other form of Norwegian self-interest. The objec­
tive of Norway’s development policy is to reduce 
poverty and promote human rights. 

The road leading to this white paper 

It is now about five years since the Storting 
debated the previous white paper on development 
policy, Fighting Poverty Together (Report No. 35 
(2003–2004) to the Storting). The subsequent rec­
ommendation of the Standing Committee on For­
eign Affairs showed that there is broad agreement 
on the main lines of our development policy. This 
white paper raises two key questions: What are the 
consequences of the developments in international 
politics over the last few years for our development 
policy? And how can we further improve our devel­
opment results? 

This white paper uses the term aid to refer to 
the funding of the various measures that donor and 
recipient have agreed to give priority to. Aid can be 
given in many ways and through many different 
channels. In contrast to other factors that govern 
how a country develops, aid is a tool over which 
both donor and recipient have a considerable 
degree of control. Development policy encompasses 
the full range of political approaches and tools that 
Norway uses actively to influence the various fac­
tors that determine the framework for develop­
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ment in poor countries. The initiatives we take and 
the messages we communicate in various interna­
tional contexts are important development policy 
tools. So is an awareness of the consequences of 
our foreign policy for conditions for development 
in poor countries. Aid is, of course, a key develop­
ment policy tool, but it is only one of several. 

In this white paper, we present our understand­
ing of changes in the framework for development, 
and how these create opportunities for a strategic 
and future-oriented development policy. Our objec­
tive has been to produce a document that is to the 
point and provides the Storting with a good basis 
for discussing strategic development policy meas­
ures. This white paper stakes out the course for 
Norwegian development policy. It takes a general 
approach. Practical tools for implementation will 
be developed, as appropriate, at a later stage. 

This white paper takes into account dialogue in 
and with the Storting in connection with the annual 
budget proposals, foreign policy addresses in 2006 
and 2007, and the recommendation of the Standing 
Committee on Foreign Affairs on certain develop­
ment policy issues dealt with in the Minister of the 
Environment and International Development’s 
address to the Storting on 8 June 2007. It also 
refers to the Government’s status report on Nor­
way’s efforts in relation to the UN Millennium 
Development Goals in the 2009 budget proposal. 

In 2006, the Government appointed the Norwe­
gian Policy Coherence Commission to examine the 
practical political opportunities for achieving 
greater policy coherence in relation to interna­
tional development. The committee has drawn up 
an Official Norwegian Report (NOU 2008:14), 
which examines Norwegian policy in a number of 
different areas, including trade, investment, financ­
ing for development, climate and energy, migra­
tion, transfer of knowledge and technology, and 
peace, security and defence. The report, together 
with responses from the public hearing on the 
report, forms part of the background material for 
this white paper. 

During the preparation of this white paper, we 
have maintained close dialogue with relevant 
organisations and institutions in Norway. We have 
received important input from a number of differ­
ent Norwegian actors, including NGOs and 
research institutions. Progress on the white paper 
has been presented in many different contexts 
both at political level and in the international devel­
opment community. Information has also been 
published on the Government’s website 
(www.regjeringen.no), where an electronic mail­
box has been available for the public to post their 

points of view. This has been widely used. Many of 
the suggestions have been taken into account in 
the white paper. 

1.1 The backdrop: A changing world 

In the 1980s, the more prosperous part of the 
world was divided into two economic and political 
blocs. It was a bipolar world, with the US and 
NATO on one side, and the Soviet Union and the 
Warsaw Pact on the other. The balance of terror 
between these blocs was the predominant factor in 
security policy. The EU had 12 member countries. 
Germany was divided in two. Saddam Hussein was 
an important Western ally in the Iran–Iraq conflict. 
The poorest countries were referred to as the 
Third World and found themselves caught 
between the two blocs. At the same time, the bal­
ance of terror extended beyond the two blocs and 
the two superpowers had allies all over the world. 

After the fall of the Berlin Wall in 1989, there 
was a period of just under ten years when the US 
was the dominant political and economic power. 
During this period, the world was more or less uni­
polar. Gradually, however, the US position has 
been challenged – both politically and economi­
cally. Today, the EU has 27 member countries, 
including several former Warsaw Pact members. 
Security policy is again at the top of the interna­
tional political agenda. Twenty years ago, who 
would have guessed that the most important secu­
rity policy engagement for NATO and for Norway 
would be in Afghanistan? 

The US economy is now under severe pres­
sure. Nevertheless, the country is expected to 
retain its position as the most important super­
power for the foreseeable future. And the new US 
administration has announced that it will pursue an 
active and inclusive foreign policy 

Box 1.1  The US – prepared to take the lead 

«Finally, we will make it clear to the world 
that America is ready to lead. To protect our 
climate and our collective security, we must 
call together a truly global coalition. I’ve 
made it clear that we will act, but so too must 
the world.» 
Source: Remarks by the President on Jobs, Energy Inde­
pendence, and Climate Change, East Room of the White 
House, 26 January 2009 
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Figure 1.1  China is playing an increasingly impor-
tant role as a development partner in a number of 
African countries. 
Photo: Christopher Herwig/Scanpix 

The financial crisis and its rapid spin-off effects 
demonstrate how closely interwoven the interna­
tional economy has become. In order to maximise 
profitability, the production of goods and services 
is being transferred across national borders – par­
ticularly to developing countries, where labour is 
cheap. Transfer of production leads to transfer of 
capital and knowledge. The internationalisation of 
business is a major factor for development in many 
poor countries, although the very poorest coun­
tries are only able to attract foreign investment to a 
limited extent. 

The trend towards internationalisation has 
been underway for several decades, but it has only 
recently become obvious that we are in the midst 
of a shift in political and economic power – from 
west to east. China has experienced extraordinary 
economic growth. Never have so many people 
been lifted out of poverty as in China in recent 
years. However, the financial crisis is making itself 
strongly felt in the country. At the beginning of 
2009, unemployment had already increased by sev­
eral million. The full extent to which the financial 
crisis will affect China’s development is uncertain. 
We should bear in mind that it is the country with 
the largest population in the world, and a growing 
proportion of its population is completing higher 
education. 

China’ economic growth is also evident in its 
more active engagement in the global arena. China 
is Africa’s third largest trading partner after the US 
and France. A number of countries are refinancing 
their loans through loan and trade agreements 
with China. For the first time in the World Bank’s 
history, African countries have being paying back 

their loans ahead of schedule. China is outcompet­
ing the World Bank and the International Mone­
tary Fund (IMF) by offering loans and agreements 
with few requirements regarding reform, good 
governance or respect for human rights. China is 
also investing heavily in several mineral- and oil-
producing countries in Africa and the Middle East. 
Many countries welcome China’s engagement, 
partly as a counterweight to years of American and 
European domination, but also as an important 
player at the international level and in connection 
with its own poverty reduction. China regularly 
invites African heads of state to conferences, 
where investment and trade agreements worth 
huge sums of money are concluded. 

Following Beijing’s example, India held its first 
meeting for African leaders in 2008. Strong eco­
nomic growth has increased the country’s self con­
fidence in the international arena. It has been both 
able and willing to criticise the existing interna­
tional framework on several occasions, for example 
during the World Trade Organization (WTO) 
negotiations. For many years, India has been run­
ning its own development programme, and is now 
the leading actor in the region. It is not possible, for 
example, to envisage a resolution to the conflict in 
Sri Lanka without India playing a key role as facili­
tator, or without at least the approval of New Delhi. 

South Africa is playing a crucial role in sub-
Saharan Africa. It holds the key to stability in Zim­
babwe, and this in turn will be decisive for develop­
ment in the region. The extent to which South 
Africa succeeds in this role will be a test of Africa’s 
credibility internationally as a continent that takes 
the responsibility for its own development. In Latin 
America, it is Brazil that is the economic engine – 
the driving force for regional integration in vital 
areas such as infrastructure, energy supply, eco­
nomic development and security. And China is in a 
class of its own. Together with Russia, these coun­
tries are known as the BRICS countries, after the 
first letter of their names. Other countries with 
growing economies and ambitions are also playing 
an important part in the international arena. 

Although the growing economies are by no 
means a homogenous group, they do have similar 
interests in many areas. Their ambition is clear: 
they want to play a more prominent role in the 
major political forums. We have moved from a uni­
polar to a multipolar world. 

The traditional major powers are responding to 
this trend. Several countries are now advocating 
that the rapidly growing economies should be 
given a more prominent role in key international 
organisations. At the G8 meeting in 2008, the need 
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to include China and India to create a G10 was dis­
cussed. The Managing Director of the Interna­
tional Monetary Fund has stated that the Fund will 
be unable to retain its legitimacy unless rights and 
obligations are redistributed to reflect the eco­
nomic balance of power in the world today. The 
G20, which was established to ensure cooperation 
on major challenges created for example by the 
financial crisis and weaker global growth, is the 
first forum where established and emerging eco­
nomic major powers meet on an equal footing. 

From a development point of view, it is interest­
ing to note that forums that used to focus on eco­
nomic and security policy issues have become cen­
tral arenas for discussing the challenges faced by 
developing countries. This applies to the G8, within 
NATO and not least in the WTO. 

1.2	 Development and the fight against 
poverty 

Development is a complex concept. Over the years, 
there has been a growing emphasis on considering 
development in a broader perspective, and not in 
terms of economic growth alone. 

A common departure point is to view develop­
ment within a framework of opportunities, capabil­
ities and liberties. Development gives people the 
opportunity to live longer and healthier lives, 
access to knowledge, better standards of living and 
living conditions, and greater opportunity to partic­
ipate in society and in decision-making processes 
that affect them. 

It is this understanding of development that 
forms the basis for the Millennium Declaration, 
which won unanimous support at the UN General 
Assembly in 2000. These countries reaffirmed 
their determination to ensure: 
•	 that basic needs for education, food, health and 

housing are met 
•	 sustainable economic development that 

reduces social disparity and poverty 
•	 the rule of law, participation in society, free­

dom, democratic governance and equality 
• opportunities to retain cultural identity 
•	 environmental, economic and social sustaina­

bility 
•	 human security in the face of threats such as 

hunger, unemployment and conflict. 

The deadline for achieving the Millennium 
Development Goals is 2015. They represent the 
first universally recognised agenda for develop­
ment. They set clear targets and indicators for the 

most urgent development needs. These goals form 
an important basis for Norway’s development 
policy, and we have taken on a particular responsi­
bility for MDGs 4 and 5 on reducing child mortality 
and improving maternal health. 

Development policy should seek to provide a 
national and international framework that enables 
individuals to create a better future for themselves, 
and enables poor countries to do likewise. A key 
element is control – at individual, social and state 
level. It is important to create a situation where 
people can control their own resources and claim 
their rights, where they enjoy a minimum of eco­
nomic and human security, and are thus able to 
make choices that will improve their future. 

Major differences 

The approximately 150 countries and territories 
that are on the list of recipients of official develop­
ment assistance (ODA) approved by the Organisa­
tion for Economic Co-operation and Development 
(OECD) have very different starting points for 
development. The OECD’s list of ODA recipients 
includes both the world’s poorest countries, such 
as the Democratic Republic of Congo and Haiti, as 
well as upper middle-income countries such as 
Argentina and Croatia. The middle-income coun­
try Botswana has a far greater capacity for making 
use of development aid than its neighbour Zambia, 
which is defined as a least developed country 
(LDC). Major emerging economies such as China 
and India are also included on the list, and are thus 
defined as developing countries. 

The debate on development will lose both 
nuance and relevance if we make sweeping gener­
alisations about such a broad range of countries. It 
is vital that we recognise that developing countries 
make up a large and diverse group. The results 
achieved in the fight against poverty are very une­
ven – both within countries and between countries. 
In Asia, prosperity has increased significantly. 
Whether or not this trend can be maintained in the 
years ahead remains to be seen. High food and 
energy prices combined with poor prospects for 
growth in the world economy will create consider­
able difficulties. 

Despite the fact that several countries in sub-
Saharan Africa are enjoying steady economic 
growth, the effect on poverty in the region as a 
whole has so far been limited. One reason for this 
is that many of these countries had such weak 
economies at the outset that their capacity for 
translating economic growth into immediate pov­
erty reduction has been very limited. 
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Figure 1.2 Number of people living in extreme poverty 1981–2005. 
New figures from the World Bank show that poverty is more widespread than previously thought. The estimated number of people 
living in extreme poverty in 2005 has been adjusted upwards from 1 billion to 1.4 billion. However, the revised figures have little 
impact on the positive trend we are seeing in poverty reduction. Globally, poverty has been reduced by 20 per cent over the last 20 
years. There are, however, major regional differences. 
Source: Chen and Ravallion, Policy Research Working Paper 4703, World Bank, 2008 

The impact of the global financial crisis will 
vary from country to country. The emerging econ­
omies are being drawn headlong into the crisis, but 
are in a stronger position to deal with it than the 
poorest countries, where it may have far-reaching 
impacts. In the short term, poverty must be 
expected to increase. 

Poverty affects different social groups differ­
ently. Women account for a larger proportion of the 
world’s poorest than men. Single women are hit 
hardest of all. One woman dies every minute from 
complications associated with pregnancy or child­
birth, adding up to half a million women each year. 
Some 40 million people have fled from wars and 
conflicts. More than 30 million people are infected 
with HIV. Most of these live in sub-Saharan Africa. 
Children are affected by poverty in different ways 
to adults, and they are especially vulnerable to hun­
ger and disease. 

1.3	 Norway’s development policy 
profile 

Norway is one of the world’s richest countries. 
Eurostat’s figures for 2008 show that Norway’s per 
capita gross national income (GNI) is more than 80 
per cent higher than the EU average and some 55 
per cent higher than in Sweden and Denmark. This 
entails obligations. 

Norway’s development policy is based on val­
ues such as solidarity, compassion and human 
rights, and on a fundamental conviction that all 
people are entitled to a life of dignity. Many Norwe­
gians are actively engaged in development efforts, 
for example through religious groups, various 
interest organisations and the labour movement. 
We can use our privileged economic situation both 
to maintain development aid at a level of at least 
one per cent of GNI, and to take new initiatives in 
international arenas to address the major chal­
lenges the world is facing. This Government 
intends to follow up its political message with con­
crete aid efforts. 

Norway is a major energy producer. We have 
rich natural resources. We have 100 years’ experi­
ence of renewable energy production and 40 years’ 
experience of oil and gas production. We have 
developed a comprehensive system for sound man­
agement of our resources that takes full account of 
health, safety and environment issues in addition 
to economic and energy policy interests. 

As a producer and net exporter, Norway is 
helping to meet the world’s demand for energy, 
which is a key factor for economic growth and 
social development. Norway intends to play an 
active role in the development of new renewable 
energy sources that can replace today’s fossil 
energy carriers. We can provide experience of 
hydropower that will be useful as the world seeks 
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to shift to cleaner sources of energy. Norway’s 
technical and administrative expertise from the 
petroleum sector can also play a part in efforts to 
address climate and energy issues. The Govern­
ment is actively seeking to ensure coherence 
between development and foreign policy objectives 
and environment and energy policy efforts. 

The Government will use various approaches 
to address the problem of climate change. We are 
giving priority to decarbonisation of fossil fuels, 
and are intensifying efforts to develop and share 
clean energy technology and to stop deforestation. 
A change in pace is needed in these areas at global 
level if we are to successfully come to grips with cli­
mate change. They will become increasingly 
important areas of Norwegian policy. In this way, 
we can safeguard Norway’s interests and at the 
same time take a responsible approach in the glo­
bal efforts to address climate change. 

The Nobel Peace Prize and the legacy of Fridt­
jof Nansen have helped to give Norway a reputa­
tion as a pioneer in peace efforts. This image has 
been reinforced by our participation in a number of 
peace and reconciliation operations and engage­
ments. Norway has never been a colonial power. 
This creates opportunities for engagement that are 
closed to former colonial powers. In certain situa­
tions, our position as a modern European country 
that is not formally connected to the EU bloc can 
also open up opportunities. In 2008, the Washing-
ton-based think tank Center for Global Develop­
ment ranked Norway in first place among OECD 
members in the Security component in its Commit­
ment to Development Index. This shows that we 
have a good starting point for maintaining a high 
level of engagement in peace and reconciliation 
efforts. 

Norway is one of the largest contributors to the 
UN and a champion of a UN-led world order. Glo­
bal governance based on national sovereignty and 
respect for human rights is of vital importance 
both for developing countries and for ourselves. 
Our position in the UN and other multilateral 
organisations means that we can play an active role 
in both supporting and advocating reform initia­
tives. 

Norwegian society is based on a model that 
ensures that the population’s basic needs are met. 
Our welfare model is one of the reasons for Nor­
way’s good international reputation. Although the 
solutions we have devised cannot be transferred 
directly to other countries where circumstances 
are different, we have valuable experience to share 
in our dialogues with the authorities in developing 

countries. This includes experience of developing 
a welfare policy in times of economic hardship. 

The five main axes of our development policy 
are as follows: 

Our development policy is designed to strengthen 
the position of the poor 

Norwegian development policy is designed to chal­
lenge the unequal distribution of power within and 
between countries. We must support national 
development plans and an international framework 
that will facilitate economic and social develop­
ment in poor countries. 

Norway’s development policy is intended to 
help countries with the process of meeting the 
basic needs of as many people as possible within a 
system that safeguards and promotes individuals’ 
rights. We will mainstream women’s rights and 
equality throughout our development policy 
efforts. It is also vital to ensure economic growth in 
order to maintain the present trend of global pov­
erty reduction. Our focus on steering international 
financial flows in a development-friendly direction 
will help to increase global capacity for funding the 
fight against poverty. Growth makes it possible for 
countries to pursue an active distribution policy, for 
example by providing better social services and a 
safety net for vulnerable groups. 

A rights-based development policy has a strong 
normative effect. Active use of human rights as a 
framework for development cooperation will raise 
awareness among both governments and the gen­
eral population. The result will be stronger local 
ownership and greater sustainability. The imple­
mentation of the human rights conventions is 
therefore an objective in itself, as well as being an 
important tool that should be integrated into all 
development efforts. 

Our development policy is designed to promote 
sustainable development 

Norwegian development policy is designed to pro­
mote sustainable development. Our development 
policy should be part of the solution to the serious 
environmental problems of climate change and 
loss of biological diversity, and not part of the prob­
lem. At the same time, our contributions to global 
environmental policy must also play a role in the 
fight against poverty. This integrated approach to 
environment and development is an important tool 
in efforts to achieve the Millennium Development 
Goals (MDGs), improve the health and living con­
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ditions of the poor, and meet global challenges 
relating to natural resources and the environment. 

Our development policy is designed to safeguard 
global public goods and strengthen global rules 

The framework for development is increasingly 
affected by global conditions. The UN has con­
cluded that we will not be able to achieve the 
MDGs unless we gain control of climate change. 
Nor can we expect to see development in countries 
that are ravaged by conflict or epidemics. Such 
problems may start in individual countries, but 
cannot be resolved without a broad international 
effort. In many areas there is strong interdepend­
ence, and it is clear that we have a common destiny. 
A broader and more holistic approach to develop­
ment policy makes it necessary to identify the links 
between national and global problems, and how 
interests may extend beyond national borders. 
This is of crucial importance not only in order to 
improve the situation of the poor, but also to safe­
guard our own interests, and not least the interests 
of future generations. 

The international norms that safeguard individ­
uals’ rights and provide rules governing relations 
between countries are key global public goods. An 
operational and effective UN that successfully 
mobilises the political will and resources needed to 
solve global challenges is essential if these norms 
are to be really effective. 

Through its development policy, Norway will 
also promote the implementation of international 
agreements in developing countries and seek to 
ensure that their authorities incorporate globally 
agreed policies into national legislation. All UN 
Member States have taken on legal obligations to 
implement one or more international agreements 
on human rights. 

Our development policy and our domestic policies 
should be seen in relation to each other 

Norway’s overall impact on the development 
framework for poor countries is result of our poli­
cies in a number of different areas. Unless we take 
account of the effects of our actions in all policy 
areas – including the decisions that we help to 
make in international organisations and forums – 
we risk undermining our ability to reduce poverty 
through aid and other means. The Norwegian Pol­
icy Coherence Commission’s report, Coherent for 
Development? (NOU 2008:14) highlights a number 
of areas where there is room for a more develop­

ment-friendly balance between national and devel­
opment policy interests. 

Our development policy focuses on areas where 
Norway has particular expertise 

Our efforts will be concentrated to a greater extent 
on areas where Norwegian expertise is in demand 
and provides added value for partner countries. 
The prospects for success are greatest where we 
also have a strong political engagement. The Gov­
ernment has identified the following sectors where 
Norway is considered to have particular expertise 
and where we should focus our efforts: climate 
change, environment, sustainable development, 
peacebuilding, human rights, humanitarian assist­
ance, oil and clean energy, women and gender 
equality, good governance and the fight against 
corruption. 

1.4	 Local ownership and the 
Norwegian agenda – conflicting 
perspectives? 

All countries are responsible for their own develop­
ment. All countries make choices and set priorities 
on the basis of their political system, power struc­
ture, values and available resources. This is true 
for Norway, and it is true for poor countries. We 
should not underestimate the forces, including a 
country’s history and background, that influence 
choices of policy and direction. Nor should we 
underestimate how difficult it is for one country to 
intervene in the processes that guide political 
choices in another country. 

The effects of donor countries’ development 
policies and of international aid depend signifi­
cantly on the efforts of the political leadership, the 
public and private sectors and civil society in recip­
ient countries. These efforts help to determine the 
room for action for Norway’s development efforts. 
And this is how it should be. National ownership of 
both development processes and individual 
projects is essential. Without this, development 
will not be sustainable. National ownership must 
be understood in a broad sense. It does not only 
apply to a country’s government and parliament, 
but also to civil society and the full range of institu­
tions that help to ensure a balanced power struc­
ture. 

Norway attaches importance to implementing 
the objectives of the 2005 Paris Declaration on Aid 
Effectiveness at both international and national 
level. This means that Norway’s development 
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Box 1.2  Lesbian and gay rights in developing countries 

All the countries of the world have committed 
themselves to protecting human rights on a 
non-discriminatory basis. Neither culture, reli­
gion nor tradition can justify violations of human 
rights. Human rights apply to all individuals 
regardless of gender, race, religion or sexual 
identity. We cannot ignore systematic abuse and 
discrimination of sexual minorities. 

Norway will therefore be a fearless cham­
pion of equality. This includes fighting against 
discrimination on grounds of sexual orientation, 
which affects gay, lesbian, bisexual and trans-
gender people. This will require broad, clearly 
targeted measures in sensitive areas. We will 
speak out where others find it easier to remain 
silent. 

Organisations that represent minorities can 
provide useful guidance for the kinds of measu­
res that are best suited to local conditions. 

Norway’s credibility as a champion of 
human rights depends on us being consistent in 
our efforts to fight discrimination and promote 
minority rights. Figure 1.3  In 2006, South Africa’s Parliament 

passed the Civil Union Act, entitling same-sex 
couples to marry on an equal basis with hetero-
sexuals. 
Photo: Dennis Farrell/Scanpix 

cooperation work will be guided by the principles 
of national ownership, alignment with recipient 
countries’ systems, harmonisation among donors, 
results-based management and mutual accounta­
bility. In order to enable recipient countries to take 
responsibility themselves, the conditions and 
mechanisms involved must allow a long-term 
approach and the elbow room needed to be able to 
make independent decisions. Increased use of 
budget support on the basis of national develop­
ment plans together with better financial manage­
ment make it possible to achieve a clearer division 
of roles. 

Human rights are under pressure in both rich 
and poor countries. In 2008, the US think tank 
Freedom House reported the first signs since 1994 
that democratic values are on the wane. Authoritar­
ian forms of government are winning ground. 
Amnesty International has documented serious 
human rights violations in the majority of the coun­
tries in the world. Sadly, there is a wide gap 
between the obligations undertaken by the major­

ity of countries and the realities on the ground in 
many of them. 

The disparity between our commitment to uni­
versal rights and the varying importance other 
countries attach to these rights is apparent in many 
development policy areas. The white paper On 
equal terms: Women’s rights and gender equality in 
development policy states clearly that Norway will 
speak out boldly and clearly, even on the most sen­
sitive issues. However, it also points out that we 
must accept the fact that promoting gender equal­
ity is a long process that frequently challenges 
powerful cultural and religious forces. Our rights-
based approach must always be based on sound 
knowledge of the global situation and access to 
expertise on the particular situation in each part­
ner country. We must identify and support relevant 
agents of change and tailor our approach and 
efforts to local conditions. 

Despite the dilemmas that can arise, our 
approach towards countries where there are 
human rights challenges is to seek access and dia­
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logue. We will use the opportunities our develop­
ment policy provides for promoting human rights. 
Our strategy in this difficult terrain must be to 
defend and promote principles that are universal. 
We will use all the channels offered by the open 
and interdependent world community to exert an 
influence. 

1.5	 Administrative and financial 
consequences 

The close links between foreign policy and devel­
opment policy are already taken into account in the 
Government’s organisation of work in these areas. 
In 2004, the administrative responsibility for 
embassies with development responsibility was 
transferred from Norad (Norwegian Agency for 
Development Cooperation) to the Ministry of For­
eign Affairs. At the same time, responsibility for 
policy-making, strategy formulation and informa­
tion activities, as well as country-specific and 
regional expertise, was integrated into the Minis­
try. More funding and more authority were dele­
gated to the embassies. Norad was designated as 
the centre of technical expertise for the whole Nor­
wegian development apparatus, with responsibility 
for providing advice, for quality assurance, and for 
channelling long-term aid through NGOs. This 
reorganisation has made it easier to ensure coher­
ence between long-term development cooperation, 
humanitarian assistance and bilateral and multilat­
eral aid. Overall, making the Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs responsible for the administration of all 
development policy tools has led to closer integra­
tion and coordination between foreign and devel­
opment policy. At a practical level, significant effort 
has gone into improving the administration of 

grants. New guidelines have been drawn up, and a 
central support function has been established with 
overall responsibility for ensuring uniform practice 
in the Ministry. 

Many of the measures put forward in this white 
paper involve a change of policy that will have few 
budgetary consequences. Other measures are 
based on priorities set out in budget proposals in 
recent years, such as increasing support for coun­
tries in conflict. A closer focus on fragile states will 
mean that additional support is channelled to these 
countries. The Government’s efforts to address 
international financial flows will primarily be of a 
strategic, political nature and will not require high 
levels of funding. Provision has already been made 
in the budget for climate-related measures, prima­
rily under item 166.73 (climate change and defor­
estation). Right from the start, the intention has 
been to provide fresh funding for these activities. 
The Government attaches great importance to 
women’s rights and gender equality. A separate 
budget item, 168.70 (women and gender equality), 
was established in 2007. 

This white paper proposes more strategic use 
of the different aid channels, so that bilateral aid is 
linked more closely to areas where Norway has 
expertise that is in demand, while funding for sec­
tors such as health and education will primarily be 
via multilateral channels. Programme category 
0310 (bilateral assistance) for 2008 contains an 
item for each region, but not for individual coun­
tries, with the exception of Afghanistan. The meas­
ures proposed in this white paper will be imple­
mented within existing budgetary frameworks. 
This means that the objectives, actions and priori­
ties set out in this white paper will be followed up 
through the ordinary budget proposals in line with 
normal practice. 
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2 National responsibilities
 

Each country is responsible for its own develop­
ment. Although much of the framework for devel­
opment is determined by international factors, at 
the end of the day it is the nation state that is 
responsible for ensuring that development moves 
in the right direction and that the population’s 
rights are respected. The basis for development in 
any country is created through interaction 
between the state, civil society and the private sec­
tor. 

States are expected to provide security and a 
suitable framework for economic activity, and to 
respect the freedom and human rights of their citi­
zens. In return, citizens have a duty to pay tax, 
respect the state’s monopoly on the legitimate use 
of power, and comply with statutory restrictions on 
personal freedom. Functioning states are crucial if 
we are to meet global challenges that require 
broad international cooperation and engagement. 

In recent years, Norwegian development policy 
has focused increasingly on fragile states – coun­
tries affected by crisis and war. State-building in 
these countries involves particularly difficult chal­
lenges, not only in relation to the state apparatus, 
but also in relation to civil society and the private 
sector. 

2.1 A well-functioning state 

A state must have a minimum of administrative 
capacity to be able to perform its functions. Its pre­
cise functions and objectives must be formulated at 
a legitimate level of government. Then there is a 
need for a reasonably well-functioning bureauc­
racy to implement political decisions and provide 
public services, a security system that ensures 
security for the general public, and a public finance 

Box 2.1  More than one million women elected representatives in India 

Today, 42 per cent of local village councils in 
India (panchayats) are made up of women. This 
means that there are more than one million 
publicly elected women representatives in India 
– more than in all other countries combined. 

Rules on the reservation of seats on the pan­
chayats for particular groups were introduced in 
the 1993 amendment to the Constitution. They 
require one third of the seats to be reserved for 
women, and seats are also to be reserved for 
«Scheduled Castes» and «Scheduled Tribes». 
Around half the elected women representatives 
in India are illiterate. 

Experience has shown that women repre­
sentatives give higher priority to the develop­
ment of social services, such as primary 
schools, health care, water, and a social security 
net for the poor, than their male colleagues. Stu­
dies also show that women help to ensure more 
effective use of local resources and reduce cor­
ruption. 

Norway supports training and network-build­
ing programmes for women elected to panchayats 

through a cooperation project between the 
Indian NGO Aagaz Foundation and the Norwe­
gian Association of Local and Regional Authori­
ties. The project has a strong focus on mutual 
learning – what can these two countries learn 
from one another? 

Figure 2.1  The Norwegian Association of Local 
and Regional Authorities supports training pro-
grammes for women representatives in India. 
Photo: Norwegian Association of Local and Regional Autho­
rities 
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system that is able to generate revenues and col­
lect taxes. Sound development plans with budgets, 
preferably based on poverty reduction strategies, 
provide a good starting point for national owner­
ship of development and make recipient countries 
better equipped for dialogue with external donors. 

However, state-building is not just a techno­
cratic process of building or strengthening govern­
ment institutions. Without the ownership of soci­
ety as a whole, institutions can end up as empty 
shells or being used to promote individual inter­
ests. 

Elections and other processes that allow for 
popular participation in decision-making are a nec­
essary element of the social contract and give the 
state legitimacy. Important decisions must be 
made by popularly elected bodies. Both ruling and 
opposition parties are vital for a vibrant democracy. 

A democratic culture must have strong roots at 
local level. Decentralisation and autonomous local 

government often contribute to a more effective 
use of resources and can form the starting point for 
popular participation in local and national politics. 

Support for democratic governance will not 
produce results until people experience concrete 
improvements. Competence-building is often nec­
essary to improve the ability of publicly elected 
representatives to meet their democratic obliga­
tions to voters. 

Norway’s engagement in democratic develop­
ment is wide-ranging. Both through direct govern­
ment-to-government cooperation and through the 
United Nations Development Programme 
(UNDP), we are working with national authorities 
on democratic reform, the holding of elections and 
training of elected representatives. Norway is well 
positioned to provide election observers, who can 
help to ensure fair and effective election processes. 
Our largest and most important contribution is 
support for various interest groups in civil society 

Box 2.2  Democratic governance and the UN Development Programme 

The United Nations Development Programme 
(UNDP) is the UN’s global development 
network. It spends the equivalent of more than 
NOK 10 billion a year – almost half its budget – 
on promoting democratic governance. 

On average, UNDP provides support in con­
nection with elections somewhere in the world 
every other week, throughout the year. For sta­
tes that have recently emerged from war, the 
first election is a critical step in the transition 
from war to peace. In 2005, UNDP helped Libe­
ria hold the election that brought Ellen Johnson-
Sirleaf to power as Africa’s first elected woman 
president. UNDP has established cooperation 
with parliaments in one in three developing 
countries, which includes support for training 
newly elected members of parliament. In 
Rwanda, UNDP has worked together with the 
United Nations Development Fund for Women 
(UNIFEM) to increase women’s opportunities 
to take part in political life. This undertaking 
has been successful: since the parliamentary 
election in 2008, more than 55 per cent of the 
representatives are women. 

A great deal of UNDP’s work on democratic 
governance is in conflict areas during the early 
stages of reconstruction. In Darfur, a legal aid 
network has been established, and the lawyers 
involved have dealt with more than 2000 cases. 
They have been able to bring about the release 

of people who have been arbitrarily arrested 
and the conviction of criminals. More than 80 
cases of rape have been dealt with by the judici­
ary, and those convicted have been sentenced to 
up to 10 years’ imprisonment. These efforts 
show that it is possible for long-term democratic 
development to create a legal culture, and pro­
mote respect for human rights. Moreover, 
establishing and strengthening democratic insti­
tutions will also help to prevent a return to con­
flict. 

In 2007, UNDP came out on top in a study 
undertaken by the Overseas Development Insti­
tute in the UK on recipient countries’ percep­
tions of aid effectiveness and performance. 

Norway is one of UNDP’s most important 
partners, and in 2007 was the largest donor to 
the UNDP core budget, with a contribution of 
NOK 770 million. Norway’s high level of fun­
ding is supporting long-term efforts on good 
governance. In addition, Norway provides sub­
stantial funding for individual funds and pro­
grammes and efforts in connection with huma­
nitarian crises and natural disasters. 

The Oslo Governance Centre was establis­
hed in 2002. It takes an innovative approach to 
challenges relating to governance and the links 
between democratic governance and poverty 
reduction. 
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as a means of mobilising the general public. This 
work generally involves direct collaboration with 
Norwegian and international NGOs and interest 
groups. 

Taxation is important for strengthening the 
contract between the individual and the state, 
which in turn can encourage the state to pay 
greater attention to the welfare of the population. 
People are likely to be more alert and quicker to 
demand good governance and sound financial 
management if revenues are generated from the 
population as a whole and local businesses. Devel­
opment actors must be fully aware of this link, so 
that aid is used to foster a government’s responsi­
bility for its own people, rather than creating a sit­
uation where governments are primarily accounta­
ble to donors. 

Education and health 

Education is a key factor for all other development, 
such as preventing war and reducing conflict, cre­
ating economic growth and adapting to climate 
change. Education is crucial for the continued 
efforts on health, rights, gender equality, democ­
racy, and – of course – for recruitment to higher 
education and research. Access to education is a 
human right. It is the nation state’s responsibility 
to ensure that the whole population, including the 
most vulnerable groups, have access to education. 

The UN’s Education for All conference in 2000 
culminated in a commitment to the goal of all chil­
dren having access to primary education by 2015. 
We are now halfway to this deadline. Good results 
have been achieved. The increase in the number of 
children starting school is particularly encouraging. 
However, much remains to be done. There are still 
75 million children of primary school age who are 
not in school. Girls are significantly over-repre­
sented in this group. Helping these children is a key 
task. Another key task is to ensure that teaching is of 
a high enough standard, so that pupils leave school 
with a satisfactory level of knowledge and skills. 

Access to education is poorest for children who 
are refugees or internally displaced or who live in 
countries in conflict. Most of the world’s out-of­
school children live in such areas. The Govern­
ment therefore intends to focus particularly on 
support for education in fragile states and coun­
tries affected by conflict. A large proportion of our 
funding to multi-donor funds in Afghanistan and 
the Palestinian Territory is for education. Support 
for education during humanitarian crises also 
helps to protect children and prevent them from 
becoming child soldiers or victims of prostitution. 

Figure 2.2  Millennium Development Goal no. 2 is 
to achieve universal primary education by 2015. 
In Mozambique, the proportion of children in 
school has increased from 43 per cent in 1999 to 
87 per cent in 2007. 
Photo: Ken Opprann 

For many years, a substantial proportion of 
Norway’s aid has been earmarked for primary edu­
cation. With a view to achieving the best possible 
coordination of international aid, the Government 
wishes to focus more on multilateral channels in its 
efforts to promote education. This will also reduce 
the number of donors recipient countries have to 
relate to. 

In countries that, as a result of long-term assist­
ance, are in a better position to give priority to the 
education sector, Norway’s policy is to integrate 
funding for education into general budget support. 
This has been done for example in Tanzania and 
Zambia. 

Norway is already the largest donor to 
UNICEF’s basic education and gender equality 
programme. We are also a significant contributor 
to the World Bank’s Education for All Fast Track 
Initiative and to the United Nations Girls’ Educa­
tion Initiative (UNGEI), which is coordinated by 
UNICEF. This network, which aims to improve 
access to and quality of education for girls, is cur­
rently operative in some 30 countries. By taking an 
active part in the governing bodies for such initia­
tives, we can promote Norwegian views in areas to 
which we give priority without creating any addi­
tional administrative burden on recipient coun­
tries. 

In addition, the Government is actively promot­
ing primary education in a range of international 
forums. For example, Norway hosted the meeting 
of the High-Level Group on Education for All in 
December 2008. 
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Ensuring that the whole population has access 
to health services is also a national responsibility. 
The public authorities must, through their own pol­
icies, take the main responsibility for financing and 
regulating health services. They must facilitate 
broad cooperation that mobilises forces in local 
communities and allows different actors to offer 
services within a common binding framework. 
Funding for health services needs to be long-term 
and predictable, whether it comes from aid or from 
national resources, and must cover necessary 
investments and operating expenses for infrastruc­
ture, technology, medicines and personnel. 

Everyone is entitled to the highest attainable 
standard of health. Good health is also one of the 
most important conditions for enjoying a meaning­
ful and active life. Improving health helps to reduce 
poverty, for example by improving children’s abil­
ity to learn, increasing capacity for work and reduc­
ing sickness-related costs. However, better health 
cannot be achieved by building up the health sec­
tor alone; it is also necessary to ensure access to 
clean water, healthy food, an unpolluted environ­
ment, gender equality and, not least, education. 

Norway played a prominent role in the estab­
lishment of the International Health Partnership 
(IHP), which is intended to help organisations tak­
ing part in the Global Campaign for the Health Mil­
lennium Development Goals to work more effec­
tively together. The signing of the IHP Global Com­
pact in September 2007 was an important step 
towards better coordination. This agreement sets 
out requirements for both donors and recipients of 
aid. Recipient governments agree to work together 
with international partners to determine how the 
IHP best can be implemented at country level. The 
first group of recipient countries to take part in this 
initiative are Ethiopia, Kenya, Zambia, Mozam­
bique, Burundi, Nepal, Cambodia and Mali. 

Without a dramatic change in pace, the MDG 
on reducing child mortality will not be reached 
until 2045. Malnutrition is an important factor. But 
there are also positive trends. The number of 
deaths from measles in sub-Saharan Africa was 
reduced by 75 per cent between 1999 and 2005, 
showing that the extensive vaccination initiative 
spearheaded by Norway is being successful. 
Today, child mortality is at the lowest level since 
records began, but it is still far too high. 

The MDG on reduced maternal mortality will 
not be achieved; indeed, the mortality rate for 
pregnant women will probably increase in certain 
areas. The high level of maternal mortality is 
mainly due to complications such as haemor­
rhages and infections, often as a result of unsafe 

Box 2.3  Education in fragile states 

Children in fragile states have far poorer 
access to education than children in other 
developing countries. In line with the priority 
that Norway is now giving to fragile states, 
the Government has significantly stepped up 
support for targeted efforts to enable children 
in these countries to realise their right to pri­
mary education. Our main partners in this 
area are UNICEF and various NGOs, particu­
larly Save the Children Norway and the Nor­
wegian Refugee Council. These efforts 
include rebuilding schools and the education 
sector as a whole after natural disasters, and 
providing education services in fragile and 
conflict-ridden states. Education is also a tool 
in peace, reconciliation and reconstruction 
efforts. 

UNICEF is a key actor in countries such 
as Sudan, Nepal, the Democratic Republic of 
Congo, Liberia and Sierra Leone. There were 
only 300 000 children in school in Southern 
Sudan in 2005, when the peace treaty was sig­
ned. Now, largely thanks to UNICEF’s «Go to 
School» initiative, more than one million 
Southern Sudanese children are attending 
school. 

Save the Children’s global campaign 
Rewrite the Future aims to get three million 
children into school by 2010. It is also seeking 
to improve the quality of education for 
another five million children who are already 
attending school in conflict-affected areas. 
The programme aims to provide schooling as 
a means of protecting children. Norway is the 
largest donor to Save the Children’s and UNI­
CEF’s educational efforts. 

abortions. Today, less than 60 per cent of women in 
developing countries, and less than 35 per cent in 
the least developed countries, have access to 
skilled health personnel during labour. 

In 2007, the UN added a new target under the 
MDG on maternal health: to achieve universal 
access to reproductive health. This provides a 
stronger focus on gender equality and links the 
MDGs more closely to the platform for action from 
the World Conference on Women in Beijing, for 
example by highlighting health services for young 
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Box 2.4  Global Campaign for the Health 
MDGs 

Heads of state and government from a num­
ber of countries have joined forces to accele­
rate progress in reaching the health-related 
Millennium Development Goals (MDGs) 
through a global campaign. The Norwegian 
Government has spearheaded efforts to per­
suade leaders in both rich and poor countries 
to join the Network of Global Leaders and 
give priority to reducing infant and maternal 
mortality. 

This has also led to new focus on invest­
ments in health systems combining various 
tools to achieve the three health MDGs. Nati­
onal authorities, aid organisations and civil 
society must have a common agenda if we are 
to achieve real improvements in the health of 
women, babies and young children. Some 250 
organisations have joined forces in a global 
partnership to promote broad grassroots 
engagement in reducing child and maternal 
mortality 

people and family planning. These are also impor­
tant in preventing HIV infection. 

Non-communicable and lifestyle-related dis­
eases such as cardiovascular diseases, cancer, 
chronic respiratory diseases and diabetes have 
become one of the most serious health challenges 
in both developing and developed countries. The 
incidence of such diseases is expected to increase 
most rapidly in Africa and the Middle East. 
Unhealthy eating habits and lack of exercise are 
causing an increase in obesity in developing coun­
tries, where malnutrition is also a problem. 
Tobacco kills up to half the people who use it. Mis­
use of alcohol is estimated to cause some 2.3 mil­
lion deaths a year worldwide, and has serious con­
sequences for health and development, including 
vulnerability to HIV infection. These figures are 
additional to the large numbers of people affected 
by communicable diseases, and entail a huge bur­
den on health services. 

In order to deal with these health challenges, 
health services need to include a first-line service 
for both prevention and treatment, close to users, 
that is part of an effective continuum of care. In 
addition, hospital-based services need to be 
strengthened to be able to deal with complicated 
deliveries and incomplete miscarriages. 

A shortage of skilled and motivated health per­
sonnel is a major problem in very many developing 
countries, particularly in rural areas. Both national 
authorities and donors must give higher priority to 
personnel issues, and focus on factors such as edu­
cation, recruitment, distribution, pay and working 
conditions, incentives and support. 

There is now sound scientific evidence that a 
health service based on good primary health care 
is generally best and cheapest. However, influen­
tial groups with prestige and economic interests 
vested in the development of medical technology 
are channelling resources towards more and more 
specialised and fragmented health services. Nor­
way will continue to emphasise the importance of 
well-functioning primary health services in its dia­
logues with recipient countries. 

Financial management and anti-corruption efforts 

Corruption and abuse of power prevent effective 
use of national resources and hamper economic 
growth. Widespread corruption is a symptom of 
poor governance as well as an obstacle to demo­
cratic development. Corruption is often defined as 
the abuse of a position of public power to gain per­
sonal advantage. It refers to any transaction 
between public and private actors involving the ille­
gal conversion of public goods into private bene­
fits; it may also involve the private sector and civil 
society. 

Corruption undermines formal processes and 
political systems. Corruption during elections and 
in legislative assemblies makes elected bodies less 
accountable and representative. Corruption in 
courts makes it possible to sidestep the law, under­
mines respect for the law and for the courts, and 
makes it more difficult for people to uphold their 
rights. Corruption in the public administration 
reduces transparency, makes it difficult to get 
things done, and results in very inequitable distri­
bution of goods and services. 

Sound financial management is crucial for 
ensuring that state revenues are used effectively 
and is a vital tool for preventing corruption. This 
applies both to a country’s own revenues and to 
aid. New electronic systems for financial manage­
ment make false accounting more difficult. Actual 
spending can easily be compared to the figures in 
the budget. 

Transparency in financial management pro­
motes democracy. Discussion of the government 
budget by parliament strengthens the role of 
elected representatives and makes them more 
accountable to the population. However, a number 
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of other key functions must be in place to ensure 
accountability and confidence in the public admin­
istration. Independent auditing, as carried out by 
national auditor-generals, makes it possible to 
identify systematic weaknesses and dishonest pub­
lic officials. The capacity to investigate economic 
crime and an independent legal system are also 
needed to develop general awareness of the fact 
that corruption is a crime. 

Norway is working to prevent, disclose and 
prosecute cases of corruption. The fight against 
corruption is integrated into good governance 
efforts at local, national and global level. Particular 
priority is given to providing support for public 
institution-building and financial management, 
including support for national audit offices, anti­
corruption offices and other institutions that exer­
cise public control functions. Countries must be 
willing to establish transparent and robust financial 
management systems if we are to enter into coop­
eration with them on budget support. 

Norway is at the forefront of efforts to intensify 
the anti-corruption work of multilateral organisa­
tions. UNDP has taken on a more active role in 
assisting partner countries with public sector 
reform and anti-corruption efforts. Norway has 
been a mainstay in the development of the World 
Bank’s governance and anti-corruption strategy. 
We are also helping to strengthen the development 
banks’ capacity through the secondment of anti­
corruption personnel. 

Norway supports an international network of 
corruption fighters that brings together investiga­
tors and public prosecutors from developing coun­
tries and their counterparts from Western coun­
tries to discuss anti-corruption strategies and 
cross-border investigation of corruption cases. 

Figure 2.3  Strong, independent media play an 
important role in the fight against corruption. 
Photo: Ken Opprann 

The network also provides protection for members 
whose personal security is at risk. 

Greater transparency and easier access to 
information about our own aid expenditure are 
important instruments in fighting corruption and 
making aid more effective. Norway therefore sup­
ports the recently established International Aid 
Transparency Initiative. It is important that all aid 
received is reflected in the budget of the country 
concerned. 

Making use of Norway’s experience 

Many developing countries have become inter­
ested in the Norwegian and Nordic social model: a 
mixed economy, a well-developed welfare system, 
firmly established routines for liaison between the 
social partners, and emphasis on gender equality. 

Strong economic growth in itself is no guaran­
tee for positive social development and poverty 
reduction. Growth can be concentrated in individ­
ual industries or areas, and the poor may well be 
excluded. Capital-intensive sectors, such as the 
petroleum and mining industries, can produce 
huge profits for owners and investors, without any 
spin-off benefits to the general population or the 
state. In such cases, the challenge is to find good 
political tools for sharing wealth more equitably 
without reducing the rate of growth. Well-
developed health and education services are 
crucial, but other social policy tools can also be 
very important. 

There is a common perception that poor coun­
tries cannot afford to establish universal welfare 
systems. On the other hand, there is a growing 
conviction that social and welfare policy is a vital 
tool for both economic and social development in 
all countries, and that investments in these sectors 
should not be postponed until a certain level of eco­
nomic development has been reached. Some peo­
ple may experience a temporary loss of income 
after a natural disaster or because of economic fluc­
tuations, as we have seen with the international 
rise in food prices and the financial crisis. In such 
situations, welfare schemes can prevent men and 
women who lose their jobs from being forced into 
poverty that undermines their ability to take part in 
value creation in future. Such schemes can help to 
stimulate local markets and can also provide social 
benefits by reducing hunger and improving health. 
There is also a close connection between parents’ 
incomes and child labour, and in a crisis, children 
will often be taken out of school to contribute to the 
household economy if no welfare provision is avail­
able. Access to food and cash transfers for disad­
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vantaged groups is a question of rights, and the 
state has a direct responsibility to ensure that 
these are met. Pension schemes provide security 
against extreme poverty in old age and help to give 
the elderly higher status in the family and in soci­
ety as a whole. 

Norway started to provide various social secu­
rity benefits at an early stage of its economic devel­
opment, and found that this gave positive results. A 
number of developing countries have had similar 
experiences, and there is increasing interest in this 
area of international development. 

Measures targeted at the more developed part 
of the economy will, over time, also help to improve 
the prospects for development for the poor. 
Growth of the middle class leads to increased 
expertise and productivity, greater demand for 
goods and services and the development of local 
markets. The middle class is an important mouth­
piece for change in various areas, speaking out for 
a free press, respect for human rights, better con­
ditions for the private sector and access to informa­
tion about the public administration, and condemn­
ing corruption. The middle class is often a strong 
advocate for better infrastructure and public serv­
ices, such as health and education. 

Norway has valuable experience of developing 
primary industries in a thinly populated country, 
using cooperatives and strong agricultural organi­
sations as the backbone of the system. We have 
developed a good model of tripartite cooperation 
between employers, the trade union movement 
and the state. We have also made significant 
progress in promoting equality in general – in addi­
tion to gender equality – by ensuring statutory 
rights for various groups who had previously been 
subject to systematic discrimination. 

Where there is interest, Norway will continue 
to share its experience with countries that wish to 
focus on equitable distribution of welfare services 
and equality in their development. This is particu­
larly relevant in cases where we provide general 
budget support in the form of government-to-gov­
ernment aid, as this provides an opportunity for a 
broader dialogue on the development of society as 
a whole and not just particular sectors. 

The Government will: 

•	 ensure that aid provided for capacity develop­
ment is designed to enhance recipient coun­
tries’ ownership of the development process 

•	 continue to provide support for direct coopera­
tion between Norwegian political parties and 
their sister parties in developing countries 

•	 give priority to measures designed to secure 
the right to education in fragile states 

•	 put more focus on the right to services and on 
initiatives that are particularly important for 
children, young people, women and vulnerable 
groups, including sexual and reproductive 
health services and initiatives to prevent the 
spread of HIV infection 

•	 strengthen national health systems with an 
emphasis on capacity building 

•	 channel more of Norway’s aid funding to the 
health and education sectors through multilat­
eral organisations such as the UN, the World 
Bank and the global health funds 

•	 direct more attention to the criteria for success 
in the support we provide for anti-corruption 
institutions and strategy development 

•	 give particular priority to anti-corruption 
efforts in countries where we provide support 
for the petroleum and mining sector, and in 
countries that are carrying out post-conflict 
reconstruction activities 

•	 strengthen the anti-corruption efforts of the 
multilateral organisations 

•	 help to develop greater transparency in recipi­
ent countries with regard to international aid 
flows and how they are used, for example by 
seeking to ensure that funding provided to the 
public sector is reflected in the government 
budget 

•	 share Norwegian experience of social plan­
ning, including the development of welfare 
services, tripartite cooperation between 
employees, trade unions and the state, our 
organisation of primary industries in coopera­
tives and agricultural organisations, and our 
efforts to promote equality. 

2.2 Strong civil society 

A diverse and dynamic civil society is an important 
supplement to elected bodies and is a vital factor 
for democratic development. But a well-function­
ing civil society cannot be developed without a 
broad range of actors with the capacity to become 
involved in social development, such as academia, 
the media, the private sector, political parties, the 
cultural sector, religious communities, traditional 
institutions and voluntary organisations. 

Civil society gives people the right and opportu­
nity to influence social development, improve their 
own living conditions, and provide support for the 
poor and underprivileged so that their voices can 
be heard and their interests brought into focus. 
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Figure 2.4  Lusaka Playhouse, Zambia. 
The difficult questions about relationships and identity raised 
in Ibsen’s play A Doll’s House are still relevant today. The voices 
of the main characters, Nora and Helmer, continue to be heard 
in the public debate all over the world. Cultural development 
can be both an end and a means in a country’s development 
process. 
Photo: Rodney Lobo 

Civil society is an arena where individuals come 
together on a voluntary basis on behalf of them­
selves or others, working either directly or 
through voluntary or other organisations. 

Free and independent media are an essential 
part of a viable democracy. A critical press can 
bring abuse of power and corruption to light. It 
may provide the only protection against abuse for 
opposition and other groups. The objective of Nor­
wegian support for free and independent media is 
to support efforts to strengthen transparency and 
democracy and improve governance. We provide 
both legal and technical assistance to strengthen 
the position of the media, promote media diversity 
and availability, and help to ensure that the media 
have access to information in connection with deci­
sion-making processes. 

Cultural institutions and organisations play a 
vital role in fostering a vibrant civil society with 
open arenas for broad debate. Artists, performers 
and intellectuals play an important role in forming 
public opinion, and are able to reach a broad sec­
tion of the population through various forms of cul­
tural expression and other activities. This means 
that these groups are important agents of change 
in development processes. 

Civil society organisations can provide an 
important supplement to public services, particu­
larly in the health and education sectors, where 
public services are – for various reasons – often 
inadequate. Their activities can show a way for­
ward in countries where the standard of public 
services has fallen below an acceptable minimum. 
As independent actors they have an arena to test 

Box 2.5  Access to information makes it 
possible to exert an influence 

The World Alliance for Citizen Participation 
(CIVICUS) is a network of more than 450 
organisations in developing countries that has 
been carrying out assessments of civil society 
– its structures, environment and values – 
since 2004. Assessments have now been car­
ried out in more than 50 countries and have 
gained broad recognition from national autho­
rities, international donors and academic 
communities. 

CIVICUS is helping to foster a common 
understanding among national civil society 
actors of their strengths and weaknesses. 
Through its broad and inclusive work pro­
cess, it has also boosted confidence in civil 
society among the general public, the media, 
the private sector and among donors. In some 
cases this has given national authorities a 
more positive view of the role these organisa­
tions can play. 

Norway has supported the efforts to 
develop an index that measures the status of 
civil society in various countries. This index 
has proved valuable for UNDP in its efforts to 
promote national, democratic ownership of 
performance in this area. The index can also 
be used to strengthen the dialogue on gover­
nance in countries where there has traditio­
nally been little collaboration between natio­
nal authorities and civil society actors. 

new ideas and models that can later be tried out on 
a larger scale and, if appropriate, integrated into 
the public system. 

In recent years, there has been a tendency in 
several countries to tighten legislation governing 
civil society organisations and their activities. Nor­
way will make it clear that it is the state’s responsi­
bility to facilitate diversity and growth in civil soci­
ety by providing good legal, economic and political 
framework conditions for voluntary engagement, 
including freedom of expression and the right to 
organise. 

The Government will: 

•	 help to foster a dynamic and diverse civil soci­
ety in developing countries that promotes the 
interests of the general public and gives a voice 
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to their views, through support for local, inter­
national and Norwegian organisations 

•	 highlight the importance of the state providing 
a good framework for civil society organisa­
tions’ activities 

•	 seek to safeguard the right of the free media to 
fulfil their role as watchdogs of democracy. 

2.3 A viable private sector 

A dynamic private sector is crucial for economic 
growth and development. The private sector is best 
developed on the basis of cooperation with the 
state. The state must take responsibility for provid­
ing framework conditions that facilitate well-func­
tioning markets, including energy, transport and 
telecommunications infrastructure, and financing 
opportunities. Political and economic stability is 
vital for stimulating investment. 

Sound management of renewable resources 

Around 75 per cent of the world’s poor live in rural 
areas and depend to a large extent on fisheries and 
agriculture for their livelihoods. The high food 
prices on the world market since 2007 led to 
renewed hope of an upturn in the agricultural sec­
tor, including in poor countries. However very little 
benefit from the rise in prices has trickled down to 
small-scale farmers, especially in Africa. This is 
partly because the national authorities in these 
countries have given priority to subsidies and 
import restrictions to keep prices down for their 
growing urban populations. Other reasons are 
inadequate infrastructure and market access and 
low levels of technology and expertise. 

Many African countries have significant poten­
tial in agriculture, forestry, fish farming and other 
economic activities based on natural resources in 
rural areas. The management of water resources is 
an important factor in this connection. 

Access to agricultural inputs for small-scale 
farmers is another critical factor for increasing pro­
ductivity. Norway’s experience of cooperation with 
Tanzania and Malawi has shown that strategic col­
laboration between the public and private sector 
can improve farmers’ access to seed and mineral 
fertiliser and thus improve food security. The Gov­
ernment has therefore entered into a strategic 
partnership with Yara International ASA to ensure 
deliveries of mineral fertiliser to East Africa. This 
will include various activities in Malawi, Mozam­
bique and Tanzania with the common goal of 
reducing poverty and improving food security. 

Women account for 50 per cent of Africa’s agri­
cultural production, and 70 per cent of food produc­
tion. However, in most African countries, women 
do not have full rights to own or inherit land. 
Strengthening women’s land rights will not only 
enhance gender equality but also promote eco­
nomic growth by stimulating activity and invest­
ment in agriculture. 

Climate change is altering the conditions for 
food production in a number of countries. Previ­
ously arable land is becoming drier, traditional 
seed varieties can no longer be cultivated because 
they are no longer suitable for the climate, and fish 
and other marine resources are coming under 
pressure as a result of changes in sea temperature, 
acidification and damage to coral reefs. 

It is important to adapt agriculture to changes 
in the climate and ensure that agricultural produc­
tion does not have adverse impacts on the climate, 
for example by increasing deforestation or by 
using non-climate-friendly technologies. 

The development of the fishing and fish-farm­
ing sector is providing opportunities for private 
sector development and economic growth in many 
developing countries. Fish is a valuable renewable 
resource that is a source of nutrition, food security, 
income and employment. Some 70 per cent of all 
fishing and 90 per cent of all fish farming takes 
place in developing countries, including China. 
Exports of fish and fish products provide these 
countries with important export revenues, greater 
in fact than the total net export revenues from cof-

Box 2.6  Fishing regulations in Vietnam 

Norway provided support for the develop­
ment of a new fisheries act in Vietnam, which 
came into force in 2003. Cooperation is being 
continued on the development of regulations, 
capacity-building, and awareness-raising acti­
vities. An innovative tool in the development 
of rules and regulations is the pilot model 
approach. Regulations are tested in a specific 
geographical area, and then finalised on the 
basis of practical experience. Regulations for 
the allocation and leasing of fish-farming faci­
lities, registration and inspection of fishing 
vessels, harbour management, local manage­
ment of shrimp farming and the application of 
the fisheries act to the production of shrimp 
larvae are currently being tested. A review 
concluded that the pilot model approach pro­
duces satisfactory results. 
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fee, bananas, rice and tea. Norway has important 
expertise in the fisheries sector that is in demand. 

Norway’s development policy is to foster inter­
est in partner countries in sustainable natural 
resource management. This can be achieved, for 
example, through steps to strengthen legislation 
and its enforcement, and by making clean energy 
solutions more attractive than conventional, pollut­
ing alternatives. We want to provide expertise and 
funding for countries that have the political will to 
give priority to sustainability in their development 
process. 

Responsible management of non-renewable 
resources 

It is a paradox that a significant proportion of the 
world’s poor live in countries that are rich in 
resources, such as oil, gas, copper, diamonds and 
gold. One-fifth of the world’s oil and gas exports 
are from Africa and as much as 40 per cent of the 
population in sub-Saharan Africa live in countries 
that the International Monetary Fund (IMF) con­
siders to be rich in resources. Increased demand 
for petroleum products and other minerals in 
recent years has led to a significant increase in 
prices, and the interest in exploiting these 
resources has grown. Many developing countries 
have attracted major foreign investments in this 
area, and have had a considerable increase in gov­
ernment revenues, for example from taxes, owner­
ship interests and the sale of licences. It is too soon 

Figure 2.5  Many poor countries are rich in resour-
ces. The challenge is to ensure that these assets 
benefit the whole population. 
Photo: Fredrik Naumann/Felix Features 

to judge what the consequences of the dramatic fall 
in oil and other commodity prices in the autumn of 
2008 will be. 

Income from the extraction of oil and other 
mineral resources can lead to significant poverty 
reduction in many developing countries. But this 
requires high standards of management. Experi­
ence has shown that countries that are rich in nat­
ural resources often have lower economic growth 
than others. In general, their economies are sub­
ject to stronger cyclical fluctuations than is the 
case in other countries. One of the reasons for this 
is major fluctuations in commodity prices; in the 
autumn of 2008, for example, oil prices fell from 
USD 150 to USD 50 during the course of one 
month. 

One of the most serious problems is the ten­
dency for resource-rich countries to be more vul­
nerable to corruption and misuse of funds. For 
example, government officials may establish ficti­
tious enterprises for the purpose of siphoning off 
revenues from the exploitation of natural 
resources for their own gain. Large revenues com­
bined with weak institutions and legislation have, 
in certain developing countries, held back democ­
ratisation and in the worst cases led to civil war. 
This is why the term «resource curse» has been 
coined to describe the situation that many poor 
countries with major natural resources have ended 
up in. 

Forty years of petroleum production have 
given Norway valuable experience of managing oil 
resources in a way that promotes sustainable eco­
nomic growth and the welfare of the population as 
a whole. This is experience that Norway can share 
with others. Many developing countries are inter­
ested in our expertise and experience with a view 
to developing a comprehensive framework that will 
enable them to avoid the resource curse. The pur­
pose of the Oil for Development initiative, which 
was launched in the autumn of 2005, is to promote 
lasting poverty reduction and sustainable eco­
nomic and social development. It takes a broad 
approach, including competence-building and 
institutional collaboration on resource, financial 
and environmental management. Good govern­
ance is a cross-cutting issue. Norway hopes that 
Oil for Development will also help to bolster petro­
leum-related business activities through support 
for building competence in the supplier industry. 
The initiative has grown rapidly as a result of 
increasing demand. Today, Oil for Development 
cooperation has been established in 25 countries. 
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Box 2.7  The Extractive Industries Transparency Initiative 

It is a paradox that in many developing coun­
tries with important natural resources, econo­
mic growth is low and the risk of violent conflict 
is high. Income disparities also tend to be 
higher in these countries. The Extractive Indus­
tries Transparency Initiative (EITI) was establis­
hed to promote transparency concerning reve­
nues from the petroleum and mining industries 
in producer countries. Transparency encoura­
ges sound management of these revenues and 
can thus be an important factor in poverty 
reduction. A lack of transparency in these areas 
has made it possible for elite groups to become 
very wealthy in some resource-rich countries. 

The EITI is working to ensure that transpa­
rency in the extractives sector becomes a global 
norm and that a greater proportion of the reve­
nue from these industries is used to promote 
fair social and economic development. It is thus 
a key development policy player. Greater trans­
parency in revenue flows will also promote grea­
ter stability in the world’s energy regions. 

More than 20 countries with rich resources 
are already implementing the EITI criteria. An 
additional 20 countries are considering joining 
the initiative. Altogether, these countries make 
up more than half the world’s most resource-
rich countries. Countries that join the EITI can 
seek assistance from the World Bank, the Afri­
can Development Bank and the Asian Develop­
ment Bank. The initiative has also won the poli­
tical support of the G8 and receives financial 
support from a number of countries, including 
the US, Germany, Canada, Italy and Norway. 

The EITI does not just work with countries. It 
also provides a partnership between govern­
ments, extractive companies and civil society. 
For example, it provides civil society with infor­
mation about revenues from the extractives sec­
tor that can be used to hold the governments 
accountable for how these revenues are used. 

In order to strengthen the EITI’s credibility, 
it is important that Western countries also 
undertake to comply with the initiative’s crite­
ria. The Norwegian authorities and our national 
oil and gas company StatoilHydro have taken 
part in the initiative since 2003. StatoilHydro’s 
payments to governments in countries where 
the company is operating are published in its 
annual reports. Norway held the third EITI 
international conference in 2006, and is cur­
rently hosting its international secretariat. 

Norway is the first Western country to have 
declared that it will fully implement the EITI cri­
teria. Norway already practises transparency 
concerning the payments from petroleum com­
panies to the government authorities. EITI com­
pliance means that companies must report pay­
ments to an independent EITI administrator, 
and that the government authorities must 
report receipt of payments to the same body. A 
multi-stakeholder committee must also be 
appointed to monitor the implementation of the 
EITI criteria. 

The Government’s aim is for the entire vali­
dation process – including drawing up regula­
tions, reporting payments and verification of 
results – to be completed in the course of 2009. 

Informal sector 

For a large proportion of the population in the least 
developed countries, the main source of income is 
from the production of goods and services in the 
informal sector. This is growing faster than the for­
mal sector, and experience shows that economic 
growth has to be very high before any major reduc­
tion in the informal sector is seen. Generally, the 
informal sector is characterised by low productiv­
ity, low wages, poor working conditions, high risk, 
a lack of rights and inadequate social goods. A 
large proportion of those working in the informal 
sector are women. 

The informal sector will be important for a 
large part of the population in poor countries for 
the foreseeable future. It is unrealistic to expect 
the formal sector to be able to create a sufficient 
number of new jobs in the short term. Efforts to 
safeguard the rights of those working in the infor­
mal sector must therefore be given higher priority. 
The International Labour Organization has devel­
oped a set of rules for this area, including a conven­
tion on home work (1996) and a resolution on the 
informal sector (2002). 

The reports of the Commission on Legal 
Empowerment of the Poor are vital tools in this 
work. The formalisation agenda seeks to increase 
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Box 2.8  Oil for Development in East Timor 

East Timor is one of the Oil for Development 
initiative’s ten core cooperation countries. 
These efforts are of a long-term nature. In 2002, 
it was clear that the country needed to develop 
institutions and legislation to manage its petro­
leum resources in the best interests of the gene­
ral population. In 2003, Norway and East Timor 
entered into a five-year agreement on petroleum 
cooperation. Prior to this, Norway had provided 
expertise for East Timor’s negotiations with its 
neighbouring countries on ownership issues 
and delimitation of the continental shelf. Over 
time, this cooperation and sharing of expertise 
has been expanded to include institutional colla­
boration between ministries of petroleum, 
finance and the environment. This is in line with 
Oil for Development’s integrated approach to 
the three main themes in the initiative: resource 
management, environmental management and 
revenue management. 

Norwegian experts in East Timor play an 
important role. Experts from the Norwegian 
Ministry of Finance and the Norwegian Petro­
leum Tax Office are linked up to the Ministry of 
Economy and Development in East Timor, and 
the Norwegian Petroleum Directorate also has 
personnel in its sister organisation. In addition, 
the Oil for Development initiative offers cour­
ses, conferences, seminars and training pro­
grammes in both East Timor and Norway. 

East Timor’s petroleum sector – both the 
activity on the continental shelf and the estab­
lishment of an institutional framework – has 
developed rapidly. In 2005, Norwegian lawyers 
helped to develop the country’s petroleum legis­
lation. In recent years, East Timor has had 

important revenues from gas and condensate 
production on the Bayu-Undan field in the Aust­
ralia/Indonesia Zone of Cooperation. Norway 
assisted with the implementation of a successful 
first licensing round in East Timor waters in 
2006. There are plans to drill a number of explo­
ration wells in these areas in 2009. 

Despite limited production, the revenues 
from petroleum activities are already of impor­
tance for this small economy. Petroleum reve­
nues were estimated to be equivalent to just 
over 400 per cent of the non-oil gross national 
income in 2008. The country’s strong depen­
dence on petroleum resources underlines the 
importance of sound management. Ensuring 
that it is possible to use petroleum revenues wit­
hout affecting the general income flow has been 
an important step. In 2005, East Timor establis­
hed a petroleum fund, through a specific petro­
leum fund act, that was modelled on Norway’s 
Government Pension Fund – Global, with assis­
tance from Norwegian experts. 

In addition to continuing to provide assis­
tance with resource and revenue management, 
the Oil for Development initiative will also 
expand its advisory services in the field of envi­
ronmental management. Institutionalising envi­
ronmental responsibility and implementing a 
planned environmental act are key tasks in this 
respect. 

Transparency in the public administration 
and good governance are vital aspects of institu­
tion building in East Timor. The Norwegian 
efforts have helped the country in its prepara­
tions for full compliance with the Extractive 
Industries Transparency Initiative (EITI). 

political awareness of the fact that legal empower­
ment of the poor benefits the whole of society, and 
that the whole economy is strengthened when the 
market functions for everyone. A society where 
only a limited part of the population takes part in 
the formal economy is not sustainable in the long 
term. 

Tourism 

The tourist industry is growing. According to the 
World Tourism Organization (UNWTO), the 

number of tourists worldwide will triple over the 
next ten years. Cultural monuments and sites and 
natural heritage generally constitute the resource 
base for the tourist industry. Many developing 
countries are rich in such resources, and Norway 
has a long tradition of assisting poor countries in 
developing an institutional framework and man­
agement plans that take into account the local com­
munity, sustainable development and protection of 
cultural and natural heritage. 

The aim is to develop a sustainable tourist 
industry that ensures local ownership, promotes 
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Box 2.9  Tourism creates opportunities for 
growth 

The conservation of World Heritage site Ilha 
de Moçambique during the 1999–2008 period 
has had many positive ripple effects for soci­
ety as a whole. It has multiplied the number of 
tourists, and led to a large increase in the 
number of jobs and the resumption of local 
lime production. It has also fostered greater 
historical awareness, generated debate, and 
led to a stronger sense of identity. 

local business and long-term employment, and has 
positive effects on the environment, social struc­
tures and culture. 

The Government will: 

•	 promote equal ownership and inheritance 
rights for women and men 

•	 promote framework conditions for sustainable 
business development in the agriculture and 
fishery sectors 

•	 further develop the strategic partnership with 
the chemical company Yara on providing bet­
ter access to mineral fertiliser for farmers 

•	 encourage developing countries that are rich 
in natural resources to use their revenues to 
ensure sustainable economic development and 
promote the welfare of the population as a 
whole 

•	 emphasise how important it is that natural 
resources are exploited in an environmentally 
sound manner that allows for co-existence with 
other users both on land and at sea 

•	 further develop the Oil for Development initia­
tive, with emphasis on resource management, 
environmental protection and revenue man­
agement 

•	 help to build competence in the petroleum-
related local business sector to ensure greater 
ripple effects for the local community from 
petroleum activities 

•	 implement the Extractive Industries Transpar­
ency Initiative (EITI) criteria and strengthen 
international cooperation on increasing trans­
parency in connection with the extractive 
industries. 
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3 The global framework
 

Globalisation is giving rise to new and stronger 
links between countries and regions, different peo­
ples, and between rich and poor. While national 
policy remains decisive for individual countries’ 
development, the opportunity of any individual 
country to control its own destiny is increasingly 
influenced by external circumstances. Interna­
tional cooperation will therefore be progressively 
more important in tackling regional and global 
challenges that influence development. 

Box 3.1  Common destiny 

«This is a crucial year in the life of our United 
Nations. We have just passed the midpoint in 
the struggle to reach the Millennium Devel­
opment Goals – our common vision for build­
ing a better world in the 21st century. We can 
see more clearly than ever that the threats of 
the 21st century spare no one. Climate change, 
the spread of disease and deadly weapons, 
and the scourge of terrorism all cross bor­
ders. If we want to advance the global com­
mon good, we must secure global public 
goods.» 
Source: Excerpt from UN Secretary-General 
Ban Ki-moon’s message on United Nations Day 2008. 

Figure 3.1  UN Secretary-General Ban Ki-moon 
Photo: UN Photo/Mark Garten 

3.1 Global organisation is in everyone’s 
interests 

At the start of 2009, the world was the middle of an 
economic downturn whose consequences we have 
yet to fully grasp. The developing countries are 
already hard hit by other crises. The food crisis, 
unstable prices for oil and other commodities, and 
unpredictable access to energy have given rise to 
uncertainty. Climate change will particularly hit 
the poor. There is a risk that the positive develop­
ment trend will be reversed and that poverty will 
again increase dramatically. These serious and dif­
ficult issues must not be pushed into the back­
ground by the financial crisis. On the contrary, we 
must use measures to combat the financial crisis to 
address these major long-term challenges. The cri­
sis has uncovered a great need to review our global 
mechanisms, and find solutions that will benefit 
the developing world. 

The need for international rules and better glo­
bal organisation and coordination is greater than 
ever. The major global challenges cannot be solved 
by any one country alone, but require a well-func­
tioning international legal order in which relations 
between states are regulated through common 
norms and binding conventions. Given its geo­
graphical location, economy and resources, Nor­
way is particularly dependent on robust interna­
tional rules and good global governance mecha­
nisms to safeguard its economy, social 
development and security. In this context, we 
clearly have a common interest with developing 
countries. 

The UN is the most important international 
organisation with a mandate to play a leading role 
in developing global governance mechanisms. UN 
efforts in this area are supplemented by those of a 
number of other global and regional organisations. 

Geopolitical changes, with an eastward – and 
partly southward – shift of the economic and polit­
ical centre of gravity, mean that many large devel­
oping countries now have more power than they 
used to have. Under the leadership of the BRICS 
countries (Brazil, Russia, India, China and South 
Africa), they are demanding greater influence and 
participation in global governance. Organisations 
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Box 3.2  The World Bank sets the agenda for private sector regulation 

The World Bank’s annual Doing Business report 
is intended to provide as objective an assess­
ment as possible of private sector regulation in 
178 countries. Within a short period of time, it 
has become the World Bank’s most widely read 
and quoted publication, and is now used by 
many national authorities. In many countries, 
reforms are designed specifically with a view to 
improving their ranking. Private investors also 
use the report when considering new invest­
ments. Despite the fact that Doing Business has 
a relatively narrow methodology and is not a 
comprehensive guide to a healthy investment 
climate, the importance of its content and con­
clusions is substantial. 

In order to obtain a loan from the private sec­
tor investment arm of the World Bank, the Inter­
national Finance Corporation (IFC), enterprises 
must satisfy the Equator Principles – a bench 

mark for managing environmental and social 
risk. Although complying with these norms is 
both demanding and costly, many private com­
panies apply to the IFC for loans. Cooperation 
with the IFC is not just a question of obtaining 
financing, it also confers an informal but implicit 
seal of approval on the company concerned. 
Cooperation with the IFC thus enhances a com­
pany’s reputation. These strict principles have 
been adopted by many of the world’s largest 
commercial banks, which are referred to as the 
Equator Principles Banks. In 2007, they acco­
unted for almost 70 per cent of all project finan­
cing in developing countries. The IFC’s strin­
gent norms have thus had positive ripple effects 
far beyond the IFC’s own activities and without 
the IFC having a formal mandate to establish 
such norms. 

such as the UN, the World Trade Organization, the 
World Bank and the International Monetary Fund 
are under pressure to adjust their policies as a 
result of new power constellations. This means 
new experiences and considerations are brought 
onto the international agenda, and the interna­
tional community is being challenged to take part 
in a broader debate about how international coop­
eration between countries, organisations and indi­
viduals is to be organised. 

Increasing the influence of developing coun­
tries in the UN, the World Bank and the Interna­
tional Monetary Fund could strengthen the legiti­
macy and credibility of these organisations in the 
landscape of international development actors. If 
these global organisations fail to strengthen their 
role and increase their relevance, there is a genu­
ine risk that developing countries will not consider 
them to have any value. 

Continued lack of confidence could lead to the 
emergence of competing institutions. The estab­
lishment of an Asian monetary fund has been dis­
cussed. Likewise, the need for an international 
financial institution specialising in middle-income 
countries has also been considered. The discussion 
must be seen in the context of the BRICS countries’ 
struggle to strengthen their position in the govern­
ing bodies of the World Bank. In Latin America, the 
Venezuelan–Argentinian initiative Banco del Sur 
was established for some of the same reasons. This 

can only be seen as an expression of deep scepti­
cism towards and dissatisfaction with the Washing-
ton-based World Bank and International Monetary 
Fund. With regard to the UN, this scepticism is 
most evident when initiatives are launched outside 
or in parallel with the organisation. 

In the wake of the financial crisis, the Group of 
Twenty (G20) has shown itself to be an important 
player in the international arena. The group is a 
substantially expanded version of the G8, and 
reflects the new global political and economic 
power balance. 

The diversity of norm-building institutions and 
forums presents new opportunities to exert influ­
ence. A small group of countries and players can 
take the lead in developing a common understand­
ing of the need for new guidelines and norms. This 
will make it easier to win the support of the rest of 
the world. Norway, for example, took this 
approach in the efforts that culminated in the adop­
tion of the Convention on Cluster Munitions. Other 
examples include the efforts targeting illicit finan­
cial flows, in which connection Norway chaired an 
international working group in 2008, and the Nor­
wegian Climate and Forest Initiative, where one of 
Norway’s goals is to act as a catalyst for stronger 
international coordination of the work on tropical 
forest conservation. These are complex and sensi­
tive issues involving strong international counter-
forces, where it is necessary to establish a platform 
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Box 3.3  Decent work 

In our globalised world, it is becoming increa­
singly difficult to ensure more equitable dis­
tribution. Decent working conditions and 
respect for employees’ rights are crucial to a 
just society. Norway is one of the first coun­
tries in the world to have established a com­
prehensive strategy for improving and coordi­
nating efforts to promote workers’ rights on a 
global basis. These efforts are based on the 
International Labour Organization’s (ILO) 
Decent Work Agenda. Norway has increased 
its efforts for the period 2008–2009 through a 
programme agreement worth NOK 100 mil­
lion. Decent work entails combating poverty 
through a comprehensive approach to ensure 
that people obtain decent and productive 
employment, where fundamental labour stan­
dards are respected and workers are paid a 
living wage. 

for developing new norms. However, in order to 
create robust instruments that command broad 
support and legitimacy, the results of these efforts 
must be channelled into formal processes, and be 
subject to intergovernmental negotiations, for 
example in the UN. 

The stronger position of developing countries 
in global organisations can make them increas­
ingly important allies for richer countries. For Nor­
way, this could be particularly relevant in organisa­
tions that work in the complex interface between 
marine, resource, environmental and trade issues 
and on the development and implementation of 
internationally agreed norms, such as the Conven­
tion on International Trade in Endangered Species 
(CITES), the International Whaling Commission 
(IWC), the International Maritime Organization 
(IMO), and the Convention on Biological Diversity 
(CBD). 

The financial crisis has uncovered several 
weaknesses in the international financial market, 
but the need for well-functioning international 
financial institutions has also become clearer. 
Stronger crisis prevention measures are needed in 
the financial sector. Both national and international 
regulation must be strengthened. More people are 
now advocating a new Bretton Woods conference, 
and both the World Bank and the IMF have 
appointed an external high-level commission to 
look into their roles and structures. 

For the Government, it is important that the 
reform of international financial institutions is suf­
ficiently comprehensive to ensure that we are bet­
ter able to prevent and deal with financial crises in 
future. 

The special role of the UN 

The UN is a unique arena for developing binding 
international norms and regulations. Conventions 
and international commitments are adopted 
through intergovernmental negotiations in the 
UN. 

The UN is the most important player in the 
field of human rights in terms of monitoring and 
developing norms. The High Commissioner for 
Human Rights is responsible for ensuring respect 
for human rights and compliance with human 
rights norms. All UN organisations emphasise the 
rights dimension in their mandates. 

The UN is the most important forum for the 
peaceful resolution of conflicts. Here heads of state 
and government and national representatives 
meet. The ideas and ideologies of different states 
are weighed and discussed. This function is 
becoming increasingly important the more com­
plex the world becomes. 

In the field of security policy, the UN can help 
to resolve conflicts that threaten international 
peace. In extreme cases, the UN Security Council 
can legitimise the use of force by the international 
community, although, where strong national inter­
ests are involved, it will often be difficult to agree 
on common solutions. Today, the UN has peace­
keeping forces numbering more than 100 000 in 
countries where security efforts are needed to 
safeguard ongoing peace processes. 

The UN’s humanitarian efforts are based on 
universal norms and rules, humanitarian princi­
ples and the Geneva conventions, which protect 
civilians and human dignity. While the challenges 
are certainly many – such as access for and secu­
rity of humanitarian personnel, coordination, advo­
cacy efforts and funding – there is also great poten­
tial for taking action. Well-coordinated humanitar­
ian efforts can open closed doors for the UN, and 
can to a certain extent compensate for a lack of 
room for manoeuvre on other fronts. 

The Millennium Development Goals were 
adopted by heads of state and government at the 
UN Millennium Summit in 2000. They set the 
agenda, direction and targets for economic and 
social development. The progress of the work on 
the millennium goals is monitored by the UN. 
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Box 3.4  Convention on the Rights of Persons with Disabilities 

The UN’s Convention on the Rights of Persons 
with Disabilities entered into force in May 2008. 
This means that the 650 million people with 
disabilities worldwide have protection against dis­
crimination. Eighty per cent of this group live in 

developing countries, often in deep poverty and 
with poor access to health and educational ser­
vices. The Convention contains separate articles 
on women’s and children’s rights since these 
groups may suffer double discrimination. 

Figure 3.2  The disabled are an important target group for Norwegian development policy 
Photo: UN Photo/Christopher Herwig 

The UN is often criticised for not being efficient 
enough, particularly in the implementation of its 
development projects. Norway takes this criticism 
seriously and has become involved in the efforts to 
make the UN more effective. In an institution as 
large as the UN and with the UN’s role and ambi­
tions, the reform process must be more or less con­
tinuous. We need a UN that is credible and that 
complies with the high standards set by the organ­
isation itself. 

Norway is one of the UN’s foremost support­
ers. We have always supported the principles of the 
rule of law, the integrity of the nation state, the 
need for solidarity, the principle that right must 
prevail over might, and the importance of coopera­
tion and the peaceful resolution of conflicts. And, 

not least, we emphasise that globalisation should 
be socially and economically inclusive. However, 
the UN needs to reduce the resources used on 
internal bureaucracy in order to ensure that the 
effect of its overall efforts is greater than is the 
case with today’s fragmented approach. That is 
why Norway is involved in developing concrete, 
realisable and effective measures to improve the 
UN. 

The Government will: 

•	 continue its efforts to ensure a well-functioning 
international legal order in which relations 
between states are regulated through common 
norms and binding conventions 
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•	 promote a more democratic governance struc­
ture in multilateral organisations that takes 
greater account of the interests of developing 
countries and reflects geopolitical changes 

•	 seek to ensure that UN agencies intensify their 
efforts to achieve the goals adopted by the 
international community, within their respec­
tive mandates 

•	 help to ensure that the UN organisations’ oper­
ational activities underpin their normative 
mandate to a greater extent 

•	 intensify and coordinate Norway’s efforts to 
promote workers’ rights in developing coun­
tries 

•	 intensify efforts to promote a socially just dis­
tribution policy. 

3.2 Global public goods 

The major challenges facing the world cannot be 
solved by any one country on its own. A stable cli­
mate, the conservation of genetic diversity, clean 
air, peace and security, the absence of infectious, 
epidemic diseases, the development of new knowl­
edge and technology, international trade, and 
financial stability are examples of important global 
public goods – goods that are important to all coun­
tries and that must be secured through joint global 
efforts. 

Global public goods are important to all coun­
tries, but again it is the poorest countries that are 
most vulnerable. They are least able to deal with 
new epidemics, are hardest hit by climate change, 
and are most at risk from conflicts and instability. 
The fight against poverty depends on the strength­
ening of certain public goods. This has long been 
clear, particularly in the areas of health and knowl­
edge generation. The Government wishes to 
increase focus on the importance of public goods 
relating to climate and the environment, peace and 
security, and a stable financial system. 

In recent years, we have gained a greater 
understanding of just how important global public 
goods are, also in relation to our own future. The 
challenges cut across national borders, income sta­
tus and generations. This forms the basis for a new 
debate on both our own and the international com­
munity’s willingness to invest in the global commu­
nity and highlights the fact that we have a common 
destiny. We must seek to find solutions together, 
not individually. 

Securing financing for global public goods is an 
important and difficult challenge. Their global 
nature makes it difficult to distribute the costs, and 

Box 3.5  What is a public good? 

«Economists describe pure public goods as 
‘nonrival’ and ‘nonexcludable’. Nonrival 
means the supply of the good, such as clean 
air, to one person (or country) does not lead 
to there being less of it for another. Nonexclu­
dable means that once the good is provided 
for one person, it is available for all to benefit 
from it. Typically, at the margin, the net bene­
fits accruing to private individuals from such 
goods are less than the net benefits for soci­
ety as a whole, and hence the public good is 
undersupplied in private markets. Public 
goods require collective action to be properly 
provided and, at the national level, this can 
often be coordinated by using government 
powers (including taxation, spending, and 
regulation). 

«Importantly, public goods also have a 
spatial dimension. Their geographic reach 
runs across a continuum from local commu­
nity boundaries, to national borders, to regi­
ons of several countries, to the global sphere. 
The usual problems in supplying public goods 
are exacerbated for truly global public goods. 
That is because there is a divergence between 
the costs and benefits captured at the national 
and global levels, and it is particularly difficult 
to secure collective action across countries.» 

Source: The World Bank, Annual Review of Development 
Effectiveness 2008 

many will take the opportunity to free-ride, relying 
on others to pick up the tab. Others again may be 
willing to pay, but are unable to do so. This results 
in the underfinancing of important global tasks. 

The world today lacks an international system 
for financing global public goods. It has long been 
debated both in Norway and internationally 
whether it should be possible to use aid funds for 
this purpose. Many measures that contribute to 
strengthening global public goods also help to 
strengthen national public goods, particularly in 
the fields of health and knowledge generation. It is 
obvious that measures of this kind fall within the 
definition of aid. A good example is the fight 
against malaria in Zambia, which helps to reduce 
the risk of malaria spreading to other countries 
while at the same time being important to Zambia’s 
own population. Rescue packages for banks that 
are threatened as a result of the financial crisis also 
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Figure 3.3  Common destiny 
Source: Message from a group of Aboriginal activists in 
Queensland in the 1970s. The quote has often been attributed 
to Lila Watson, who was a member of the group. Poster by 
Ricardo Levins Morales/Northland Poster Collective 

contribute to securing a global public good – a sta­
ble international finance system – but, naturally, 
such packages should not be financed through aid 
funds. There are many different measures to pro­
mote public goods between these two extremes, 
some of which can be defined as aid and others not. 

For aid to qualify as Official Development 
Assistance (ODA), it must meet a set of criteria 
agreed by the donors who make up the OECD 
Development Assistance Committee (DAC). Only 
funds approved as ODA are taken into account 
when assessing whether donors achieve the inter­
nationally stipulated target of 0.7 per cent of gross 
national income or, for Norway’s part, whether we 
achieve our national target of 1 per cent. 

The measures planned under Norway’s Inter­
national Climate and Forest Initiative comply with 
the ODA criteria. Projects that successfully reduce 

deforestation and forest degradation will improve 
the living conditions and rights of local and indige­
nous peoples, conserve biological diversity and 
reduce greenhouse gas emissions. The measures 
are funded via the aid budget in cooperation with 
the recipient countries. It is an absolute require­
ment that the ODA criteria are complied with and 
that the recipient country wants this kind of coop­
eration. 

However, it will not be possible to finance all the 
public goods via aid budgets. Aid should primarily 
be used to fund measures of a local or national 
nature. The international community must find 
other mechanisms for funding the global public 
goods. 

The Government will therefore look into the 
possibility of developing a new international instru­
ment that can encourage greater efforts to 
strengthen the global public goods. The possibility 
of collaborating with OECD/DAC is being consid­
ered, as the Committee has already started a proc­
ess of this kind on reducing greenhouse gas emis­
sions. 

Financing must be raised through collabora­
tion with private investors, and innovative financ­
ing mechanisms must be developed. Some meas­
ures are already well under way. A British initiative 
to issue vaccination bonds has already raised funds 
that could provide half a billion vaccinations in 
poor countries in the next ten years. In France, an 
air passenger solidarity tax has been introduced 
that is providing funding to combat various dis­
eases. The Kyoto Protocol allows for the establish­
ment of new markets for emissions trading and 
investment in emission-reduction and -removal 
projects. 

By ratifying the 1997 Kyoto Protocol, a majority 
of developed countries committed themselves to 
binding and costly obligations to reduce their car­
bon emissions through various measures and to 
develop a system for pricing emission allowances. 
A new climate regime that successfully establishes 
a global carbon price will in practice ensure pay­
ment for a global public good, a stabilised climate. 

Health as a global public good 

The absence of infectious diseases and major epi­
demics is a global public good. Good public health 
and health security depend on collaboration 
between individuals, local communities and coun­
tries. A well-functioning health system with bind­
ing cooperation between states makes it possible 
to prepare for and protect against threats to public 
health, including infections, biological terrorism, 
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Figure 3.4  The development of vaccines strengt-
hens global public goods. Vaccines benefit both 
rich and poor countries. 
Photo: Ken Opprann 

armed conflicts, natural disasters and climate 
change. Research and product development aimed 
at preventing and dealing with epidemics – such as 
the development of diagnostics, databases, medi­
cines and vaccines – are important in order to 
secure this global public good. 

Increased efforts to improve health in poor 
countries could result in considerable benefits for 
rich countries. One direct benefit is a reduced risk 
of diseases such as bird flu spreading across 
national borders. Improving public health will also 
reduce the risk of diseases such as AIDS and tuber­
culosis becoming resistant to drugs, increase the 
probability of eradicating certain diseases such as 
polio, and reduce the global prevalence of malaria 
and tuberculosis. Indirect economic benefits 
include increased activity, production and purchas­
ing power, which results in a larger global market. 

The international efforts to combat infectious 
diseases are linked to the efforts to achieve Millen­
nium Development Goal (MDG) number 6, 
Combat HIV/AIDS, malaria and other diseases. 
Malaria and tuberculosis can be brought under 
control by 2015 if progress continues and is not 
impeded by climate change. There has been a 
marked reduction in the number of children dying 
of malaria in some countries. A sixfold increase in 
the funding of HIV programmes has begun to pro­
duce results, particularly in the form of access to 
AIDS medicines and the prevention of mother-to­
child transmission. More than three million people 
are now receiving treatment for AIDS, but unfortu­
nately between two and three new persons become 
infected for every new person who receives treat­
ment. Some countries are now experiencing a 
reduction in the number of new cases, while in oth­

ers it is increasing. A broad range of preventive 
measures is required to address the underlying 
causes of the spread of infection, such as gender 
inequality, malnourishment, discrimination and 
lack of access to education and health services. 

The health-related MDGs have spurred new 
partnerships between multilateral, bilateral, volun­
tary and, not least, private actors, such as the GAVI 
Alliance (Alliance for Vaccines and Immunization) 
and the Global Fund to Fight AIDS, Tuberculosis 
and Malaria. 

Knowledge as a global public good 

Knowledge can be a global public good. Without 
research and innovation, products like antibiotics 
and mineral fertilisers – which are vital for global 
health and food security – would never have been 
developed. New technology can be expected to 
address some of the climate challenges. Knowl­
edge can foster state-building and economic 
growth. As a result of information technology, 
trade and migration, knowledge is now being 
spread more quickly than ever before. At the same 
time, the economic importance of knowledge has 
also increased. Education, research and technol­
ogy are crucial for social and economic develop­
ment. Economic growth and poverty reduction in 
the West in the last century was largely the result 
of the development of new knowledge and technol­
ogy. 

Today, national and regional authorities com­
pete to spearhead research and innovation in order 
to ensure future economic growth. Private enter­
prises account for an increasingly large share of 
global research efforts. The fact that knowledge 
has become a strategic economic resource for 
companies and national authorities has led to 
increasing privatisation and commercialisation of 
knowledge, and it cannot therefore be defined as a 
public good. New knowledge is often first devel­
oped as a commercial product that gradually 
becomes generally available. 

The economic progress experienced by some 
developing countries is partly due to the emphasis 
placed on research. This is particularly the case in 
several Asian countries, which have experienced 
much stronger growth in research than both 
Europe and the US. In the period 1999–2004, China 
took over from the US as the country with the 
world’s largest tertiary education system. Figures 
from UNESCO show that China had 19 million stu­
dents, compared with 17 million in the US in this 
period. Asia now has 31.5 per cent of global 
research resources, compared with 14.5 per cent in 
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Box 3.6  Health in the foreign policy context 

In 2006, Norway took an initiative to include the 
full breadth of health issues in foreign policy. 
The background to this initiative was the recog­
nition that foreign policy measures and policy 
instruments can have major consequences for 
public health in the countries concerned. More­
over, foreign policy instruments are often nee­
ded to address global health challenges. The 
foreign ministers of Brazil, France, Indonesia, 
Norway, Senegal, South Africa and Thailand 
drew up a joint agenda in 2007. Three main 
issues are given priority: 
• ensuring  capacity for global health security by 

developing national preparedness, combat­
ing infectious diseases and addressing the 
global health workforce crisis 

• facing threats to global health security in con­
nection with conflicts and natural disasters, 
and related to the HIV/AIDS epidemic and 
environmental problems 

• making globalisation work for all through 
trade policy and efforts to promote good 
governance. 

Several of the countries behind this initiative 
strongly emphasise the close interconnections 
between public health and other development 
goals. In the Oslo Ministerial Declaration from 
2007, the foreign ministers advocate: 

• using the shared interest in global public 
health as a rationale for giving health top pri­
ority in the national and international cross­
sectoral development agenda, and emphasis­
ing measures that match domestic goals and 
reflect the requirements of those in need 

• strengthening the efficiency of global health 
initiatives through improved governance 
and better coordination of multiple, competi­
tive donors and aid providers 

• improving research capacity nationally and 
regionally and control capacity of public 
health systems, with particular emphasis on 
the needs of developing countries 

• improving capacity for the production of 
medicines and medical equipment, and for 
regulatory and control systems for medi­
cines and delivery systems 

• meeting existing financing commitments 
and developing mechanisms that can pro­
duce additional resources for global health 
investments, such as the international pur­
chasing system for medicines for developing 
countries (UNITAID) 

• working together with the IMF and the 
World Bank to overcome macroeconomic 
constraints to effective health investment at 
country level. 

1990. The private sector is becoming more and 
more knowledge-based and mobile. These are par­
allel development trends. Economic activity moves 
to where the expertise is available. Private-sector 
investment in research is growing significantly and 
tends in most countries to be far greater than pub­
lic investment. Scientific and technological knowl­
edge is essential to the development of new and 
better products, processes and services, and the 
knowledge content in international trade is grow­
ing rapidly. 

There is a general tendency towards increased 
internationalisation of research efforts and of qual­
ity assurance of higher education and research. 
The global educational landscape is characterised 
by a growing number of students and high and 
unmet demand. This is creating an increasing need 
for international frameworks, including systems 
for quality assurance and recognition of qualifica­
tions between countries. Europe is addressing this 

through the Bologna process, which has the goal 
of creating a European Higher Education Area by 
2010. This need is also being addressed by 
UNESCO and the OECD. 

Despite the global increase in investments in 
higher education and research, we note that the 
poorest developing countries are falling behind in 
the knowledge race. The knowledge gap between 
rich and poor countries is huge, and growing. In 
the least developed countries, there are only 4.5 
researchers on average per million inhabitants, 
compared with 3 300 researchers per million in the 
developed countries. The least developed coun­
tries only account for 0.1 per cent of the world’s 
total investments in research. Africa’s share 
amounts to 0.6 per cent. The developing countries 
are also clear losers as regards international com­
panies’ investments in knowledge-based produc­
tion. Studies carried out for the UN Conference on 
Trade and Development (UNCTAD) have shown 
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Box 3.7  Funding for higher education and 
research 

Norwegian funding for higher education and 
research is an important contribution to build­
ing knowledge in all parts of the world. 
Through schemes such as Norad’s Pro­
gramme for Master Studies (NOMA), the 
Norwegian Programme for Development, 
Research and Education (NUFU), and the 
quota scheme for students from developing 
countries, the Western Balkan countries and 
countries in Eastern Europe and Central Asia, 
higher education and research institutions in 
Norway are helping to build capacity in 
developing countries – not only in the higher 
education and research sector, but also in the 
public and private sectors in general. Under 
NUFU, bonuses are paid to institutions that 
succeed in increasing the proportion of 
women completing doctoral degrees to at 
least 40 per cent. 

that half of the least developed countries had 
poorer innovation capability in 2001 than in 1995. 

Research and development is essential for last­
ing, sustainable growth and for a diversified pro­
duction structure. It is also vital for building robust 
democracies. Innovation and private-sector devel­
opment often take place in collaboration between 
academics and technical experts. Both are of equal 
importance. A well-developed system of elemen­
tary education, including technical and occupa­
tional training, is essential for recruitment to 
higher education and high-quality research. 

The Government will: 

•	 focus on global public goods that are of direct 
importance to development, particularly in the 
areas of climate, environment, security, health, 
knowledge and research 

•	 take the initiative for the development of a new 
international instrument to stimulate efforts to 
strengthen global public goods 

•	 focus on effective integration of health serv­
ices aimed at achieving the health-related Mil­
lennium Development Goals 

•	 contribute to the development of global knowl­
edge as a public good 

•	 strengthen higher education and research in 
key areas of international development 

•	 give priority to Norwegian research coopera­
tion with India and China, particularly in the 
climate field 

•	 help to ensure that our partners’ educational 
services are designed to promote gender 
equality. 

3.3	 Global cooperation for increased 
food security 

Food is not a global public good; on the contrary, 
food is a rival good, and access may be inhibited. At 
the same time, food security cannot be increased 
without a substantial degree of global cooperation 
and international control, because although food 
security is a national responsibility, it is signifi­
cantly affected by a number of different external 
factors. Terms of trade, the price of oil, interna­
tional seed and genetic resource policy and climate 
change are important global framework condi­
tions. 

Data from the UN and the World Bank show 
that the number of people with insufficient access 
to food increased by more than one hundred mil­
lion during 2008, from 850 million to around a bil­
lion, as a result of higher food prices. Around 25 
thousand people die every day from hunger and 
related diseases. Children and women who are 
pregnant or breastfeeding are particularly hard hit. 

Despite a temporary fall in prices, we must 
expect a higher price level for food in future. It is 
estimated that the world’s population will increase 
by three billion in the next forty years. According 
to the Food and Agriculture Organization of the 
United Nations (FAO), food production will have to 
more than double in the same period if the needs 
are to be met. 

Norway has been a driving force in interna­
tional efforts to establish the right to food as a fun­
damental human rights principle. We played an 
active part within the framework of FAO in the 
development of voluntary guidelines for the right 
to food. These have been an important tool for 
increasing focus on this issue. 

Water- and food-borne diseases, serious animal 
diseases and crop pests can dramatically reduce 
the volume and quality of production, and thereby 
access to food. Such diseases can often turn into 
epidemics, and can thus be very costly. 

Many countries, Norway included, have 
emphasised that food aid must not undermine local 
production and the development of local markets. 
The problem of dumping of surplus production 
from the West is much less now than it used to be. 
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However, less surplus production in the rich part of 
the world, could, in the worst case, lead to the 
opposite problem, namely that insufficient food aid 
is available in a crisis. It is therefore important to 
prioritise food security. 

The input factors in agricultural production are 
much more expensive when oil prices are high. 
The price of oil particularly affects the price of min­
eral fertiliser and transport services. At the same 
time, a high oil price stimulates alternative agricul­
tural production in the form of biofuel. The strong 
fluctuations in oil prices in 2008 have substantially 
reduced predictability for small farmers. This, 
combined with limited access to credit and poorly 
developed markets, means that many small farm­
ers are not in a position to take the risk that new 
investments entail. The risk of increased extreme 
weather as a result of climate change further 
reduces willingness to take risk. These factors are 
beyond the control of individual states and make it 
more difficult for them to take responsibility for 
the population’s food security. Norway will 
increase its agricultural aid as part of an interna­
tional effort to strengthen agriculture in poor coun­
tries. 

More emphasis needs to be placed on food 
security internationally in the development of new 
climate, energy and trade policy measures. Nor­
way will promote the use of existing mechanisms 
for cooperation and coordination rather than the 
creation of new structures. The mandate of the 
Committee on World Food Security, which was 
established under the auspices of FAO in 1973, is 
to be a forum for discussion and policy develop­
ment in the food security context. Norway is seek­
ing to ensure that this committee is given a more 
central role as a global forum for food security. 

Genetic resources are a form of «life insur­
ance» in terms of food security. Traditionally, these 
resources have served as buffers against threats 
such as insect attacks and plant diseases. FAO esti­
mates that 75 per cent of the genetic diversity in 
agricultural crops has been lost in the last century. 
In recent years, it has become clear that climate 
change will create the need for a broad supply of 
genetic resources in agriculture. There are many 
indications that growing conditions for important 
food crops will change significantly in the course of 
relatively few years. Parts of Africa are expected to 
experience problems as a result of more droughts 
and more extreme temperatures, but other parts of 
the world could also experience dramatic changes. 

More research is required in the various fields 
that are relevant for developing more climate- and 
environmentally-friendly agricultural technology. 

The Government therefore supports the Consulta­
tive Group on International Agricultural Research 
(CGIAR). Norway is a significant contributor to the 
Food and Agricultural Organization of the United 
Nations (FAO) and the International Fund for Agri­
cultural Development (IFAD). The World Food 
Programme is also an important channel for Nor­
wegian humanitarian assistance. Norway will con­
tinue its engagement with these three Rome-based 
UN agencies, and will promote closer cooperation 
and coordination between them, not least in light of 
the reform efforts in the UN. 

Opportunities and challenges relating to biofuel 

Together with the EU, the US and other countries, 
Norway aims to increase the use of biofuel. For 
Norway, the main goal is to promote biofuel as a 
means of reducing greenhouse gas emissions. For 
the US and several other countries energy security 
is a strong incentive. 

National efforts to increase the use of biofuel 
will lead to substantial imports of such fuel – or its 
raw materials – from developing countries. 
Because developing countries have better condi­
tions for biofuel production, increased demand is 
expected to boost employment and value creation 
in agriculture. The prospect of increased export 
revenues is an important factor for developing 
countries that are considering converting some of 
their arable land to energy production. For some 
developing countries, biofuel could become a 
major export. For others, the various requirements 
that will be stipulated for biofuel, for instance in the 
European market, will constitute a serious chal­
lenge, and for them biofuel will primarily be a 
means of improving their own energy security and 
reducing their present dependence on oil. 

But there are many challenges involved in 
ensuring that the production and use of biofuel 
results in a net reduction in greenhouse gas emis­
sions. A significant increase in the production of 
raw materials for biofuel can only be achieved by 
cultivating areas that are currently fallow, replac­
ing food production or clearing new areas. Clear­
ing areas where carbon sequestration is high will 
lead to the release of substantial amounts of green­
house gases from the vegetation and the soil. The 
climate footprint of the various biofuels produced 
will vary a great deal depending on the type of bio­
fuel, changes in land use, cultivation methods and 
processing involved. 

The extent to which biofuel production is sus­
tainable will also depend on many factors. Both the 
authorities and private sector players should give 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

  
 

42 Report No. 13 to the Storting	 2008– 2009 
Climate, Conflict and Capital 

Figure 3.5  The food crisis has led to increased focus on national food production. 
Photo: UN Photo/Fred Noy 

careful consideration to the following questions: Is 
the land actually fallow or are there traditional 
users who are unable to document their customary 
rights? Will biofuel production be at the expense of 
food production and will this weaken local and 
national food security? Will profits from production 
be reinvested or sent out of the country? Will there 
be valuable technology transfers? Could biological 
diversity be threatened? 

The Government believes it is vital to establish 
effective international sustainability criteria for 
biofuel. The EU is playing a leading role in the 
work on developing a system for sustainable bio­
fuel production, and the forthcoming directives on 
renewable energy and fuel quality include criteria 
for sustainability and reporting. The Government 
believes it is important to support the UN’s parallel 
efforts in order to ensure that the criteria estab­
lished have the maximum global legitimacy and 
include as much of the global turnover as possible. 
The EU and Norway intend to focus on the devel­
opment of second generation biofuel, or synthetic 
biofuel, which can, for example, be produced from 
waste and from cellulose from timber. This will 
again raise questions regarding the effect on the 

environment, but these fuels will compete less 
directly with ordinary food production. There is a 
great need for generating new knowledge in this 
area. This is a challenge that must be met. At the 
same time a balance must be struck between dif­
ferent considerations, if we are to succeed in 
releasing the potential of biofuel as a climate meas­
ure and source of income and energy security. 

The Government will: 

•	 increase agricultural aid as part of a broad 
international effort to strengthen the agricul­
tural sector in developing countries 

•	 support regional and international processes 
for agricultural development and food security, 
particularly in Africa, with emphasis on 
strengthening measures to adapt agriculture 
to changes in the climate 

•	 help to ensure better coordination and effec­
tiveness in international forums with regard to 
management of oceans and marine resources 

•	 focus on strengthening women’s access to 
income and employment in the food security 
context 
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Box 3.8  The seed vault in Svalbard 

The Svalbard Global Seed Vault opened in 2008, 
attracting major international interest. Samples 
of seed from the most important food plants in 
the world will be stored in the vault. These are 
seeds that are already stored in gene banks in 
other parts of the world. However, experience 
has shown that these gene banks may be at risk 
of damage and deterioration for various rea­
sons. The seed vault in Longyearbyen is inten­
ded to serve as an extra safety net for genetic 
resources that are currently stored in such 
banks and are of major importance to global 
food security. 

The establishment of the seed vault follows 
on from substantial Norwegian efforts in the 
Commission on Genetic Resources for Food and 
Agriculture (CGRFA) since the early 1990s. The 
Commission’s work is structured in a way that 
acknowledges differences between crops, 
livestock and fish in biological and ecological 
terms, as well as cultural, social and political 

variation in the use of these different food 
resources. 

In addition to participating actively in the 
negotiations on the FAO International Treaty on 
Plant Genetic Resources and Agriculture, Nor­
way has also supported the participation of 
developing countries and the arrangement of 
informal meetings aimed at ensuring progress 
in the negotiations. Support has also been chan­
nelled through FAO and the research centres of 
the Consultative Group on International Agricul­
tural Research (CGIAR). In other forums, such 
as the UN Convention on Biological Diversity, 
the World Intellection Property Organization 
(WIPO) and the World Trade Organization 
(WTO), Norway has endeavoured to play a 
bridge-building role in the policy area that has 
arisen in the interface between intellectual pro­
perty rights (patents, etc.) and genetic resour­
ces. 

•	 support efforts to clarify small farmers’ rights 
to the land they live on and cultivate, including 
land reform efforts 

•	 work towards the adoption of international 
guidelines for biofuel that are based on sus­
tainability criteria and independent scientific 
evaluations 

•	 increase focus on the connections between cli­
mate change, biofuel, agriculture and food 
security 

•	 support international research into agricul­
ture that is adapted to changes in the climate. 

3.4 Migration and development 

The links between migration and development are 
increasingly in focus. Labour migration was dis­
cussed on a broad basis during the Storting’s con­
sideration of the white paper Labour Migration 
(Report No. 18 (2007–2008) to the Storting) and 
the recommendation by the Standing Committee 
on Local Government and Public Administration. 
Some of this discussion sheds light on the links 
between migration and a broader development pol­
icy, and is included here. 

The reasons for migration from poor countries 
are many and complex. For many people, moving 

to another country is seen as an opportunity to 
improve their own and their families’ living condi­
tions, as was the case for the Norwegian migrants 
to the US in the 19th and 20th centuries. Some are 
motivated by the desire to obtain qualifications or 
work, and some are fleeing from war, persecution 
or disasters. A significant proportion of migration 
is for the purpose of family reunification. Of the 
world’s 200 million migrants, two-thirds originally 
come from developing countries, and 22 million of 
these are from the poorest countries. More than 90 
per cent of the world’s migration is labour-related. 

In an increasingly internationalised labour mar­
ket, highly qualified workers have greater opportu­
nities than those with poorer qualifications. Some 
countries, such as the Philippines, have a deliber­
ate policy of training a larger number of health 
workers than the country needs, in order to export 
the surplus to countries with higher wages. It is 
assumed that these migrants will send money 
home and thereby increase the income of family 
members who remain behind. The same applies to 
seafarers. For many years, Norwegian shipowners 
have employed Filipino seafarers who have been 
specially trained to serve on Norwegian vessels. 

In other words, while lack of development may 
seem to be the reason for migration, migration may 
also be part of the reason for lack of development, 
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as valuable competence is lost. At the same time, 
migration can also be used as an active policy 
instrument to promote development. Since those 
with the highest qualifications travel most, migra­
tion can also be a consequence of development. 

Migration will continue to increase in step with 
globalisation. It is therefore something of a para­
dox that globalisation has enabled money, goods 
and services to move very freely across national 
borders, while there are still substantial restric­
tions on people moving to other countries. 

Norway is a member of the steering committee 
for the Global Forum on Migration and Develop­
ment (GFMD). The forum focuses on three 
themes: 1) mainstreaming migrants’ human rights 
throughout the development debate, 2) harnessing 
the potential benefits of migration, and 3) policy 
and institutional coherence. In this work, Norway 
places particular emphasis on the development-
promoting effects of international migration and 
how they can be strengthened, for example in rela­
tion to private remittances and investment in devel­
opment locally. Other important themes are the 
challenges relating to the brain drain of health 
workers, HIV/AIDS-related travel restrictions and 
the fight against human trafficking. Norway places 
great emphasis on the gender perspective in 
migration policy. 

Norway’s policy in relation to migration is 
closely linked to our collaboration with the EU. 
Our association agreements on the Schengen and 
Dublin cooperation mean that we are both directly 
and indirectly affected by the policy pursued in 
Europe. 

In recent years, we have seen an increasing 
internationalisation of the EU’s migration policy. 
The EU bases its migration policy on cooperation 
and partnership with third countries. The EU is in 
the process of entering into various forms of migra­
tion cooperation with countries of origin and tran­
sit countries, with a view to formulating mutual 
interests and challenges, setting limits for cooper­
ation and mobility, and coordinating migration-
related aid from the EU countries. 

Over time the close links that are developing 
between migration policy and development policy 
in the EU will lead to significant changes in the 
union’s policy towards Africa and the countries 
east of the EU, which are home to a large number 
of potential migrants to the EU. Norway has been 
invited to participate in the development of a con­
crete collaboration between the EU and relevant 
third countries on migration and development. The 
goal is to identify cooperation projects with rele­
vant countries of origin and transit countries, that 

can help to improve living conditions and employ­
ment opportunities, and that can prevent unwanted 
migration. The Horn of Africa and East Africa have 
been mentioned as areas where it is desirable for 
Norway to contribute to the development of a new 
policy. This is due to our long experience of devel­
opment assistance in these areas. The Govern­
ment will consider further cooperation with the EU 
and relevant third countries on migration and 
development. Initially, this will involve developing 
and taking part in pilot projects in one or a few 
countries, and these efforts may be expanded sub­
sequently on the basis of the experience gained. 

Brain drain 

Research shows that migration increases in step 
with the level of education. The better qualified a 
person is, the more attractive he or she will be on 
the international labour market. Some professional 
groups are more in demand than others. Engi­
neers, for example, and people with science and 
maths qualifications are in short supply in many 
European countries. This is a favourable situation 
for those concerned, but it can entail a major loss 
for a country of origin that has a great need for the 
same human resources. 

The consequences of the brain drain are great­
est in the health sector. Worldwide, there is a dra­
matic shortage of health workers. The World 
Health Organization has estimated that more than 
4.3 million more workers are needed in the health 
sector than are currently available. More than half 
of them must be highly qualified, such as doctors, 
nurses and midwives. 

The shortage is most serious in the poorest 
countries, where the health challenges are great­
est. While lifestyle-related diseases such as cancer, 
diabetes and cardiovascular disease dominate the 
picture in rich countries, the main health chal­
lenges for many countries in Africa are still infec­
tious diseases such as malaria, measles and tuber­
culosis. However, a steadily increasing group of 
people in these countries are also contracting dis­
eases that are related to lifestyle factors such as 
poor diet, inactivity and increased consumption of 
alcohol and tobacco. On top of this, Africa is also 
hardest hit by the AIDS epidemic, which is putting 
health services under a great deal of strain at the 
same time as health workers are also affected by 
the disease. Together, these factors constitute a 
burden on African health services that is difficult 
for them to deal with themselves. It is therefore 
unfortunate, and in many people’s opinion unethi­
cal, for rich countries to pursue an active recruit­
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Box 3.9  Children and migration 

Children are affected by migration in two 
ways: some are themselves migrants, and 
some are left behind in their home country by 
one or both parents. 

Children who cross borders are at particu­
lar risk of human trafficking, abuse and 
exploitation. On arrival in a new country, they 
can easily become victims of discrimination, 
social marginalisation and poverty. Many live 
in fear of being arrested and sent back home. 
Although we do not have figures for the num­
ber of children who migrate, we do know that 
the number of migrant children moving from 
one developing country to another is conside­
rably higher than the number of migrant chil­
dren moving to developed countries. 

In countries such as Moldova and the Phi­
lippines, up to 30 per cent of minors have 
been left behind by one or both parents. Stu­
dies indicate that it is the oldest children who 
suffer most. They are also more at risk of 
drug and alcohol problems, early pregnancy, 
mental health problems and criminal behavi­
our. 

UNICEF (United Nations Children’s 
Fund) is currently studying the extent to 
which children are affected by migration, the 
effects this has on them and what measures 
can be taken to safeguard their interests. 
UNICEF also helps national authorities to 
develop policy in this area. 

ment policy among African health workers to meet 
their domestic needs. 

The issue is complex and full of dilemmas. 
Many health workers wish to travel to a country 
where their work will be different and income 
higher. Prohibiting the migration of health work­
ers would be a violation of human rights. At the 
same time, however, there is a desperate need for 
their labour in their home countries, which, in 
many cases, have invested considerable resources 
in their training. The inhabitants of these countries 
have an enshrined right to access to health serv­
ices. The migration of skilled workers, and health 
professionals in particular, is an example of how 
conflicts can easily arise between the interests of 
individuals and the interests of society as a whole. 

Norway is playing an active part in the interna­
tional efforts to address the global challenges 
relating to health workers. The aim is to ensure 
ethical international recruitment of health workers 
and, above all, to find tools to address the situation 
in countries with the least developed health serv­
ices and the greatest shortage of health workers. 
These efforts are primarily being carried out 
within the World Health Professions Alliance and 
the World Health Organization, which are working 
to develop a common frame of reference for ethical 
recruitment, financing, training and partnerships. 
The Minister of the Environment and International 
Development represents Norway in a high-level 
group in this context. This theme is also one of the 
items on the agenda of the Global Health and For­
eign Policy network of foreign ministers. 

Reducing the migration of health workers from 
the least developed countries and regions will not 
on its own be sufficient to address the shortage of 
health professionals in these areas. The OECD 
estimates that African-born doctors and nurses 
working in OECD countries correspond to 12 per 
cent of the total estimated shortage in the region. 
In South-East Asia, the region with the greatest 
shortage of health professionals, the proportion is 
nine per cent. The figures show that the initiative 
aimed at ensuring ethical recruitment must be 
complemented by other measures to secure the 
necessary coverage of health professionals in 
these countries and regions. 

The principle underlying Norway’s policy of 
not actively recruiting from countries that have a 
shortage of health workers is set out in the 2007 
budget proposal and in the white paper Labour 
Migration. In addition, two working groups have 
been appointed that will submit reports on this 
issue to the Ministry of Health and Care Services 
and the Ministry of Foreign Affairs in spring 2009. 

The Government will: 

•	 focus on the effects of international migration 
that promote development and how they can be 
strengthened 

•	 take part in global, regional and bilateral dia­
logues on the development of policy on migra­
tion and development 

•	 play a proactive role in efforts to establish an 
international framework for ethical recruit­
ment of health workers from developing coun­
tries 

•	 consider cooperation with the EU and relevant 
third countries on migration and development. 
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4 Climate change
 

Global climate change and the loss of biological 
diversity are two of the greatest threats humanity 
has faced. Climate change reduces human security 
as a result of drought, flooding, storms, disease, 
food and water shortages, and inadequate political 
capacity to deal with these impacts. The rapid 
changes we are now seeing could lead to ecosys­
tem collapse. 

Climate change may also lead to greater dispar­
ity between social groups, between regions and 
between countries. According to the Intergovern­
mental Panel on Climate Change (IPCC), it will 
probably not be possible to limit global warming to 
no more than 2 °C above the pre-industrial level 
unless world greenhouse gas emissions are cut by 
50–85 per cent from the 1990 level by 2050. It has 
been calculated that to achieve this, global emis­

sions must begin to decline within the next ten 
years. However, even global warming of 2 °C will 
result in major changes, which now seem to be 
inevitable. 

Global climate and environmental problems 
affect everyone, but it is poor people in countries 
that are most vulnerable to change who will be 
hardest hit by climate change. Unless we address 
climate and environmental problems, the results of 
many years of development efforts will be under 
threat. 

Norway’s development policy will focus on 
reducing the vulnerability of the poorest countries 
to climate change, and will encourage countries to 
draw up forward-looking development strategies 
that are robust to climate change. The top priori­
ties for most developing countries for many years 

Figure 4.1  Climate change increases the frequency of extreme weather events. 
Photo: Abdir Abdullah/Scanpix 
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to come will be economic growth and poverty 
reduction. In its international cooperation, Norway 
will seek to assist developing countries to recog­
nise and make use of the potential that lies in fol­
lowing a more environmentally sound path of 
development than Western countries have done. 
Environmentally sound, sustainable economic 
growth and investment will be the most important 
instruments. The Government will strive to ensure 
that its climate policy and development policy rein­
force one another. This means that climate policy 
must contribute to the achievement of develop­
ment policy goals, and that development policy 
must increase capacity to achieve climate policy 
goals. The alternative to an integrated policy to 
combat poverty and climate change is failure on 
both fronts. 

4.1 Ecosystems under pressure 

More than 30 years after the first major UN confer­
ence on the environment in Stockholm in 1972 
warned against continuing to impoverish the 
world’s ecosystems, and 15 years after the adop­
tion of the Convention on Biological Diversity, the 
2005 Millennium Ecosystem Assessment docu­

mented that the Earth’s ecosystems are in serious 
danger. Climate change is having serious impacts 
on top of the great pressure people are already 
putting on the environment. 

Ecosystems do not only supply food, water, 
seed, fuel, medicines and building materials; they 
also support human society, culture, identity and 
community. They also play a part in the regulation 
of climate and water, air and soil cycles, in resist­
ance to disease, and in protection against extreme 
weather. All these functions are known as ecosys­
tem services. In principle, the Earth’s biodiversity 
and ecosystem services can provide us with a per­
petual supply of renewable resources. They pro­
vide a basis for long-term value creation, and are a 
key to the solution of many problems, both now 
and in the future. Ecosystems can also provide us 
with new medicines and new species that are suit­
able for agriculture. It is estimated that only one-
tenth of the Earth’s plants have so far been investi­
gated with a view to their potential for medical or 
agricultural purposes. 

However, species are being lost rapidly. A 
review of the most important causes of biodiversity 
loss shows that habitats are being destroyed by 
logging, agriculture and infrastructure develop­
ment. Fragmented and degraded habitats are less 

Figure 4.2  Impacts of a warmer climate. 
Source: Stern Review 
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able to withstand natural disasters and climate 
change than more continuous areas of habitat. Bio­
diversity is also reduced by overfishing and com­
petition from alien species. Depending on the 
speed and scale of global warming, climate change 
may also constitute a threat to biodiversity. 

Some hazardous chemicals are a serious threat 
to biodiversity, food supplies and the health of 
future generations. These are substances that do 
not break down readily in the environment and are 
therefore extremely persistent once they have been 
released. They can be transported over long dis­
tances from the source of pollution by air and ocean 
currents, and their concentrations build up along 
food chains. Such substances are a growing envi­
ronmental problem in developing countries, many 
of which lack adequate systems for the control and 
management of chemicals. At the same time, the 
chemical industry is growing rapidly in developing 
countries. In China and India, for example, chemi­
cal production volumes is expected to grow by 10.5 
per cent and 8 per cent respectively in the next ten 
years. At the same time, there is a tendency for pol­
luting industries to move to developing countries 
and for developed countries to send large quantities 
of hazardous waste to developing countries. 

Cooperation under the multilateral environ­
mental agreements is a key part of the Govern­
ment’s efforts to safeguard our shared environ­
ment and our livelihoods. The Norwegian Action 
Plan for Environment in Development Cooperation 
provides guidelines for Norway’s environment-
related development efforts in poor countries. Nor­
way’s International Climate and Forest Initiative is 
a major effort to secure the inclusion of emissions 
from deforestation and forest degradation in a new 
global climate regime and to safeguard other envi­
ronmental assets. The Government is also seeking 
to strengthen the United Nations Environment 
Programme (UNEP), and particularly its core 
functions, which are monitoring the state of the 
global environment and providing recommenda­
tions on the management of natural resources. 

Much of the world’s genetic diversity is found 
in developing countries, and the policies these 
countries pursue will therefore be important in 
safeguarding ecosystems and genetic resources. 
Every country has to make difficult decisions 
about the balance between growth, conservation 
and use, but most poor countries will perceive the 
development challenges they are facing as more 
urgent than management of the natural environ­
ment. Moreover, many of these countries have 
insufficient resources to give priority to specific 
conservation measures. Negotiations are cur­

rently taking place under the Convention on Bio­
logical Diversity on an international regime for 
access to genetic resources and benefit-sharing, 
and the outcome will have an important bearing on 
the ability and willingness of poor countries to pro­
tect biodiversity. The international community 
must also take more responsibility for ensuring the 
necessary funding for environmental protection. 
One possibility that the Government is reviewing 
further is to provide direct compensation for the 
maintenance of ecosystem services. 

The Government will: 

•	 support the conservation and sustainable use 
of areas and ecosystems of global importance 

•	 seek to ensure transparency in the manage­
ment of natural resources and that local com­
munities, including indigenous peoples, have 
access and rights to land and resources 

•	 support the implementation of multilateral 
agreements on chemicals, natural resources 
and biodiversity, the marine environment and 
marine resources 

•	 support the establishment of a UN panel on 
natural resources, biodiversity and ecosystem 
services under UNEP 

•	 work towards an international agreement on 
access to genetic resources and benefit-shar­
ing under the Convention on Biological Diver­
sity 

•	 contribute to the further development of mech­
anisms for payment for ecosystem services. 

4.2	 Climate change is making the 
development process more 
difficult 

Signs of climate change – changes on various 
scales in all kinds of natural phenomena – are 
being observed all over the world. However, some 
of the most serious changes that will have the most 
immediate impact on large population groups are 
related to water – either too much or too little 
water. 

Africa will experience more drought and thus 
more difficult growing conditions. In some coun­
tries, yields of crops that are dependent on rain 
water may be reduced by half. In Central and South 
Asia, yields may drop by up to 30 per cent between 
now and 2025. On the other hand, yields may rise 
for a time in temperate areas as a result of higher 
temperatures. The Himalayan glaciers are melting, 
affecting large groups of people. More frequent 
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Box 4.1  Climate change in the Himalaya region 

Ice and snow in the Himalaya-Hindu Kush 
region, a continuous mountain system covering 
almost 3.5 million km2 and stretching through 
eight different countries, supplies a fifth of the 
world’s population with water for drinking, hou­
sehold use, irrigation and electricity production. 
But the ecosystem balance in the area has been 
disturbed, and this affects both the people who 
live in the mountains and those who live in the 
fertile plains below. The IPCC has shown that as 
a result of global warming, the «water tower» of 
Asia is shrinking. The main glaciers are retrea­
ting, and smaller glaciers are disappearing alto­
gether. Pastureland is turning into desert. In 
some areas, flooding is becoming more frequ­
ent and more severe, while in others, life-giving 
rivers are gradually drying out. The glaciers 
that supply more than two-thirds of the water in 
the Ganges, considered a holy river by the Hin­
dus, is melting three times as fast as it was 100 
years ago. Many people fear that in a 

few decades, the Ganges will be almost dry out­
side the rainy season. In addition, the ground­
water level is gradually dropping. If these trends 
continue, the fertile agricultural areas fed by the 
Ganges, the Yangtze and the Yellow River, 
which today make India and China the world’s 
leading producers of wheat and rice, will be 
severely affected. UNEP estimates that accele­
rated ice loss in the Himalaya-Hindu Kush may 
affect about 40 per cent of the world’s popula­
tion. 

Norway is supporting a regional initiative to 
provide information on climate change in the 
region. A five-year agreement has been signed 
for the period 2008–2013. Through CICERO 
(the Center for International Climate and Envi­
ronmental Research) and UNEP/GRID-Aren­
dal, Norway is also supporting a research pro­
ject on the impacts of climate change in the 
Himalaya region. 

and more severe flooding will be a problem in the 
major low-lying river deltas. 

About half of the world’s population lives in 
coastal areas where rising sea level and extreme 
weather will have negative impacts on fisheries, 
tourism, infrastructure, agriculture and access to 
fresh water. Even a 2 °C rise in temperature will 
cause a rise in sea level that would make several 
small island states uninhabitable. 

A 2007 study from the Organisation for Eco­
nomic Cooperation and Development (OECD) 
shows that Shanghai, Miami, New York, Alexandria 
and New Orleans will be among the cities where 
exposure to flooding grows most rapidly with rising 
sea level. Many other major cities will also be 
affected unless we can mitigate climate change. 

The IPCC predicts that climate change will also 
affect the health of millions of people. For example, 
more outbreaks of disease are expected as a result 
of heatwaves, storms, wildfires and drought, and 
flooding often provides favourable conditions for 
communicable diseases. The greatest health risk is 
considered to be an increase in the distribution of 
diseases that are transmitted by vectors such as 
mosquitoes or ticks. According to the World 
Health Organization (WHO), the incidence of dis­
eases such as malaria and dengue fever will rise 
with the spread of vector organisms. 

The IPCC has predicted a considerable rise in 
the number of climate refugees in the years ahead, 
but without putting a figure on the increase. 
According to the 2006 Stern Review, a conservative 
estimate is that 150–200 million people will be per­
manently displaced by 2050 as a result of rising sea 
level, more frequent storms and more intense 
drought. Other researchers point out that climate 
change will primarily result in displacement and 
conflict at fairly local level, not between countries. 
The scale and speed of temperature rise – whether 
it happens slowly and gradually or whether we 
reach tipping points – will have a decisive effect on 
the scale of the refugee problem and the conflict 
potential associated with climate change. 

The Government will: 

•	 take part in efforts to identify the direct and 
indirect impacts of climate change on countries 
and regions. 

4.3	 Common but differentiated 
responsibilities in climate policy 

The fight against climate change is a global respon­
sibility. It can only be won if the developed coun­
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Figure 4.3  CO2 emissions 
Source: The diagrams show that in 2005, China was the second-largest emitter of CO2 in the world, just behind the US. China’s emis­
sions are growing rapidly, and China has probably now overtaken the US as the world’s largest CO2 emitter. However, emissions per 
inhabitant are still much lower in China and India.Source: World Resources Institute and CICERO 

tries take the lead and demonstrate that environ­
mentally sound economic development is possible. 
So far, these countries are also largely responsible 
for man-made greenhouse gas emissions. Moreo­
ver, the OECD countries have the largest financial 
and technological resources. This is reflected in 
the principle of «common but differentiated 
responsibilities and respective capabilities» set out 
in the United Nations Framework Convention on 
Climate Change. 

At the moment, countries that have emission 
commitments under the Kyoto Protocol are 
responsible for about 30 per cent of global green­
house gas emissions, but this proportion is drop­
ping. This means that it will not be possible to 
achieve the necessary cuts in emissions unless 
developing countries, particularly those where 
emissions are high or rising rapidly, also pull their 
weight. Annual energy-related greenhouse gas 
emissions in middle-income countries are rising 
rapidly, and are now higher than those from devel­
oped countries. However, it is also crucial for the 
US to be part of the political leadership for global 
climate policy. Unless the US takes the lead, it will 
be difficult to persuade major developing countries 
to take the necessary steps to limit their emissions. 
The signals from the Obama administration indi­
cate that the US is prepared to take this responsi­
bility. 

It is a major challenge to find ways of ensuring 
that economic and social development can take 
place in poor countries without too great a rise in 
their greenhouse gas emissions. The only way for­
ward is to facilitate a path of development based on 
recent knowledge and technology. This can make 
it possible to leapfrog some of the phases involving 

environmentally harmful technology that the 
developed countries have been through. 

To achieve this, earlier pledges to the develop­
ing countries on funding and technological cooper­
ation must be honoured. The international climate 
change negotiations under the Climate Change 
Convention and the Kyoto Protocol have so far 
involved a tug-of-war on the distribution of burdens 
and rights, including the issue of how much 
responsibility the rich countries have for funding 
climate-related measures and transferring technol­
ogy to developing countries that are themselves 
experiencing rapid growth. 

The basis for the Government’s overall climate 
strategy at home and abroad was set out in the 
2007 white paper on Norwegian climate policy 
(Report No. 34 (2006–2007) to the Storting) and 
the agreement on Norwegian climate policy 
reached by most of the political parties in January 
2008. Allocations to the Government’s develop­
ment and climate policy initiatives have been 
increased in the 2008 and 2009 budgets. Norway’s 
main priorities are reducing deforestation and for-

Box 4.2  No more CO2 than Western 
countries 

«I can promise that India’s per capita CO2 
emissions will never be higher than in Wes­
tern countries.» 
Source: Indian Finance Minister Chidambaram speaking 
to Minister of the Environment and International 
Development Erik Solheim during the Bali climate sum­
mit in 2007 
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est degradation, clean energy, and the develop­
ment of technology for carbon capture and storage. 
The aim is to reduce emissions in order to allow for 
the necessary increase in energy use in developing 
countries. 

Norway will seek to foster interest in partner 
countries in sustainable natural resource manage­
ment, low-carbon energy solutions, halting defor­
estation, adaptation to climate change and preven­
tion of environmental damage. However, policy 
development is the responsibility of individual 
countries themselves. While other countries can­
not take over the process of policy development in 
poor countries, the international community and 
countries such as Norway are able and willing to 
provide expertise and funding. 

Massive support for climate change measures 
is also important as a way of increasing developing 
countries’ willingness and ability to take on com­
mitments in a future global climate regime. Nor­
way is working closely with key countries in the 
international climate negotiations. The African per­
spective has not yet been given sufficient room in 
the climate negotiations. Adaptation is the main 
challenge for Africa, but there are strong indica­
tions that Africa too can combine sustainable devel­
opment for its own people with emissions reduc­
tions of importance for the global climate. There is 
a considerable potential for reducing emissions 
related to changes in land use and deforestation in 
several of the least developed countries. 

African governments have started an impor­
tant political process with a view to defining a joint 
platform for their participation in the international 
climate dialogue. They have adopted Africa’s Cli­
mate Roadmap, which initially deals with the dia­
logue up to the Copenhagen climate summit in 
December 2009. The Climate Roadmap puts the 
environment and agro-forestry at the heart of the 
climate negotiations, and at the same time sets out 
ways of reducing poverty, promoting energy secu­
rity and safeguarding African ecosystems, land­
scapes and livelihoods. Norway wishes to support 
this African climate process. 

The Government will: 

•	 work towards a climate agreement that ensures 
that global warming is limited to no more than 
2 °C  

•	 promote the interests of the poorest and most 
vulnerable countries in the climate negotia­
tions 

•	 support the implementation of Africa’s Climate 
Roadmap. 

Figure 4.4  Solar power will be a key energy 
source in the future, as here in Afghanistan. 
Photo: Norwegian Church Aid 

4.4 Clean energy 

Rising energy use is both a result of and a key fac­
tor in development. The International Energy 
Agency believes that fossil fuels will remain the 
dominant global source of energy up to 2030. A 
sharp rise in consumption of fossil fuels is not com­
patible with limiting climate change. This means 
that a low-carbon development path and the use of 
energy from renewable sources must be given 
high priority. 

Today, some 1.6 billion people do not have 
access to electricity or other modern energy serv­
ices. Lack of access to energy is one of the most 
important obstacles to poverty reduction. Energy 
is now more essential than ever, because energy is 
a key factor for participation in the globalised busi­
ness sector and for access to global knowledge 
through the Internet and other media, and also for 
building resilience and the capacity to adapt to cli­
mate change. 

Despite the fact that world energy production 
has never been higher, it is struggling to keep pace 
with economic development in some developing 
countries and with the general rise in population. 
According to the World Bank, China is already 
increasing its energy supplies by more in a fort­
night than all the 47 sub-Saharan countries (with 
the exception of South Africa) do in a year. The 
type of energy infrastructure chosen will be highly 
significant for the outcome of the fight against cli­
mate change. 
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Figure 4.5  Hydropower is an important energy 
source in Nepal. Norwegian expertise is much in 
demand. 
Photo: Ken Opprann 

The choice of energy infrastructure will be 
determined by factors that differ from one country 
to another. In India, energy use per inhabitant is 
expected to remain at a relatively low level, and the 
country will also be able to limit its emissions if its 
plans for energy efficiency and decentralised 
renewable energy supplies are successful. India 
will also be able to make use of environmentally 
friendly hydropower in the Himalayas, even 
though ice-melt is creating uncertainty about 
trends in river levels. 

In general, the clean forms of energy are too 
expensive and access to them is too difficult in 
comparison with energy from biomass, coal and 
kerosene. Many poor and middle-income countries 
find it simpler, quicker and to some extent cheaper 
to concentrate on oil- and coal-based power sup­
plies rather than on energy efficiency or renewable 
energy sources such as hydropower or solar and 
wind power. In many developing countries, bio­
mass is still the dominant energy source. Most peo­
ple south of the Sahara will continue to use wood 
and charcoal for cooking in the near future. Unfor­
tunately, these tend to be used inefficiently and in 
ways that cause local damage to ecoystems. 

Africa has considerable undeveloped hydro­
power resources that could meet a large propor­
tion of the continent’s energy needs. Major infra­
structure projects – which must also include infra­
structure for electricity distribution – will require 
stronger regional cooperation. Hydropower instal­
lations that are built with storage reservoirs can 
also provide water for irrigation and can be used 
for flood control and regulation of water flow in 
connection with adaptation to climate change. 
However, hydropower production is vulnerable to 

changes in precipitation, and can have negative 
social impacts and impacts on biodiversity. Condi­
tions for solar power production are also very 
favourable in large parts of Africa. As the costs of 
solar power production fall, it offers particular 
potential for electrification in rural areas and in 
areas that are not on the grid. In addition, condi­
tions for using geothermal energy (heat from 
within the earth) are favourable in some African 
countries. 

As a region, Africa now has the opportunity to 
choose a planned, sustainable, robust low-carbon 
path of development. The International Energy 
Agency considers promoting renewable energy 
sources and energy efficiency to be one of the most 
cost-effective ways of increasing access to energy 
and at the same time reducing greenhouse gas 
emissions. The main task for Africa’s cooperation 
partners will be to provide a suitable framework 
and support for a sustainable and less vulnerable 
path of development based on clean energy. 

Environmentally sound solutions must also be 
cost-effective. Good, energy-effective technology 
may require higher investments initially, but such 
investments will generally be economically sound 
and commercially profitable in the long term. 
Developing countries are already paying a rela­
tively high price per energy unit. It will therefore 
be important to shift energy demand to cheaper, 

Box 4.3  Experience gained by SN Power 

Through the development of SN Power, 
which is owned by Norfund and Statkraft, 
Norway made an early start in investing in 
energy production in developing countries. 
The company’s portfolio has performed satis­
factorily, and it has built up a great deal of 
experience that will be valuable in promoting 
greater investment in clean energy. Other 
power companies and various types of inves­
tors are showing an interest in this market. 

In January 2009, a subsidiary of SN Power 
was established to intensify energy-related 
efforts in poor countries. This is a priority 
task but one that requires special planning 
and follow-up. SN Power AfriCA is to focus on 
energy investments in Africa and Central 
America. Efforts are being made to widen 
ownership of this company beyond Norfund 
and Statkraft, which will require mobilisation 
of private capital from Norwegian energy 
companies. 



 

 

 
 

 

 

 
 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

   

 
 

 

 
 

53 2008– 2009 Report No. 13 to the Storting 
Climate, Conflict and Capital 

Box 4.4 Global Energy Efficiency and 
Renewable Energy Fund 

The Government has committed NOK 80 mil­
lion to the new Global Energy Efficiency and 
Renewable Energy Fund (GEEREF). This is a 
public-private partnership initiated by the 
European Commission, and Norway and Ger­
many are the first two public donors to the 
fund. Altogether, the European Commision, 
Germany and Norway have undertaken to 
contribute EUR 100 million to the fund in the 
next four years. The purpose is to attract com­
mercial capital for investments in climate-rela­
ted measures and clean energy. Private inves­
tors will be given priority when returns on the 
fund are allocated. Any returns on contribu­
tions from public investors will be re-invested 
in the fund. 

renewable or more energy-efficient technologies. 
We should draw these countries’ attention to all the 
advantages of making use of their own renewable 
energy resources – in relation to public health, 
national energy security and reduced economic 
dependence on international oil prices. 

Adaptations of the best technology, products, 
services and organisation models from developed 
countries can also promote sustainable develop­
ment. 

Norway’s role 

As an energy nation, Norway is well placed to 
assist developing countries in their efforts to 
address energy-related challenges. This is part of 
the backdrop to our Clean Energy for Develop­
ment initiative, which is intended to provide a 
framework for all Norwegian aid in this field. The 
initiative includes poverty-reduction projects, for 
example on electrification in rural areas using solar 
power, more efficient wood-burning stoves and 
improved charcoal production, as well as larger-
scale projects such as hydropower developments, 
wind farms and solar farms connected to the elec­
tricity grid. The initiative will also involve stepping 
up Norway’s energy efficiency efforts, since this is 
a way of increasing the energy supply quickly with­
out the side effects associated with all other types 
of new energy capacity, and will also help to pre­
vent development that is associated with unneces­
sarily high levels of energy use. 

Bilateral energy cooperation is in principle neu­
tral with regard to technology choices. Norway’s 
contributions should be based on demand, and on 
countries’ own plans and priorities. The demand is 
often related to hydropower, which is the field 
where Norway has most expertise to offer, and a 
highly-developed industry that is interested in tak­
ing part in projects in developing countries. Nor­
way can be a useful partner for countries that are 
interested in hydropower as an energy solution. 
But Norway is also winning recognition as a part­
ner in solar technology, and this is being used 
actively in development assistance. Norway’s 
efforts in these areas can provide valuable technol­
ogy and know-how, and projects benefit from the 
equipment, knowledge and training provided by 
the business sector. Strategic use of aid funding in 
combination with industry expertise will provide 
major benefits. 

In multilateral energy cooperation, Norway 
focuses on making use of the comparative advan­
tages of different organisations, seeking to ensure 
that projects complement each other, and encour­
aging the closest possible collaboration. The devel­
opment banks are an important channel for fund­
ing efforts to improve access to energy and energy 
efficiency measures. The World Bank is in a partic­
ularly good position in this respect, because it oper­
ates both at country and global level, is engaged in 
most sectors, and has a variety of tools at its dis­
posal – grants, loans and investments. The bank 
can encourage the private sector to invest in cli­
mate friendly energy and technology, and can 
lower the threshold for investing in countries 
where framework conditions are difficult and the 
level of risk is high. 

Conditions for energy investments have 
improved considerably in a number of poor coun­
tries in recent years, and many developing coun­
tries can now provide a stable political climate for 
investors. Profitability has also improved because 
economic growth is creating a growing demand for 
energy, and because efforts to promote reform in a 
range of sectors, strengthen legislation and build 
up institutions have given results in a number of 
countries. However, energy projects in developing 
countries are complex, and the level of risk is still 
higher than in richer countries. Substantial public 
funding is needed to encourage private investment. 
Public funding reduces some of the risk factors for 
private investors. The financial crisis has resulted 
in uncertainty about the scale of private invest­
ments, particularly in poor countries, and this 
highlights the need for public funding. 
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Many of the respondents to the consultation on 
the report of the Policy Coherence Commission 
have suggested that a small share of the Govern­
ment Pension Fund – Global should be earmarked 
for new investments in environmental technology 
or in developing countries. This and other propos­
als related to the fund will be considered in connec­
tion with the Government’s evaluation and revision 
of the ethical guidelines for the Government Pen­
sion Fund – Global. 

The Government will: 

•	 use aid funding strategically to achieve rapid 
energy-related technological advances in devel­
oping countries 

•	 give higher priority to energy efficiency meas­
ures and work towards strategic energy plan­
ning in development cooperation 

•	 use aid and other public funding catalytically to 
trigger private investments in clean energy. 

4.5 Deforestation 

Forests are a resource of enormous value at global, 
national and local level. Millions of poor people are 
dependent on forests for their livelihoods. Forests 
provide services such as water storage, flood con­
trol, food and medicines, and are home to much of 
the world’s biological heritage. Forests also store 
carbon and will therefore be part of the solution to 
the problem of climate change. 

Emissions from deforestation and forest degra­
dation in developing countries account for about 20 
per cent of global greenhouse gas emissions today. 
Conservation of natural forests is a cost-effective 
way of avoiding CO2 emissions. Afforestation and 
reforestation also reduce CO2 emissions, and are 
the only types of forest-related projects that are 
approved for use under the Kyoto Protocol’s Clean 
Development Mechanism. Emissions from defor­
estation and forest degradation in developing coun­
tries are not included in the Climate Change Con­
vention or the Kyoto Protocol. Norway is working 
towards the inclusion of commitments and mecha­
nisms to reduce emissions from deforestation in 
developing countries in a global climate change 
regime for the period after 2012. However, the 
scale of these emissions makes it important to start 
forest-related projects as soon as possible, before a 
new agreement is in place. 

Drivers of deforestation 

Deforestation is not simply due to a lack of incen­
tives to protect forests: the causes are complex and 
related to various alliances and interests. We will 
have no guarantee that funds or market mecha­
nisms intended to reduce emissions from deforest­
ation and land-use change will work unless we take 
into account issues relating to power and capital in 
individual countries. The political will in forest 
countries to deal with the underlying causes of 
deforestation will be of crucial importance. 

Globally, the most important driver of deforest­
ation is the need for new agricultural areas. Grants 
for converting forest to soy and oil palm plantations 
encourage deforestation. So does the often over-
dimensioned pulp and paper industry. In many 
cases, plantations are unable to provide sufficient 
timber as raw material, and in Indonesia it is esti­
mated that more than half comes from natural for­
ests and protected areas. Organised crime and cor­
ruption play an important role in deforestation. 
Forest fires are responsible for large greenhouse 
gas emissions every year. Deliberate burning is 
the simplest way of clearing forest for other pur­
poses. 

In Central African countries, many years of war 
have kept the deforestation rate low. However, this 
could change quickly, since many licences have 
been issued for commercial logging. 

In Brazil, there are unresolved tensions 
between conservation and development interests. 
It is estimated that at least 60 per cent of all logging 
in the Amazon basin is illegal – in Indonesia, the 
figure may be higher than 70 per cent. The World 
Bank estimates that this costs tropical forest coun­
tries USD 15 million per year in lost revenues and 
economic growth, or more than eight times the aid 
provided for sustainable forest management. The 
situation is exacerbated by a lack of transparency 
in the complicated and often corrupt systems for 
issuing licences and inadequate monitoring of 
compliance with licences. 

The EU and the World Bank have started proc­
esses in relevant regions to reduce illegal logging 
and trade in tropical timber. These may be of cru­
cial importance in improving enforcement of the 
legislation and facilitating better governance of the 
forest sector. However, legal logging is not neces­
sarily sustainable in social, ecological or economic 
terms. There are several certification systems, but 
they do not provide adequate guarantees that trop­
ical forest products are sustainable. To achieve sus­
tainable forestry and maintain the capacity of for­
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Figure 4.6  Sources of greenhouse gas emissions 
Source: IPCC; WRI/CAIT 

ests to absorb carbon, they must be based on the 
principles of sustainable forest management. 

Norway’s International Climate and Forest Initiative 

Norway’s Climate and Forest Initiative is a strate­
gic approach to dealing with climate change. It is 
intended to bring about substantial, verifiable 
reductions in emissions from deforestation and for­
est degradation in developing countries. The aim is 
for these emissions to be regulated in a new inter­
national climate regime, and projects will be cho­
sen with a view to gaining experience that can be 
used in this connection. 

In line with the decision made at the climate 
summit in Bali in 2007, most projects in the prelim­
inary phase of the initiative are demonstration and 
pilot projects, and focus on capacity building and 
support for the development of national strategies. 
If a new and more comprehensive climate regime 
is put in place for the period after 2012, it may be 
possible to carry out large-scale projects to reduce 
emissions from deforestation and forest degrada­
tion. 

A credible system for monitoring and reporting 
emissions is essential if measures to reduce defor­
estation are to be included in a new climate regime. 
Through the initiative, the Government wishes to 
play a part in developing international and national 
capacity for measuring and verifying emissions 
from deforestation and forest degradation. Emis­
sions must be reported at national level to ensure 

that reducing logging in one area does not result in 
more logging in another and thus cause carbon 
leakage. It is also important to prevent carbon leak­
age at international level, between countries and 
regions. 

Efforts to reduce greenhouse gas emissions 
from deforestation are inextricably linked with pov­
erty reduction and sustainable economic develop­
ment. This recognition is an important basis for the 
initiative. In the long term, it will be impossible to 
achieve permanent global reductions in emissions 
from deforestation without ensuring sustainable 
economic development for people who live in and 
around the forests. Financial mechanisms, com­
pensation for ecosystem services, formalisation of 
user and property rights and rights to the carbon in 
forests, and the productivity of surrounding agri­
cultural areas are all factors that will be very impor­
tant for the long-term results of the initiative and 
for winning developing countries’ support for the 
inclusion of emissions from deforestation and for­
est degradation in a new climate regime. 

The initiative includes activities in all three of 
the most important tropical rain forest regions. 
Examples are direct contributions to the Amazon 
Fund in Brazil, and cooperation with several other 
donors, including the UK via the African Develop­
ment Bank, in the Congo basin. Norway is also pro­
viding support through the UN for the preparation 
of national strategies to reduce emissions from 
deforestation and forest degradation in Papua New 
Guinea and Indonesia. In addition, there are activi­
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Figure 4.7  Half of the world’s remaining tropical rain forest is in the Amazon basin. Brazil is therefore an 
important climate policy partner. 
Photo: Espen Røst 

ties in areas of dry tropical forest and savanna, 
including cooperation with Tanzania on emissions 
reduction and the restoration of deforested areas. 

Norway provides much of its funding through 
multilateral channels, including the UN and the 
World Bank. Norway has also been instrumental in 
bringing about cooperation between the relevant 
UN organisations on the UN Collaborative Pro­
gramme on Reduced Emissions from Deforesta­
tion and Forest Degradation (UN REDD). In the 
first phase of the programme, funding is primarily 
being used for capacity- and competence-building, 
while in later phases the focus will shift to the 
implementation of national plans for reducing 
deforestation and for sustainable forest manage­
ment. 

We will not be able to achieve a new climate 
agreement if poor countries are left to meet the 
costs of reducing emissions from deforestation by 
themselves. Large-scale international transfers of 
capital will be needed. Compensation for avoiding 
deforestation must be high enough to compete 
with the profits that can be made from existing 
ways of using forests. 

The Government will: 

•	 work towards rapid, cost-effective and verifia­
ble reductions in greenhouse gas emissions 
from forest areas 

•	 promote the conservation of natural forests to 
ensure carbon storage, protect poor people 
and indigenous peoples, and conserve biodi­
versity 

•	 work towards the inclusion of emissions from 
deforestation in a new international climate 
regime. 

4.6 Adaptation to climate change 

Throughout history, people have had to develop 
strategies to adapt to variations in the climate. 
However, given the scale, pace and unpredictabil­
ity of the changes that are now taking place, it 
seems unlikely that traditional adaptation strate­
gies will be adequate in the future. Rapid climate 
change will particularly affect public health, indus­
trial structure and settlement patterns. Large-scale 
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Box 4.5  The role of indigenous peoples in sustainable forest management 

One billion people live in or near forests and 
depend on them for their livelihoods. A very 
large proportion of the world’s roughly 350 mil­
lion indigenous people have strong links and 
traditional rights to forests. However, they are 
often unable to assert or formalise their right to 
gain a livelihood from forests, or contribute to 
sustainable forest management. Indigenous 
peoples do not necessarily protect forests, but 
under the right circumstances and if they have 
statutory rights, many indigenous peoples will 
see that it is in their own interests to play a part 
in maintaining forests and the biodiversity on 
which they depend for their livelihoods. 

Norway has ratified Convention (No. 169) 
concerning Indigenous and Tribal Peoples in 
Independent Countries, which was adopted by 
the International Labour Organisation in 1989, 
and also, with certain reservations, endorsed 
the UN declaration on the rights of indigenous 
peoples (2007). However, only a few of the most 
important tropical forest countries have done 
so. In many of these countries, indigenous 
peoples have no specific rights at all. In others, 
their traditional rights to particular areas of 

forest are disregarded in connection with infra­
structure development, prospecting for mine­
rals, logging or conversion of land for agricul­
ture. Thus, there is a disparity between the 
rights indigenous peoples have under internati­
onal law and the role they are allowed to play in 
practice in managing the forests on which they 
depend. 

Where indigenous peoples’ rights are recog­
nised, for example in indigenous peoples’ terri­
tories in Brazil, we see that they protect forests 
in conservation areas more effectively than the 
national authorities. Unless indigenous peoples 
and local communities are given a greater role 
to play in forest management, there is a serious 
risk that more extensive climate-related restric­
tions on the use of tropical forests in regions 
such as Central Africa and Southeast Asia will 
put further restrictions on resource use by 
these groups. This may also reduce their inte­
rest in maintaining forests and force more of 
them into illegal logging. This in turn would 
make it less likely that cuts in emissions achie­
ved through an international mechanism would 
be permanent. 

changes in water supplies and rainfall will affect 
food security and infrastructure. But slower and 
less obvious changes may also have major impacts 
on human health and the economy, especially in 
societies where adaptation capacity is low. The 
social and political dimensions of climate change 
are often underestimated. 

The severity of the impacts of climate change 
will depend on society’s and individuals’ vulnerabil­
ity and adaptation capacity. Adaptation capacity is 
determined by access to capital, labour, knowl­
edge, health services, transport and communica­
tions, social relations and networks. Factors such 
as good governance, access to resources and an 
active civil society are important. Measures to 
strengthen a society’s capacity to take joint action 
will boost its ability to deal with climate change and 
natural disasters. 

It is also important to make use of women’s 
knowledge of local natural resources, food security 
and ways of reducing various forms of vulnerability 
in adaptation efforts. 

2007 was the first year when globally, more peo­
ple lived in urban than in rural areas. According to 

the World Bank, 75 per cent of the world’s poor still 
live in rural areas. Nevertheless, 80 per cent of the 
world’s urban population will be living in develop­
ing countries by 2030. By then, seven-tenths of the 
world population will live in Africa and Asia. 
According to the UN, much of the growth in world 
population during this century will consist of poor 
people who will be in a very vulnerable situation as 
regards access to food and energy, climate change, 
and other factors. Growing towns and cities 
urgently need to draw up plans to reduce vulnera­
bility, take steps towards a low-carbon future, and 
choose climate-friendly alternatives for infastruc­
ture, services and markets. 

The impacts of climate change must be consid­
ered in the context of other development proc­
esses. Adaptation strategies must be based on 
countries’ own development strategies. Climate 
change must be taken into account in plans and 
strategies for agriculture, water resource manage­
ment, forest management, energy, health, and 
knowledge and education. The integration of cli­
mate change considerations into social planning at 
local and national level will be a key to successful 
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Figure 4.8  Clean water is in short supply in many 
developing countries 
Photo: Fredrik Schjander 

adaptation. Adaptation efforts must also reduce the 
vulnerability of the urban poor. 

Incorporating mitigation and adaptation meas­
ures into development policy is an important task 
internationally. Many development measures also 
help to reduce vulnerability and increase adapta­
tion capacity. However, more attention must be 
paid to reducing vulnerability, improving the 
capacity to cope with disasters, and participation at 
local level. This was also highlighted by the Stand­
ing Committee on Foreign Affairs in its recommen­
dations to the Storting on the white paper 
Norwegian Policy on the Prevention of Humanita­
rian Crises (Report No. 9 (2007–2008) to the Stort­
ing). Particularly at the present stage, when we are 
negotiating a new global climate regime, it is 
important to promote a broad approach to adapta­
tion to climate change and disaster prevention. We 
must invest in the whole range of adaptation meas­
ures, from emergency preparedness and crisis 

management to reconstruction and long-term 
development efforts. 

The Government will: 

•	 encourage partner countries to include adapta­
tion to climate change in social planning and 
national development strategies, in order to 
build resilience to climate change 

•	 promote the integration of adaptation to cli­
mate change and the prevention of humanitar­
ian crises into development cooperation 

•	 seek to strengthen women’s influence on natu­
ral resource management. 

4.7	 The costs of adaptation and 
mitigation 

The costs involved in dealing with the problem of 
climate change will be formidable. There are major 
challenges involved in mobilising the resources 
that will be needed to stabilise the climate system, 
which is a global public good. This is not only a 
matter of willingness and ability. It will also require 
political and economic creativity and innovation. 
An important first step is to distinguish between 
the costs of essential measures to cut greenhouse 
gas emissions and essential adaptation measures. 
A suitable framework must be provided to encour­
age business and industry globally to play a key 
role in developing and deploying emission abate­
ment technology. Governments must play a more 
direct role in funding and implementing adaptation 
measures. 

The scale of the challenges involved in adapta­
tion varies greatly from one country to another. 
Far-reaching measures will be needed in countries 
that have not contributed significantly to green­
house gas emissions and that do not have the 
resources to fund the necessary adaptation meas­
ures. How much funding should be provided for 
adaptation measures and how funds should be 
managed are key topics in the climate negotiations. 
A special Adaptation Fund has been established 
under the Climate Change Convention/Kyoto Pro­
tocol, and the Government keeps the need to 
increase allocations to this and the other climate 
funds under review. It is important to ensure that 
the Adaptation Fund starts to invest in specific  
projects that can make a constructive contribution 
to international efforts. Norway is one of the larg­
est voluntary contributors to activities organised 
by the Convention secretariat to build up expertise 
on climate negotiations and assist poor countries in 
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Box 4.6  Adaptation to climate change in Bangladesh 

Bangladesh is particularly vulnerable to climate 
change, since it consists largely of a low-lying 
delta situated between the Bay of Bengal, which 
is regularly hit by cyclones, and the melting gla­
ciers of the Himalayas. The country is heavily 
dependent on agriculture and very densely 
populated. Climate change is already having an 
impact here. Flooding is becoming more severe, 
and cyclones are stronger and more unpredicta­
ble. The scale of the damage has increased. 
Large areas of formerly productive rice paddies 
are being flooded by sea water, making rice pro­
duction impossible. Erosion along rivers has 
worsened, and houses are constantly having to 
be moved to prevent them from being washed 
away. 

The Bangladeshi authorities have been wor­
king systematically in recent years to prevent 
disasters, introduce better early warning sys­
tems, build enough cyclone and flood shelters, 
and adapt to climate change, both now and in 
the future. The problems are overwheming, but 
a great deal has been achieved. New rice varie­
ties have been developed that tolerate higher 
salinity. In many places, farmers have switched 
from growing rice to crab farming. Construction 

techniques have been changed so that houses 
are more robust than before, and often built on 
artificially raised ground to reduce the risk that 
they will be destroyed by flooding. Steps have 
been taken to prevent landslides along river 
banks. Families are keeping ducks instead of 
chickens. Floating-bed cultivation techniques 
have been developed – floating platforms are 
constructed on which many kinds of crops can 
be grown, including tomatoes and onions. This 
prevents crops from being lost during floods. 

Good progress has also been made in 
developing early warning and evacuation sys­
tems. Early warning systems have been impro­
ved and more cyclone and flood shelters are 
available. In many cases, the shelters also 
accommodate livestock, which makes it easier 
for farmers to agree to evacuation. 

Bangladesh has taken climate change seri­
ously, and other countries have much to learn 
from its example. Systematic efforts do give 
results. Cyclone Sidr in November 2007 was one 
of the strongest to strike Bangladesh for many 
years, but caused far fewer deaths than similar 
storms have done earlier, and fewer than cyclo­
nes in the neighbouring country of Burma. 

developing and refining their positions in the cli­
mate negotiations. 

Norway is contributing to capacity building for 
environment and climate issues through support 
to the UN Environment Programme (UNEP), the 
UN Development Programme (UNDP) and the 
World Bank. These organisations are working 
together to put African countries in a better posi­
tion to make use of the funding opportunities 
offered by the Clean Development Mechanism. 
The Global Environment Facility (GEF), which is 
the financial mechanism for the main multilateral 
environmental agreements, allocates project funds 
to the most appropriate organisations. The GEF 
provides support for all aspects of climate-related 
work, and assesses the results on the basis of the 
priorities set by the conferences of the parties for 
each convention. 

However, it is obvious that adaptation to climate 
change will require far greater resources than the 
various funds can provide. Nor will development 
aid be sufficient. Norway is cooperating with other 

actors, including the EU, to put in place public-pri­
vate partnerships to mobilise capital. Adaptation 
requires a long-term perspective and predictable 
funding on an adequate scale, beyond the contribu­
tion made by the existing financial mechanisms. 
The question of future funding is therefore of key 
importance in the negotiations on a new climate 
agreement to be concluded in Copenhagen at the 
end of 2009. 

The framework conditions must be designed to 
take into account the business sector’s natural 
focus on profitability and new market opportuni­
ties, so that this sector can become the main driver 
of a low-carbon path of development. For this to 
happen, there must be a price on carbon, and the 
Government is therefore working towards the 
establishment of a global carbon price. A high car­
bon price will also encourage the development of 
alternative forms of energy. Dealing with the prob­
lem of climate change will require broad-based 
efforts by the public authorities, including strate­
gic use of aid to ensure that renewable technology 
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is developed and made commercially available in 
all countries. 

At present, the cost of emitting carbon is too 
low to generate the rapid technological advances 
needed. Despite the establishment of regional 
emissions trading markets (for example the EU 
scheme), and despite the fact that both the Kyoto 
Protocol and national policy instruments to cut 
emissions send price signals that encourage 
change and innovation, there is still great uncer­
tainty about how these systems will develop in the 
future. The long-term price signals must therefore 
be strengthened. 

The World Bank has established an innovative 
carbon fund, the Carbon Partnership Facility, as a 
signal that the carbon market will continue to oper­
ate after 2012, even though a new climate agree­
ment has not yet been achieved. The fund provides 
a guarantee for carbon purchases after 2012 
through partnerships between future buyers and 
sellers. It also provides incentives to plan for the 
use of clean technology in major infrastructure 
projects that are being developed today. This will 
help in the establishment of a long-term carbon 
market, and is an initiative Norway supports. 

Box 4.7  Norwegian proposal for 
auctioning of emission allowances 

Norway is working towards the successful 
conclusion of an international climate agre­
ement to follow on from the Kyoto Protocol, 
to be signed at the climate summit in Copen­
hagen in December 2009. One of the key 
questions to be resolved is how adaptation 
measures are to be funded in poor countries. 
Norway has put forward a proposal for a sys­
tem that could release large-scale funding for 
adaptation in poor, vulnerable countries. Brie­
fly, the proposal is that, assuming the new cli­
mate agreement is based on a cap-and-trade 
system, like the Kyoto Protocol, a certain pro­
portion of the total quantity of emission allo­
wances should be auctioned internationally. 
The revenues should be used among other 
things to fund adaptation measures in the 
most vulnerable countries and regions. These 
revenues would vary depending on the size of 
the emissions trading market (which is deter­
mined by where the emissions ceiling is set) 
and the proportion of the allowances auctio­
ned. But this model could provide a predicta­
ble and adequate flow of income. 

The Government’s initiative for the develop­
ment of carbon capture and storage (CCS) technol­
ogy is relevant in both the climate and the develop­
ment context. The goal is for such technology to be 
commercially available throughout the world, so 
that it results in cuts in greenhouse gas emissions 
that really make a difference and allows for an 
increase in energy use, particularly in developing 
countries. In the current situation, CCS appears to 
be necessary as a supplement to renewable energy 
and energy efficiency. The greatest potential for 
using this technology is in connection with large 
point sources of emissions and in countries where 
emissions are rising rapidly. Spreading CCS tech­
nology to developing countries is part of the Gov­
ernment’s long-term strategy, but for now the main 
focus is on projects at national and international 
level with a view to developing the technology 
itself. It may also be appropriate to provide devel­
oping countries with technical assistance and sup­
port for project planning and risk reduction in con­
nection with CCS. Certain activities with clear 
development effects will be eligible for funding 
over the development budget. 

Under the Clean Development Mechanism 
(CDM), developed countries can fund projects to 
reduce emissions in developing countries and thus 
acquire emission credits that can be offset against 
their emission commitments. Such projects can 
also contribute to sustainable development in 
recipient countries. It is up to recipient countries to 
determine whether this is the case. By the end of 
2008, there were just under 1300 approved CDM 
projects, which are expected to generate emission 
credits corresponding to almost 1.4 billion tonnes 
of CO2. 

Norwegian companies can make use of CDM 
emission credits to meet their commitments under 
the Norwegian emissions trading scheme. In addi­
tion, Norway intends to purchase a substantial 
number of emission credits as part of its efforts to 
meet its Kyoto commitment and its voluntary goal 
of strengthening this commitment. Currently, 
about NOK 7 billion has been allocated for this pur­
pose. The Government is considering various 
approaches that could make the Clean Develop­
ment Mechanism a more important source of fund­
ing for investments in Africa as well. 

The Government will: 

•	 work towards international mechanisms to 
mobilise resources for reliable long-term fund­
ing of adaptation to climate change in develop­
ing countries 
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•	 offer private-public partnerships to promote 
technology cooperation and transfer to devel­
oping countries 

•	 further develop an international framework 
that will make business and industry a driver 
in the development of a low-carbon society 

•	 take steps to ensure that Norway’s purchases 
of emission units through the Clean Develop­

ment Mechanism are in line with our develop­
ment policy goals 

•	 support projects to develop and deploy tech­
nologies for carbon capture and storage to 
reduce greenhouse gas emissions and allow 
for the necessary increase in energy use in 
developing countries. 
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5 Conflict
 

Since the end of the Cold War, the number of 
armed conflicts has steadily fallen. The number of 
people killed in wars has been substantially 
reduced. Nevertheless, war and armed conflict 
continue to be among the most serious challenges 
for development policy. Armed conflict impedes 
development. Poor countries have twice as high a 
risk of being affected by armed conflict as other 
countries. 

The pattern of conflict today is different to what 
it was a few decades ago. Today, more than nine 
out of ten armed conflicts are civil wars between 
groups struggling for secession and independence 
or fighting for power and resources. An increas­
ingly large proportion of the world’s conflicts today 
are in countries with petroleum resources. 

Instability and war have repercussions far 
beyond the geographical centres of the conflicts 
themselves. Conflicts have consequences for the 
whole region. Insurgents cross national borders to 
acquire weapons and ammunition, and to win sup­
port in neighbouring countries. Diamonds, tropical 
timber, oil and other commodities, as well as illegal 
drugs, are sources of income that can fuel contin­
ued conflict. These goods find a way out of the war-
torn country via neighbouring countries. People 
forced to flee their homes in civil wars tend to seek 
refuge in other parts of their country or in neigh­
bouring countries in the region. 

Conflict can also have more far-reaching, inter­
national consequences. The protection of refugees 
is an international responsibility, as is set out in the 
UN Convention Relating to the Status of Refugees. 
Other visible consequences are increased interna­
tional crime and terrorism. Conflicts in countries 
such as Afghanistan, Iraq and Somalia have conse­
quences for Norway. 

The recognition of these repercussions has 
resulted in issues that previously belonged to sep­
arate spheres of foreign, security and development 
policy now being seen as interlinked. Security is a 
precondition for political, social and economic 
development, which is in turn a precondition for 
lasting peace and stability. Efforts are needed at 
different levels, and it is important to ensure coor­
dination between what is done at national, regional 
and global level. 

Promoting development in countries that are 
affected by internal armed conflict is one of the 
hardest development policy tasks. The security 
perspective is shifting from relations between 
states, towards a stronger focus on humanitarian 
aspects and human rights issues. It is also impor­
tant that greater emphasis is given to gender equal­
ity and the inclusion of all social groups in both 
conflict resolution and the development of a more 
peaceful society. 

The political response to these challenges is to 
increase our engagement in conflict resolution, 
provide more effective support for peacebuilding 
in fragile states, strengthen focus on human secu­
rity through a rights-based approach, ensure a 
more coherent approach to peace- and state-build­
ing, and strengthen the capacity and role of 
regional actors. 

5.1 Poverty and conflict 

Poverty in itself is not a cause of conflict, but the 
majority of armed conflicts are to be found in the 
poorest parts of the world. The risk of being 
affected by armed conflict is minimal in the coun­
tries with the highest scores on the UN Human 

Box 5.1 Risk of conflict 

Statistical analyses have identified factors that 
particularly increase the risk of conflicts beco­
ming violent: 
• dependence on primary commodity 

exports 
• dispersed settlement patterns 
• a history of conflict, particularly where 

there are strong diaspora communities 
outside the country 

• a low level of education and high popula­
tion growth 

• one dominant ethnic majority 
• low income and slow economic growth 
Source: Paul Collier, The Bottom Billion, 2007 
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Figure 5.1  Armed conflicts, 2007. 
Source: International Peace Research Institute, Oslo (PRIO), 2008 

Development Index. Almost all new conflicts arise 
in the countries with the lowest scores. Great fluc­
tuations in food and energy prices can lead to social 
and political unrest. Together with the effects of cli­
mate change, these factors increase the level of 
tension and can have a destabilising effect in the 
country concerned. 

War causes humanitarian crises and exacer­
bates poverty; economic growth and development 
help to prevent war. Fragile states are particularly 

Box 5.2  Conflict minerals and 
the DR Congo 

The extraction of minerals is an important 
source of income for armed groups in DR 
Congo. In addition to diamonds and gold, par­
ticular attention has been drawn to coltan, 
which is used in various electronic products 
such as mobile phones, DVD players and 
computers. Some of the mining activities are 
illegal. The Norwegian Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs has initiated a study on how the 
extraction of coltan and other minerals is 
affecting the conflict in eastern Congo. 

vulnerable and are hardest hit. The economic costs 
associated with war are huge. Economic develop­
ment is severely weakened. 

Fragile states do not have a power structure 
that is capable of stopping violence or ensuring 
respect for the law. In such countries there is often 
considerable potential for recruitment to armed 
groups. Young men without jobs or prospects for 
the future are a vulnerable group. They have little 
to lose, and little sense of loyalty to a system that 
has marginalised them. People who experience 
poverty and powerlessness can be attracted to 
movements that strike out against the institutions, 
individuals or groups they hold accountable for 
inequality and injustice at both local and interna­
tional level. Without a functioning judicial system, 
there are no sanctions for committing criminal 
acts. Violence and reprisals are allowed to escalate 
without any intervention from higher authorities. 

Poor and fragile states do not necessarily 
become arenas for armed conflict. In many coun­
tries, there is intense political strife without anyone 
resorting to violence. At what point does political 
strife become violent? And what are the underlying 
causes and triggers? These questions are subject 
to significant academic debate and research. 
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The Government will: 

•	 seek to resolve armed conflicts through close 
coordination between political and diplomatic 
efforts, and allocation of funding to both 
humanitarian and development measures. 

5.2 Fragile states 

Countries that are vulnerable to, or already 
affected by, armed conflict are challenging part­
ners in development cooperation. One of Norway’s 
development policy objectives is to help states to 
reduce the damage caused by conflict and to create 
a starting point for building lasting peace. A con­
servative principle is that aid efforts should not 
increase the potential for conflict or cause addi­
tional damage. It is important that aid does not lead 
to further marginalisation of groups affected by 
the fighting, or exacerbate an already inequitable 
distribution of goods between the majority popula­
tion and minority groups. 

Fragile states tend to be weak, to lack legiti­
macy in the eyes of the general population, and to 
have insufficient control over their territory. Ineq­
uitable distribution of goods and socio-economic 
polarisation are also common. Elites in these states 
often distribute goods in a way that promotes 
dependency and cronyism. There may be divisions 
along ethnic lines. Systems for holding political 
leaders accountable are weak or non-existent. 

Intervening in situations such as these with a 
view to effecting lasting change requires not only 
insight into the country concerned, but also partic­
ular focus on building a functioning state. The state 
must be able to play a coordinating role in stabilisa­
tion and reconstruction. The need to incorporate 

Tabell 5.1  Refugees and internally displaced persons 

Box 5.3  OECD and fragile states 

In 2007, the Development Assistance Commit­
tee (DAC) of the Organisation for Economic 
Co-operation and Development (OECD) 
adopted the Principles for Good International 
Engagement in Fragile States and Situations. 
These principles were endorsed by develo­
ping countries and multilateral organisations 
at the Accra High Level Forum on Aid Effecti­
veness in 2008. The principles underline the 
importance of a coherent, closely coordinated 
donor policy, with focus on political 
diplomacy, and security and development 
measures. According to the OECD, the objec­
tive of all efforts in fragile states is state-build­
ing. 

all these elements creates a broad based and chal­
lenging development policy agenda. 

Experience from countries such as Afghanistan 
and Sudan shows that it is vital for the international 
community to improve the coordination of its 
efforts. The UN Peacebuilding Commission plays 
an important role in gathering lessons learned and 
developing integrated peacebuilding strategies. 
Norway is a key supporter of the Commission, 
which was established in 2005. The Commission 
seeks to bring together all the relevant actors – 
individual countries, regional organisations, NGOs 
and UN funds and programmes – to work towards 
a common set of goals with a clear division of 
labour and roles. The integrated strategies encom­
pass security, humanitarian efforts, human rights 
and long-term development. 

Countries with the largest numbers of refugees1 Countries with the largest number of 
internally displaced persons2 

The Palestinian Territory 
(most under UNRWA protection) 4.9 million Sudan 6.0 million 
Afghanistan 3.1 million Colombia 2.7 million3 

Iraq 2.3 million Iraq 2.8 million 
Colombia 550 000 DR Congo 1.4 million 
Sudan 523 000 Somalia 1.1 million 

1 United Nations High Commissioner for Refugees (UNHCR) 
2 Internal Displacement Monitoring Centre, Geneva 
3 2.7 million is the Colombian authorities’ own estimate, CODHES (a Colombian NGO) estimates that the number is 4.4 million 
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Figure 5.2  War and conflict force millions to flee their homes 
The UN High Commissioner for Refugees (UNHCR) has estimated that the number of refugees worldwide is around 16 million, 
including 4.6 million Palestinian refugees for whom UNRWA is responsible. A downward trend has now turned, and unfortunately 
the number of refugees seems to be increasing again. The largest groups are Palestinians, Afghans, Iraqis, Colombians and Suda­
nese. The number of internally displaced persons is estimated at 26 million, and the largest groups are in Sudan, Colombia, Iraq, DR 
Congo and Somalia.
 
Photo: Stephen Morrison/Scanpix
 

While the UN is best placed to coordinate aid 
efforts during and immediately after a conflict, the 
World Bank has gradually developed significant 
expertise in managing multi-donor funds for the 
coordination of long-term reconstruction and state-
building efforts. Norway channels assistance to 
several countries, such as Afghanistan, Sudan, 
Burundi and East Timor, through such funds. 

Previously international attention and support 
tended to fade shortly after a peace agreement had 
been signed. However, international assistance to 
fragile states has increased considerably in recent 
years. The number of peace operations has also 
increased. UN spending on peacekeeping opera­
tions has almost tripled since 2000. Norway has 
also shifted its aid focus in the same direction. The 
Government will continue to give priority to 
humanitarian assistance, peacebuilding and recon­
struction in war-affected and fragile states. Norwe­
gian efforts also include democracy building, secu­

rity sector reform and participation in peace opera­
tions. 

In fragile states, Norway mainly works through 
and in close cooperation with the UN system, the 
World Bank and NATO, and with regional organi­
sations such as the African Union (AU) and the 
Organization for Security and Co-operation in 
Europe (OSCE). NGOs – both Norwegian and 
international – are also key partners. 

War and conflict affect women and men, and 
girls and boys, in different ways. Women are gen­
erally excluded from decision-making processes in 
connection with conflict resolution and peace set­
tlements at local, national or international level. In 
response to UN Security Council resolution 1325, 
the Norwegian Government launched the 
Norwegian Government’s Action Plan for the Imple­
mentation of UN Security Council Resolution 1325 
(2000) on Women, Peace and Security. This docu­
ment sets out guiding principles for Norwegian 
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conflict-prevention and peacebuilding efforts, and 
states that women’s initiatives to create peace and 
reconciliation must be recognised and followed up. 

The experience, knowledge and resources of 
both sexes are important for creating a good foun­
dation for peace, democracy and development on 
equal terms. Norway is seeking to promote greater 
participation of women in peacebuilding processes 
at both national and international level. An impor­
tant task in this connection is recruiting more 
women to UN, NATO, EU and OSCE peace opera­
tions. Cooperation with national and international 
NGOs will be important for achieving this goal. 

The Government will: 

•	 contribute to the development of a comprehen­
sive and coordinated donor policy towards frag­
ile states that focuses on state-building in line 
with agreed international principles 

•	 help to ensure a more long-term perspective in 
international cooperation with fragile states 

•	 maintain flexibility in our development policy, 
so that we are able to provide rapid, long-term 
assistance in connection with peacekeeping 
and peacebuilding 

•	 strengthen the UN’s ability to coordinate 
active peace efforts through measures that 
encompass several objectives – security, 
humanitarian issues and peacebuilding 

•	 follow up Security Council resolution 1325 and 
ensure that gender and equality perspectives 
are included in conflict resolution and peace-
building 

Box 5.4  Security Council resolution 1325 
on women’s participation in peace efforts 

Women are often marginalised and excluded 
from decision-making processes during war 
and conflict. According to Security Council 
resolution 1325, women must participate on 
an equal footing with men at all levels and in 
all functions in order to promote lasting peace 
and security. It recognises that the active par­
ticipation of women is essential for achieving 
lasting peace, and it deals with all the ele­
ments of peace efforts – conflict prevention, 
crisis management, post-conflict recon­
struction and the establishment of rights-
based governance and humanitarian norms – 
from a gender perspective. 

•	 strengthen the World Bank’s capacity to man­
age multi-donor funds with a view to achieving 
a more long-term approach to reconstruction 
and state-building. 

5.3 Human rights and human security 

The term «human security» is used to describe a 
situation where basic human needs – for food, 
medicines, shelter and protection against violence 
– are met. This is a prerequisite for all long-term 
development. 

Our peace and reconciliation efforts are based 
on respect for and promotion of human rights. The 
UN Declaration of Human Rights is supported by 
all states. It thus has legitimacy all over the world. 
The authorities in almost all countries would prefer 
to avoid international criticism of their human 
rights performance. Therefore a situation where 
the parties to a conflict agree on the importance of 
respect for human rights, with a focus on human 
security, is a good starting point for identifying 
common ground for conflict resolution and state-
building. 

Post-conflict reconstruction must be based on 
respect for the law and human rights. Failure to 
prosecute perpetrators of abuses signals that vio­
lence is tolerated, and that armed conflict can 
break out again. But in order to ensure respect for 
the law and human rights at national level, we have 
to continue to strengthen the international legal 
order. 

The term «transitional justice» refers to proc­
esses and initiatives in a transitional phase from 
armed conflict to peace, or from dictatorship to 
democracy, that ensures a system of accountability 
for those who have committed abuses. Such proc­
esses are vital for the new regime to gain legiti­
macy and win confidence at both local and interna­
tional level. The end goal is to create a basis for rec­
onciliation and to prevent renewed conflict and 
violence. 

For a number of years, Norway has actively 
supported global efforts to prevent the perpetra­
tors of genocide, crimes against humanity and war 
crimes remaining at large. Norway played a key 
role in the process of establishing the International 
Criminal Court (ICC). The Court has already 
made its mark by taking a number of important ini­
tiatives in DR Congo, Uganda, Sudan and the Cen­
tral African Republic. 

The increased focus on fragile states places 
new demands on development actors. They have to 
take account of the fact that their efforts could 
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Figure 5.3  Norway has been a key player in the 
efforts to establish a convention banning the use, 
production and sale of cluster munitions. 
Photo: Mohammad Zaatari/Scanpix 

affect the political power balance, which could in 
turn undermine a fragile peace. In this context, the 
term «sustainability» needs to be understood in a 
broader sense, where aid is channelled to areas 
that have previously been considered to lie outside 
the purview of development policy, such as secu­
rity sector reform and the reintegration of former 
combatants. 

Disarmament and development 

The topic of disarmament and development is reg­
ularly discussed, for example at the UN General 
Assembly, which adopts an annual resolution on 
the subject. 

There are no immediate or direct links between 
disarmament and development. Nevertheless, gov­
ernments in both the North and the South could 
give priority to disarmament measures with a view 
to using freed resources for other purposes, such 
as fighting poverty. 

However, not surprisingly disarmament meas­
ures tend to be implemented by states that do not 
perceive such measures as a threat to its national 
security. For many countries, the situation today is 
unfortunately the opposite. We are seeing a trend 
towards conventional rearmament as a result of the 
increase in global tension. In Norway’s view, 
national security can be achieved at a considerably 
lower level of armament than is the case today. We 
are therefore promoting both conventional and 
nuclear disarmament. Norway always votes in sup­
port of the annual UN resolution calling for 

resources for military rearmament to be used for 
development purposes. 

Weapons of mass destruction, particularly 
nuclear weapons, pose an obvious and fundamen­
tal threat to all social and economic development. 
In this context, the financial costs of such weapons 
are of lesser importance. It is the possible use of 
these weapons that would cripple all development. 
Nuclear disarmament and non-proliferation efforts 
must therefore be considered a vital supplement to 
our development efforts. 

At the end of a war or armed conflict, large 
quantities of unexploded ordnance, such as cluster 
munitions and mines, are often left on the ground. 
Until they are cleared and destroyed, it will not be 
possible to use agricultural areas, roads, schools 
and other infrastructure. Moreover, refugees and 
internally displaced persons will not be able to 
return home. Clearing mines and cluster muni­
tions is a demanding task and puts strain on 
already limited resources. The provision of medi­
cal assistance and assisting in the reintegration of 
victims of these weapons is also a major strain on 
the communities affected. 

The Government attaches great importance to 
non-proliferation efforts. Norway has been an 
active player in efforts to ban landmines and clus­
ter munitions. We played a leading role in the inter­
national effort that culminated in an international 
convention banning the use, production and sale of 
cluster munitions. The signing conference in Oslo 
was attended by 125 countries, 94 of which signed 
the convention. This is disarmament with a clear 
humanitarian focus. The same applies to the 
efforts to control the proliferation of small arms. 

The Government will: 

•	 promote a rights-based approach to conflict res­
olution and peacebuilding, with focus on 
human security 

•	 support efforts to promote transitional justice 
and measures that support reconciliation proc­
esses 

•	 continue efforts to regulate conventional weap­
ons that cause unacceptable civilian harm, by 
promoting full implementation of the Mine 
Ban Convention and rapid entry into force and 
full implementation of the Convention on Clus­
ter Munitions 

•	 work to improve control of the production of, 
trade in and proliferation of small arms. 
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5.4 Protection of civilians 

During the last few decades, the nature of war has 
changed in that civilian personnel can find them­
selves being targeted along the same lines as mili­
tary personnel. This creates new dilemmas for all 
the actors involved – whether military, develop­
ment or humanitarian. This is clearly reflected in 
the debate about the humanitarian space and the 
challenges connected to securing such a space in 
conflict situations. The term «humanitarian space» 
refers to the extent to which civil organisations can 
gain safe access to vulnerable population groups in 
difficult security situations. 

If humanitarian organisations are to succeed in 
their work, they must be perceived as being inde­
pendent, which has proven difficult in many con­
flicts. Increasingly, humanitarian organisations are 
associated with one of the parties to the conflict, or 
the policies pursued in their host countries. This is 
particularly a problem in conflicts where religion 
or ethnicity is a factor. 

Regardless of the nature of the conflict, human­
itarian organisations need a minimum of physical 
security in order to operate and to reach civilians in 
need. Sometimes this can only be provided by mil­
itary forces, which can pose a dilemma for human­
itarian actors. In other situations such help is 
explicitly requested, for example in DR Congo in 
the autumn of 2008, humanitarian organisations 
asked for more UN forces to protect both the civil­
ian population and those who were providing 
assistance. 

In 2005, the UN General Assembly adopted the 
concept of responsibility to protect. The interna­
tional community – in the form of the UN – can 
assume this responsibility, and intervene when the 
civilian population’s basic need for security is not 
being met by the national authorities. The World 
Summit Outcome uses an expanded security con­
cept that includes well-being. Freedom from fear 
and freedom from want are prerequisites for ensur­
ing a minimum of security, which in turn is a vital 
starting point for post-conflict development. 

Women and children are particularly severely 
affected when abuse is systematically used as a 
weapon of war and armed conflicts. Women and 
girls are often subjected to brutal violence. Sexual 
violence as a strategy of war increases the level of 
conflict and prevents women from taking part in 
the reconciliation process. The association of mas­
culinity with dominant behaviour and aggression 
means that boys are easily recruited to armed 
groups, and can also increase the brutality in the 
abuse of women and girls. UN Security Council 

resolution 1820 recognises the extent and serious­
ness of the use of rape as a weapon in armed con­
flicts. The importance of ensuring that girls’ and 
women’s needs and interests are met in armed con­
flicts and humanitarian crises is also underlined in 
UN Security Council resolution 1325. 

Many of the civilian casualties in armed con­
flicts are children and young people. However, chil­
dren and young people are not just victims. They 
can also be agents of peace, social change and con­
flict prevention. Their role in peacebuilding and 
the support they can provide in peace and reconcil­
iation processes, needs to be better understood 
and utilised. Indeed, participation can in fact 
increase protection. UN Security Council resolu­
tion 1612 of 2005 calls for the implementation of a 
mechanism to monitor serious violations of chil­
dren’s rights. Efforts in this area have also been 
strengthened through closer coordination 
between different parts of the UN system. 

Despite the increased focus on children, seri­
ous violations of children’s rights are a major chal­
lenge for the international legal order. The con­
texts of conflicts have changed. Efforts to protect 
children must take into account new threats. The 
Government has therefore taken several policy ini­
tiatives with a view to improving the situation for 
children. These include Norway’s participation in a 
UN process to create a platform for intensified 
international efforts in this area. The Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs has also funded a study designed to 
demonstrate why, when and how children and 
young people should take part in peacebuilding 
and peace processes. The costs of failing to take 
children and young people into account will be 
great. 

Very many actors – at both national and inter­
national level – are engaged in peacebuilding and 
development efforts. Different approaches are 
being taken by different actors – at one and the 
same time. Coordination is vital but difficult, both 
in relation to basic situation analyses and in rela­
tion to more practical tasks. Failure to coordinate 
efforts not only reduces their effectiveness, it also 
undermines the legitimacy of those providing 
assistance in the eyes of the local population. 

The UN is the international actor that has made 
most progress in developing an integrated 
approach to peacebuilding, on the basis of its expe­
rience with integrated peace operations in many 
parts of the world. This puts the UN in a particu­
larly good position to play an overall coordinating 
role vis-à-vis different bilateral actors that become 
engaged in post-conflict assistance. The establish­
ment of the Peacebuilding Commission has made 
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it possible to plan and coordinate efforts better 
than before. The Commission also helps to main­
tain focus on and mobilise support for war-torn 
countries during the post-conflict stage. 

UN-led operations are designed to ensure that 
a large number of actors target their efforts 
towards common goals, and implement measures 
that are mutually harmonised. A high degree of 
coordination will naturally lead to a relegation of 
priorities and interests of individual countries. This 
could be a challenge in cases where we seek to 
ensure a specific Norwegian profile for our inter­
vention. In practice, however, this has not been a 
problem. Improved coordination has been an 
important issue in Afghanistan. In other situations 
it can, however, be expedient to take rapid deci­
sions even though this means failing to comply 
with more extensive coordination processes. Cer­
tain countries, including Norway, did just that in 
the efforts to initiate a peace process in Sudan. 

The Government will 

•	 give priority to protecting civilians in humani­
tarian efforts 

•	 support efforts to promote transitional justice 
and measures that support reconciliation proc­
esses 

•	 promote the participation of women in peace 
processes and seek to ensure that gender and 
gender equality perspectives are integrated 
into conflict resolution and peacekeeping 

•	 seek to ensure effective protection of children 
in armed conflicts and in connection with 
peacekeeping operations 

•	 promote broader international understanding 
of the importance of giving children and young 
people a more prominent role in conflict pre­
vention and peace and reconciliation proc­
esses. 

5.5	 Different approaches to peace- and 
state-building 

Current complex conflicts require comprehensive, 
long-term and multi-dimensional efforts. While 
development efforts can help to reduce and 
resolve conflicts, they have a particularly impor­
tant role in helping to bring about lasting peace and 
stability in the aftermath of an acute conflict. 

Figure 5.4  The division of responsibility between civilian and military organisations is put to the test in 
difficult security situations, as here in Afghanistan. 
Photo: Anders Sømme Hammer 
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There is an increasing focus in the interna­
tional community on the links between the various 
policy tools used to deal with security-related, polit­
ical, humanitarian and development issues, and 
how they can best be coordinated. The recognition 
that sustainable growth and development are vital 
for lasting peace is a cornerstone of Norwegian 
development policy. Today, the largest recipients of 
Norwegian aid are fragile states and conflict areas. 
In conflict situations, Norway and the international 
community encounter the full range of challenges 
that need to be addressed through an integrated 
approach to development and peace- and state-
building. 

Afghanistan 

The UN Security Council has stated that the situa­
tion in Afghanistan poses a threat to international 
peace and security. The goal of Norwegian and 
international efforts in Afghanistan is stability. 
This is crucial for further development. A strong, 
democratic state that has the will and the capacity 
to fight poverty throughout the country is the best 
means of ensuring that it does not once again 
become a haven for terrorists. 

The people of Afghanistan have lived with occu­
pation and civil war for more than a generation. 
This has caused terrible humanitarian suffering 
and cannot continue. The only viable way forward 
is a broad process of political reconciliation that 
includes all the different population groups in the 
country. Afghan ownership of this process is essen­
tial. The Afghans must be in the driving seat, and 
must themselves decide on all aspects of the coun­
try’s development and policies. 

Although much has been achieved – a new con­
stitution has been adopted, democratic elections 
have been held, and schools, roads, wells and hos­
pitals have been built – the humanitarian situation 
is still precarious. Poverty, corruption and illegal 
drug production are widespread. The situation is 
extremely unstable. There are many setbacks. 
There is still a need for military and civilian efforts 
in Afghanistan to provide the security and stability 
necessary to enable the country’s economic and 
social development. 

Norway has long sought to promote better 
coordination of international efforts, with the sup­
port of the UN, and with Afghan authorities at the 
helm. At present, the Afghan state is weak, and it is 
therefore important to ensure close cooperation 
between the UN and UNAMA. State-building and 
development efforts are based on the five-year 
Afghanistan National Development Strategy 

Box 5.5 Oil for Development and conflict 
resolution 

Natural resources and the revenues they gene­
rate can be seeds of conflict within and bet­
ween states. Sudan and Afghanistan are both 
countries where natural resources are already, 
or could become, the cause of conflict. Coope­
ration under the Oil for Development initiative 
has been established in both countries. 

Most of the oil fields in Sudan are situated 
in the border area between the north and 
south of the country. A dispute over control of 
the oil reserves was one of the causes of the 
civil war that broke out in 1983. The current 
peace agreement gives very detailed guideli­
nes for how the oil revenues are to be divided 
between the Government in Khartoum and 
the regional authorities in Southern Sudan. 

Oil for Development has been involved in 
competence-building efforts in the country 
since 2006. In October 2008, Norway and 
Sudan signed a framework agreement that 
paves the way for closer cooperation in the 
petroleum sector. Through Oil for Develop­
ment and other initiatives, Norway is 
assisting Sudan with the implementation of 
the agreement and helping to ensure that oil 
revenues are administered in the best possi­
ble way. In 2007, when hostilities broke out in 
the oil-rich Abyei area, Norway was actively 
involved in the efforts to find a political solu­
tion. The parties have agreed on a temporary 
system for dividing the revenues from the 
area until the Permanent Court of Arbitration 
in the Hague settles this border issue. 

Oil and gas discoveries in Afghanistan 
could lead to a new line of conflict in this area. 
Norway has funded a preliminary study to 
assess the risk of such conflict. Oil for 
Development has provided advisory services 
in connection with the preparation of the 
petroleum act, which was passed by the Afg­
han parliament in 2008. The act is designed to 
ensure sound management and distribution 
of oil revenues between the oil companies and 
the Afghan state, so that Afghan society as a 
whole can benefit from these assets. 

(ANDS), which was approved by the Afghan Pres­
ident in 2008, and endorsed by the international 
donor conference in Paris the same year. 
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Box 5.6 Peace in the Middle East in the 
interests of the whole world 

«[…], but the President and the Secretary of 
State have made it clear that danger and diffi­
culty cannot cause the United States to turn 
away. To the contrary, they recognise and 
have said that peace and stability in the 
Middle East are in our national interest, they 
are of course also in the interest of Israelis 
and Palestinians, of others in the region and 
people throughout the world.» 

Senator George Mitchell, on his appoint­
ment as Special Envoy to the Middle East by 
President Barack Obama, BBC Newsline, 23 
January 2009. 

Although many questions regarding Afghani­
stan’s future remain unresolved, it is clear that a 
long-term development engagement in the coun­
try must seek to meet the people’s basic needs, 
create a framework that enables people to live 
secure and decent lives, and strengthen democ­
racy and the state’s ability to provide the services 
people need. The Afghan people must regain their 
hope for the future. Meanwhile, the long-term 
capacity and will of the international community to 
maintain its efforts will be sorely tested. 

The Middle East 

The Middle East region faces major challenges 
relating to peace and reconciliation, poverty, and 
democratic and economic development. The high 
level of conflict in the region places particular 
demands on the donor community and means that 
all those involved must demonstrate considerable 
flexibility. The historical and political background 
to Norway’s engagement in the Middle East is our 
desire to contribute to the establishment of a Pales­
tinian state side-by-side with Israel. Norway is 
seeking to ensure that the international economic 
support for the Palestinian Authority continues 
and increases, with a view to achieving a two-state 
solution. Our engagement involves diplomatic con­
tact with all the parties to the conflict, and we gave 
our full support to the political negotiation process 
between Israel and the Palestinian Authority in the 
wake of the Annapolis Conference in the autumn of 
2007. 

The Ad Hoc Liaison Committee for Assistance 
to the Palestinians (AHLC) plays a key role in the 
efforts to secure a two-state solution. As Chair of 
the AHLC, Norway has particular responsibility 
for coordinating funding to ensure that the assist­
ance provided supports the political process. A 
well-functioning tripartite cooperation between the 
Palestinian Authority, Israel and the AHLC is vital 
in order to build up a sustainable Palestinian econ­
omy and establish an institutional foundation for a 
Palestinian state. This requires close cooperation 
with the Palestinian Authority with regard to its 
own development plans and priorities. At the same 
time, it is necessary to maintain a dialogue with 
Israel on reducing obstacles to economic growth in 
the Palestinian Territory. Israeli settlements in the 
occupied areas are in violation of international law, 
and constitute a serious obstacle to the develop­
ment of a Palestinian state. The Quartet, which is 
made up of the US, Russia, the UN and the EU, is 
an important partner for Norway in this context, 
and in the efforts to negotiate a final status agree­
ment. Development measures must be imple­
mented hand-in-hand with diplomatic and political 
processes. 

Norway has long warned of the humanitarian 
and political consequences of keeping Gaza cut off 
from the rest of the world. The war in Gaza at the 
end of 2008 and beginning of 2009 has highlighted 
the gravity of the situation. There is a major need 
for humanitarian efforts in Gaza. Norway will play 
a leading role as AHLC Chair. The situation in Gaza 
underlines the need for Palestinian reconciliation, 
for building a Palestinian state and bringing the 
occupation to an end. Norway supports a two-state 
solution. This is the only way to ensure lasting 
peace for both Israelis and Palestinians. This goal 
can only be achieved through a combination of 
humanitarian, diplomatic and political measures, in 
other words, through an integrated approach that 
ensures human security in the short term and 
works towards political solutions in a more long-
term perspective. 

Sudan 

Sudan has been ravaged by civil war since it gained 
independence in 1956. Protracted conflicts during 
this period have created an ongoing humanitarian 
disaster. More than two million people have been 
killed in Southern Sudan, and nearly four million 
are directly threatened by the war in Darfur. More 
than five million have had to flee their homes. Nor­
way has had an extensive engagement in Sudan 
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since 1970. This has included both aid and support 
for peace and reconciliation efforts. 

Norwegian NGOs and academic institutions 
that have a long-standing engagement in Sudan 
have helped to provide Norway with a network in 
the country. Key organisations in this respect are 
Norwegian Church Aid, Norwegian People’s Aid, 
the Chr. Michelsen Institute and the University of 
Bergen. 

Norway has helped to facilitate three peace 
agreements in Sudan: 1) the Comprehensive Peace 
Agreement (CPA) of 2005, which put an end to the 
war between the north and the south, and forms 
the basis for all other peace agreements in Sudan; 
2) the Darfur Peace Agreement of 2006, which did 
not succeed in settling the conflict in the region; 
and 3) the Eastern Sudan Peace Agreement of 
2006, which so far has prevented the conflict from 
spreading into Eastern Sudan. Since the signing of 
the CPA, Norway has opened an embassy in Khar­
toum and a consulate general in Juba, and we are 
also represented in the Joint Donor Office in Juba. 
In 2007, Norwegian aid to Sudan amounted to 
NOK 700 million, and was disbursed via a large 
number of different channels. 

Norwegian aid efforts in Sudan face a number 
of challenges. Sudan is the largest country in 
Africa in terms of area. There is a great deal of ten­
sion between the centre and the periphery. The 
peace agreement is fragile. Attempts to implement 
a peace agreement in Darfur floundered because 
important groups never signed up to it. Subse­
quent attempts to find a political solution have not 
succeeded. Fighting and abuses continue in Dar­
fur, and the humanitarian situation is extremely 
serious. There are 2.5 million internally displaced 
persons (IDPs) who are still unable to return to 
their homes. In addition to the IDPs who receive 
humanitarian assistance, a large proportion of the 
remaining population in Darfur depend on aid to 
survive. 

In Southern Sudan too, the conflict has had 
major social consequences. Millions of refugees 
and IDPs want to return to their homes. Tens of 
thousands of soldiers have to be demobilised and 
disarmed. Infrastructure has to be built up. This 
creates a huge need for capacity- and democracy-
building, and anti-corruption efforts. Most of Nor­
way’s reconstruction aid is channelled through the 
World Bank’s multi-donor trust fund, which facili­
tates quality assurance and reduces the risk of cor­
ruption. However efforts such as these are associ­
ated with considerable bureaucracy, and it may 
take some time before concrete results are 
achieved. It is therefore important to channel aid 

through NGOs as well, in order to promote devel­
opment in the vulnerable transition stage following 
a peace agreement. 

So far, the efforts to improve donor coordina­
tion through the Joint Donor Office have not pro­
duced the desired results. A small, but important 
part of Norway’s efforts are channelled through 
the Oil for Development initiative. The oil discover­
ies in Sudan were one of the most important causes 
of the conflict. By helping to develop a common 
knowledge base for the north and south, and build­
ing capacity in relation to the management of oil 
revenues in the south, we can help to reduce ten­
sion and prepare the ground for long-term, sustain­
able growth on the basis of the country’s own 
resources. It is also very important to support the 
development of democracy by providing assistance 
with the preparations for the 2009 election, and 
helping to transform the Sudan People’s Liberation 
Movement from a guerrilla army into a political 
party. The humanitarian needs in Sudan are still 
enormous. In connection with the follow-up to the 
donor conferences in Oslo in 2005 and 2008, Nor­
way has stepped up its support for initiatives under 
the United Nations Development Fund for Women 
(UNIFEM) to promote Sudanese women’s access 
to paid work and opportunities to take part in polit­
ical decision-making processes. 

The civil war in Sudan has long been a forgot­
ten conflict that has received little international 
attention. Today, there is stronger international 
focus on the conflict. Norway is working closely 
with other countries to bring about peace. Darfur 
is regularly on the agendas of the UN Security 
Council and the African Union. Norwegian efforts 
must therefore be seen in the context of a broad 
international effort to create peace in Sudan and 
prevent further conflict in the region. 

Sri Lanka 

Since 2000, Norway has acted as facilitator in nego­
tiations between the Sri Lankan Government and 
the Tamil Tigers. In February 2002, the parties 
signed a mutual ceasefire agreement following a 
process that Norway was involved in. The cease-
fire led to a dramatic reduction in the number of 
people killed in the conflict. As many as 10 000 lives 
may have been saved in the first three years follow­
ing the signing of the agreement. The human 
rights situation improved. People enjoyed freedom 
of movement, economic growth and development. 
The agreement also resulted in massive interna­
tional support for peacebuilding in Sri Lanka. 
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Despite a breakdown in negotiations in April 
2003, the parties formally upheld the ceasefire 
until January 2008. However, violations of the 
agreement increased significantly from 2006. 
Despite repeated attempts to strengthen the imple­
mentation of the ceasefire agreement and revive 
negotiations, the conflict is now extremely violent. 

Norway will honour its commitments, and has 
a long-term perspective regarding its engagement 
in Sri Lanka. It is the parties and the people of Sri 
Lanka themselves who must find the political solu­
tion. Norway will support attempts to find political 
solutions that are acceptable to all ethnic groups 
and enable them to live together peacefully. 

Despite the escalation of hostilities, Norway is 
in close contact with both parties, in order to main­
tain open channels for dialogue. Norway is pre­
pared to assist the parties for as long as they 
request Norwegian assistance and are willing to 
negotiate. If negotiations between the parties were 
to be resumed, it is difficult to say exactly what role 
Norway would have. Norway is cooperating 
closely with India, the US, the EU and Japan in its 
engagement in Sri Lanka. 

The most important thing for Norway to do in 
this situation is to use its position to help to ensure 
that the civilians who are caught up in the conflict 
receive the international humanitarian assistance 
they are entitled to. 

Nepal 

Norway’s support for the Nepalese peace process 
focused on such measures as providing meeting 
places for the various actors and sharing Norwe­
gian experience and expertise. The approach 
taken by Norway was guided at all times by Nepa­
lese requests and needs. The Norwegian Embassy 
in Kathmandu was frequently used as an arena in 
these efforts, where the themes and approaches 
changed in pace with the different phases of the 
peace process. The Embassy was also a meeting 
place for government representatives and the polit­
ical parties under the monarchy, and for the politi­
cal parties and the Maoists prior to the peace 
agreement of November 2006. The Embassy was 
also used as an arena for meetings between repre­
sentatives of the political parties and key interna­
tional actors. This was a particularly valuable func­
tion in the period leading up to the election, when 
certain Western countries would not otherwise 
have had the opportunity to meet representatives 
of the Maoist movement. Norwegian election 
expertise was made available in connection with 
the political parties’ and other actors’ preparations 

for the election of the Constituent Assembly in 
2008. 

Another important initiative in terms of creat­
ing a meeting place was the courses held at the 
National College of Defence in Norway, which 
were attended by members of both the Nepalese 
and the Maoist armies. 

Political efforts were underpinned by financial 
support. In order to provide the best possible 
assistance in the peace process, funding was pro­
vided both to meet immediate needs in connection 
with the implementation of the peace agreement 
and for medium-term measures under the auspices 
of the authorities and the UN system. Great 
emphasis was placed on supporting measures that 
would give the Nepalese people a peace dividend 
and thus strengthen popular support for the peace 
process. 

Burundi 

The purpose of the Norwegian engagement in 
Burundi is to support the peace process and 
ensure that the country does not fall back into con-

Box 5.7  The Nile Basin Initiative 

The Nile Basin Initiative is an example of regi­
onal cooperation that is contributing to peace­
ful development. The initiative is seeking to 
provide a framework that will allow the nine 
countries in the Nile basin to realise the 
vision of sustainable socio-economic develop­
ment through cooperative management of the 
Nile’s water resources. The initiative has both 
a political and an economic focus. Institution-, 
competence­ and confidence-building bet­
ween countries and population groups is a 
key element. Cooperation on addressing and 
adapting to climate change has been given 
greater priority in recent years. There is 
potential for the initiative to play a con­
structive role in conflict resolution and peace 
and reconciliation efforts in the region. This 
would depend on a close dialogue between 
the parties to ensure that all interests are 
taken into account, including broad participa­
tion of civil society actors. Norway was an 
important partner for the World Bank in con­
nection with the establishment of the Nile 
Basin Initiative in 1997 and has provided NOK 
169 million through the World Bank Nile 
Basin Trust Fund. 
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flict. The ceasefire between the Government and 
the PALIPEHUTU (National Forces of Liberation) 
has provided a basis for peace. However there 
seems to be little progress in negotiations between 
the parties. Burundi is on the agenda of the UN 
Peacebuilding Commission, and Norway led the 
Commission’s efforts in the country up to June 
2008. Meeting expectations in terms of peacebuild­
ing and ensuring sufficient resources for develop­
ment are challenging tasks. Experience has shown 
that Burundi’s problems are not just due to a lack 
of resources but also, and to a considerable extent, 
to the need for an inclusive, democratic political 
culture. 

A difficult economic situation, with rising food 
and oil prices, is creating new unrest. Norway pro­
vides considerable budget support to Burundi, 
which is channelled through the World Bank. 
Budget support, together with other measures, 
will enable the Government to take action to 
improve conditions for the poor. Budget support is 
vital to enable the authorities to implement their 
poverty reduction strategy. The way this money is 
used is followed up through an agreed system to 
monitor performance in relation to the poverty 
reduction strategy. 

The Government will: 

•	 support state-building, democratisation, and 
the development of civil society and the private 
sector in weak, fragile states 

•	 seek to ensure that aid helps to reduce the use 
of violence in conflict situations 

•	 seek to prevent violent conflict from flaring up 
again in countries that have recently emerged 
from a conflict situation 

•	 provide support for security sector reform in 
state-building processes 

•	 support initiatives to improve understanding 
between faith groups and between religious 
leaders. 

5.6	 Regional actors and cooperation 
on conflict prevention 

All conflicts have consequences beyond the geo­
graphical areas that are directly affected. Good 
relations, and cooperation on development issues 
between countries in the region are important for 
reducing the risk of violent conflict. The Middle 
East is the most obvious example of how a conflict 
can have regional spill-over effects. The conflict in 
Afghanistan also has far-reaching consequences, 

particularly in relation to Pakistan. The many con­
flicts in Africa confirm the validity of this principle. 

The poorest countries are becoming increas­
ingly aware of the links between natural disasters, 
supply crises and conflict. In Africa, there is grow­
ing recognition of the fact that the continent will 
not be able to achieve peace, stability and develop­
ment without broad political and economic cooper­
ation. This is also the only way the continent will be 
able to help to meet the major global environmen­
tal challenges. 

The Horn of Africa is particularly vulnerable to 
drought and flooding. The situation is being exac­
erbated by the conflicts in the region. In some 
areas, the pattern of conflict is so complex, and the 
security situation so precarious, that it is difficult 
for humanitarian actors to gain access to those in 
need. In recent years, rising food prices and rapid 
population growth have aggravated an already dif­
ficult food supply situation. Norway is following 
the situation, and is providing support in the form 
of short-term humanitarian assistance and long-
term measures to improve the management of nat­
ural resources and increase food security. These 
efforts are being undertaken in close collaboration 
with national and local authorities, NGOs and the 
UN system. It is expected that they will be stepped 
up in the years ahead. Such efforts help to prevent 
the outbreak of open, armed conflict and to miti­
gate existing conflicts. 

In 2002, the Organisation of African Unity 
(OAU) was transformed into the African Union 
(AU). The AU has a broad and ambitious mandate 
that includes the right to intervene in the event of 
war or conflict between or within individual African 
states. The New Partnership for Africa’s Develop­
ment (NEPAD) was set up at the same time as the 
AU was established. NEPAD focuses on the devel­
opment of democracy, the rule of law and good 
governance as crucial factors for economic devel­
opment and stability. 

Norway has actively supported measures to 
strengthen cooperation between countries on the 
African continent. In recent years, the AU has 
taken on increasing responsibilities in connection 
with conflict resolution, and Norway has provided 
support for various forms of capacity-building in 
this field. However, the AU is still a relatively weak 
organisation, and depends on international sup­
port for the peace operations led by the AU. Efforts 
are now being made to establish an African 
Standby Force. Norway is contributing to these 
efforts, for example by providing training for civil­
ian police officers who are to take part in stabilisa­
tion and peace operations. 
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The Government will: 
• provide assistance in connection with peace­

keeping operations under the auspices of 
• take a particular responsibility for building regional organisations, including assistance for 

knowledge about integrated approaches to competence- and capacity-building in these 
peacekeeping and peacebuilding, and making organisations as necessary. 
this knowledge available to the UN and 
regional actors 
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6 Capital
 

The goal of increasing the developing countries’ 
share of global capital and economic growth is a 
key element of the fight against poverty. For the 
world as a whole, average gross domestic product 
per person (per capita GDP) in 2007 was almost 
USD 10 000, while in the 50 least developed coun­
tries it was less than USD 750. 

Sound economic policy at the national level is 
vital for creating and strengthening processes that 
can provide a basis for sustainable social and eco­
nomic development. However, in our globalised 
world, external factors are increasingly influencing 
national processes. Such factors may include par­
ticipation in various international agreements, and 
other unpredictable factors, that do not fall within 
the scope of international arrangements. The 
financial crisis, which in a short period of time has 
resulted in dramatic changes in the economic out­
look for both poor and rich countries, demon­
strates just how closely interwoven national and 
global economic structures have become. There is 
broad international agreement that the interests of 
developing countries must be at the centre of 

efforts to cope with the financial crisis and the chal­
lenges arising from slower global growth. 

Multinational enterprises control one quarter 
of the world’s GDP. One third of all world trade 
takes place internally in such enterprises. Every 
day, currency to a value of more than USD 3000 bil­
lion is bought and sold in foreign exchange mar­
kets. This is almost three times the world’s total 
annual defence spending. The forces of global cap­
ital are powerful, and have a strong influence on 
economic development in poor countries. 

Foreign investment, trade revenues and remit­
tances from migrants are the most important finan­
cial flows into poor countries. Official development 
assistance from OECD member countries totals 
about USD 100 billion a year. Payment for 
imported goods and services is the most important 
financial outflow from developing countries. Other 
important financial flows are repayment of foreign 
debt, accumulation of foreign reserves and repatri­
ation of profit from foreign investments. In addi­
tion, there are substantial illict financial flows 
between countries and regions. Exact figures for 
illicit financial flows are hard to come by. However, 
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Figure 6.1  Important financial flows to developing countries, 2007. 
Source: Global Integrity 2009, World Bank 2008, UNCTAD 2008, OECD 2008 
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estimates by the US think-tank Global Financial 
Integrity indicate that in 2006, the volume of illicit 
financial flows out of developing countries was at 
least USD 750 billion, and that the problem is grow­
ing. 

Aid makes up only a small proportion of capital 
transfers to developing countries. However, aid is 
unique in that it can be channelled directly to 
projects that will have a real development effect. 
There is a pressing need for funding to strengthen 
areas such as health, education, gender equality 
and children’s rights, and this need cannot be met 
without the use of aid as part of an active develop­
ment policy. The Government also intends to make 
greater strategic use of development policy tools 
and aid funding to steer large financial flows in a 
more development-friendly direction. 

6.1 Foreign investment 

Until recently, a strong world economy has helped 
to increase capital inflows to many developing 
countries. Foreign investors have shown great 
interest in new business initiatives. In Africa, the 
level of foreign investment more than tripled over 
a five-year period, and reached an estimated USD 
27 billion in 2007. Investments in all developing 
countries in the same year totalled more than USD 
300 billion. The largest investments have been 
made in middle-income countries and countries 
with large natural resources. The financial crisis 
and the downturn in the global economy have 
checked the growth in investments. 

Growth in investment has positive effects on 
economic growth and employment. Rapid growth 

Figure 6.2  The financial crisis is affecting people 
all over the world. The Karachi Stock Exchange is 
no exception. 
Photo: Asif Hassan/Scanpix 

has also given many developing countries a his­
toric opportunity to repay debt and accumulate for­
eign reserves. This enhances macroeconomic sta­
bility and gives more political space for choosing 
national development measures. However, the 
financial crisis has resulted in a sharp reduction in 
risk capital and rising capital costs. Providing a 
suitable framework for continued growth in invest­
ment in poor countries will therefore be an impor­
tant development policy task in the years ahead. In 
these efforts, it is important to take into account 
the fact that developing countries are a heteroge­
neous group, and that their capacity to attract pri­
vate investment varies. This is a good reason for 
giving priority to the least developed countries, 
with a special focus on Africa. 

Countries with a stable political and administra­
tive framework will generally attract more capital 
than unstable countries. The Norwegian Govern­
ment is therefore giving priority to state-building 
as a key element of development policy, and an 
important tool for ensuring sustainable economic 
development. In many cases it is also relevant to 
reduce the political or commercial risk involved in 
investing in developing countries through support 
schemes for private sector development, for exam­
ple through Norfund and GIEK. Aid can also be 
used to catalyse large-scale private-sector invest­
ment through public-private partnerships. 

For poor countries, it will be important to find a 
balance so that regulation, bureaucracy and taxa­
tion do not stifle investment appetite and at the 
same time safeguard the economic gains from 
such investments. Foreign investment can contrib­
ute to new infrastructure, transfers of technology 
and market access, all of which benefit local busi­
ness and industry. However, national authorities 
have an important role to play in opening the way 
for such positive ripple effects. 

Many of the largest investments in developing 
countries are connected with the extraction of oil, 
gas and other minerals. The extractive industries 
are associated with large-scale capital investment, 
but only provide limited employment opportuni­
ties. In addition, they are based on the use of non­
renewable resources. The gains from the extrac­
tion of such resources should therefore be 
regarded as wealth rather than ordinary revenues. 
The capacity of the authorities to regulate and tax 
such activities will therefore be of crucial impor­
tance in ensuring that investments contribute to 
sustainable economic growth and development in 
the country concerned. Norway has a great deal of 
experience to offer in this field. Through initiatives 
such as Oil for Development, Petrad, and the 
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Figure 6.3  Angola’s oil resources have attracted 
large-scale foreign investment, some of it from 
Norwegian companies. 
Photo: Christopher Olssøn/Littleimagebank 

Extractive Industries Transparency Initiative 
(EITI), the Government will ensure that develop­
ing countries are given access to Norwegian expe­
rience and expertise. 

A growing number of Norwegian firms are 
investing directly in developing countries. Some of 
the largest are StatoilHydro, Telenor, Jotun and 
Statkraft. In 2006, Norwegian direct investment in 
developing countries totalled about NOK 115 bil­
lion. This is enough to make an important contribu­
tion to employment, revenues and economic 
growth. For example, Telenor has helped to create 
several hundred thousand jobs in Bangladesh. In 
2007, the company paid NOK 2.7 billion in taxes to 
Bangladesh. In Angola, StatoilHydro’s activities 
generated tax revenues in excess of NOK 10 billion 
in 2007. 

Corporate social responsibility 

The Government wishes to encourage Norwegian 
business and industry to invest more in developing 
countries. However, we know that there is a high 
level of risk associated with investing in countries 
where governance is weak, both in financial terms 
and as regards a company’s reputation. 

All companies operating abroad are expected to 
comply with the host country’s laws and regula­
tions. However, many developing countries have 
inadequate legislation, weak governance, wide­
spread poverty and corruption. In countries such 
as these, the way companies do business and dem­
onstrate responsibility is of particular importance. 
This does not mean that companies should auto­
matically assume responsibility for matters that are 
the province of the authorities in the countries con­

cerned. It would be unreasonable to expect this of 
private companies, and it would not necessarily 
promote long-term development. The Govern­
ment’s position is therefore that corporate social 
responsibility (CSR) involves companies integrat­
ing social and environmental concerns into their 
day-to-day operations, as well as in their dealings 
with stakeholders. CSR means what companies do 
on a voluntary basis beyond complying with exist­
ing legislation and rules in the country in which 
they are operating. Companies should promote 
positive social development through value creation 
and responsible business conduct, and by taking 
the local community and other stakeholders into 
consideration. 

Most Norwegian companies are interested in 
promoting high ethical standards in their opera­
tions abroad. The costs of a loss of reputation are 
high. However, we know that it can be a difficult 
task to maintain the required standards. This is 
why the Government has presented the white 
paper Corporate social responsibility in a global 
economy (Report No. 10 (2008–2009) to the Stort­
ing). The white paper makes it clear that the Gov­
ernment expects Norwegian companies to play a 
part in setting high standards for CSR in develop­
ing countries. This means that they must respect 
human rights, uphold core labour standards, take 
environmental concerns into account, combat cor­
ruption, and maximise transparency in their inter­
national activities. 

Indirect investment 

Indirect investment, for example purchases of 
equities and other securities, has become an 
important source of capital for developing coun­
tries in recent years. In Africa alone, such transfers 
were worth about NOK 55 billion in 2007. In this 
context, the growth of large sovereign wealth 
funds such as the Norwegian Government Pension 
Fund – Global is an important development. 
Greater availability of investment capital opens up 
new opportunities, but also presents new chal­
lenges. Norway has given high priority to develop­
ing an ethical framework for investments by the 
Government Pension Fund – Global. However, not 
all countries consider the ethical dimension to be 
equally important. There has been concern inter­
nationally about the fact that certain funds show lit­
tle transparency in their operations, and do not 
have systems for taking ethical considerations into 
account. 

In an international evaluation of the largest sov­
ereign wealth funds in terms of transparency and 
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Tabell 6.1  Investments by the Government 
Pension Fund – Global in selected developing 
countries, 2007 

Country	 NOK (million) 

Brazil 11 193 
South Africa 7 205 
China 6 959 
India 1 881 

Source: Ministry of Finance, 2008 

accountability, structure, governance and behav­
iour, the Government Pension Fund – Global was 
ranked as a world leader. To ensure that Norway 
can continue to contribute to high standards in the 
management of public securities investments, the 
Government has initiated an evaluation of the Eth­
ical Guidelines for the Fund, including a public 
consultation involving a wide range of actors. This 
has resulted in a number of recommendations on 
how to increase the development policy impor­
tance of investments by the Government Pension 
Fund – Global, in much the same vein as the rec­
ommendations made in the report Coherent for 
development? (NOU 2008:14). The results of the 
evaluation and any proposals for changes to the 
Ethical Guidelines will be presented in the annual 
white paper on the Government Pension Fund in 
spring 2009. 

At present, the Pension Fund has no assets 
invested in the least developed countries, but has 
made investments in a number of middle-income 
countries that are also recipients of Norwegian 
development cooperation. The World Bank has 
recommended that sovereign wealth funds should 
focus more on the least developed countries. The 
World Bank is currently developing a platform to 
facilitate sovereign wealth fund investment in 
Africa, South America and the Caribbean. Its pro­
posals will be considered in connection with the 
evaluation of the Ethical Guidelines for the Norwe­
gian Government Pension Fund – Global. 

The Government will: 

•	 call on the private sector to increase its invest­
ments in developing countries and invite com­
panies to enter into strategic partnerships in 
order to reduce the risk associated with such 
investments and improve their development 
impact 

•	 include cooperation on social responsibility as 
an important component in partnerships 
between public and private actors in develop­
ing countries 

•	 urge Norwegian companies operating in devel­
oping countries to demonstrate social respon­
sibility and bring good business practices from 
their operations in Norway. 

6.2 Illicit financial flows and tax havens 

Illicit financial flows are cross-border financial 
transactions linked to illegal activities. The pro­
ceeds of organised crime such as trafficking in 
drugs, weapons and human beings account for a 
substantial proportion of illicit financial flows. 
Large sums of money also disappear through vari­
ous types of fraud, corruption, bribery, smuggling 
and money laundering. 

However, the largest share of illicit financial 
flows is related to commercial transactions, often 
within multinational companies, whose purpose is 
tax evasion. One method is abuse of transfer pric­
ing, where exports and imports are incorrectly 
priced within a company, so that the profit can be 
recorded in secrecy jurisdictions, or tax havens, 
and not in the country where it should have been 
taxed. This type of mispricing is possible to detect 
by painstakingly going through customs and trade 
figures – provided that there is a recognised nor­
mal price for the goods in question, and that the 
discrepancy is large. It is very difficult to detect 
fraud of this kind in trade in services. 

To prevent tax evasion effectively requires 
sound legislation, well-functioning institutions and 
high administrative capacity. Many developing 
countries are therefore poorly equipped to prevent 
this kind of crime. Calculations show that illicit 
financial flows as a proportion of GDP are a greater 
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Figure 6.4  Illicit financial flows from developing 
countries. 
Source: Global Financial Integrity, 2007 
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problem in Africa than in other regions. However, 
the nominal value of the losses from such transac­
tions is greatest in Asia. 

The role of tax havens 

Tax havens are a key factor in efforts to limit illicit 
financial flows. According to the OECD, three fac­
tors that characterise a tax haven are: the jurisdic­
tion imposes no or only nominal taxes, it protects 
investors against tax authorities in other countries, 
and there is a lack of transparency about the tax 
structure and the companies that are registered. 
Tax havens attract both licit and illicit capital. 

Every country has the right to determine tax 
rates for the individuals and companies that choose 
to reside in or register their businesses there. 
Problems arise when a state does not have ade­
quate rules and regulations to prevent money laun­
dering or breaches of other countries’ legislation. 
By refusing to ensure transparency and disclosure 
or assisting in the establishment of shell compa­
nies in order to conceal the real ownership of 
assets, tax havens make it difficult for the tax and 
police authorities in other countries to investigate 
this type of crime. The Government’s policy here is 
to strengthen international rules to prevent assets 
that are illegally appropriated from developing 
countries from being concealed or laundered in tax 
havens. 

There are many different views on which coun­
tries and territories are tax havens. International 
lists include various types of jurisdictions, from the 
most secretive to those that are relatively open and 
cooperative. Some of the best known tax havens 
are small Caribbean islands. However, their opera­
tions often depend on activities in major financial 
centres such as New York, London, Singapore and 
Hong Kong. Professional advisers who assist com­
panies to evade national legislation often operate 
from these. 

Access to tax havens simplifies money launder­
ing and makes it possible to deposit and transfer 
financial assets secretly. This affects all countries, 
but poor countries are hit much harder than rich 
ones. Developing countries have a limited tax base 
and an urgent need for public funding of basic serv­
ices. Moreover, tax havens reduce disclosure and 
control of international financial flows. A lack of 
transparency allows government officials to build 
up fortunes abroad based on corruption and the 
theft of public assets. This can undermine confi­
dence in democratic institutions. 

The existence of tax havens can also result in 
an undesirable form of competition between devel­
oping countries, based on low tax levels and with 
the aim of attracting foreign investment. This can 
be at the expense of a country’s ability to benefit 
from private sector development and economic 
growth. Helping such countries to increase their 
capacity to enforce legislation, collect taxes, and 

Tabell 6.2  Jurisdictions that do not satisfy the OECD standards of transparency and effective exchange 
of information in tax matters 

Jurisdictions that are cooperating with the OECD on implementation of its standards Uncooperative tax havens 

Anguilla Isle of Man St Kitts & Nevis Andorra 
Antigua and Barbuda Jersey St Vincent and the Grenadines Liechtenstein 
Aruba Liberia Turks & Caicos Islands Monaco 
Bahamas Malta US Virgin Islands 
Bahrain Marshall Islands OECD member states that 
Belize 
British Virgin Islands 

Mauritius 
Montserrat 

have been urged to change 
rules on withholding infor-
mation 

Cayman Islands Nauru 
Cook Islands Netherlands Antilles Austria 
Cyprus Niue Luxembourg 
Dominica Panama Switzerland 
Gibraltar San Marino 
Grenada Seychelles 
Guernsey St Lucia 

Source: OECD, 2008 
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fight corruption and economic crime is given high 
priority in the Government’s development policy. 

Global efforts required 

However, the fight against illicit financial flows is 
primarily a global task, and requires global solu­
tions. The Government intends to play a leading 
role in international efforts to prevent money laun­
dering, tax evasion and other economic crime. 

Norway, represented by the Ministry of Justice 
and the Ministry of Finance, plays an active role in 
international bodies that are combating money 
laundering and working towards transparency and 
compliance with international conventions, such as 
the Financial Action Task Force, the OECD and 
Interpol. 

Norway has also headed an international task 
force on the development impact of illicit financial 
flows. Its recommendations were presented at the 
Doha Review Conference on Financing for Devel­
opment organised by the UN. To keep up the 
momentum of this work, Norway has decided to 
provide funding for the new Task Force on Finan­
cial Integrity and Economic Development, which 
was launched in January 2009. 

The Government appointed the Commission 
on Capital Flight from Developing Countries to 
assess Norway’s position regarding the use of tax 

Japan
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Netherlands 
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Mauritius 
57 % 
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Figure 6.5  Foreign direct investment in India, by 
country of origin (1991–2007). 
The holiday paradise Mauritius has grown into a regional finan­
cial centre for India and Africa. As a result of a tax treaty that 
exempts Mauritian investors from tax in India, almost 60 per 
cent of all foreign investment in India is channelled through 
this small island state, which has a population of only 1.3 mil­
lion. 
Source: Reserve Bank of India, reproduced in Foreign Direct 
Investment in India, Confederation of Indian Industry, 2008 

havens. The Commission is due to report by 1 June 
2009. It will make recommendations on how finan­
cial flows to and from developing countries via tax 
havens can be made more transparent, and how 
illicit financial flows and money laundering can be 
limited. 

International rules aimed at combating corrup­
tion are being steadily improved. New instruments 
include conventions under the OECD and the 
Council of Europe. An important breakthrough 
was the conclusion of the UN Convention against 
Corruption, which entered into force in 2005. 
Negotiations on the convention were concluded 
remarkably quickly, and 126 countries have 
already ratified it. This is the first global instru­
ment against corruption, and reflects the recogni­
tion by both developed and developing countries 
that dealing with corruption requires international 
solutions. 

The existence of a global anti-corruption instru­
ment is an opportunity for Norway to intensify its 
engagement in this field. The UN Convention pro­
vides a joint platform and a global standard that 
applies equally for all countries. Norway is playing 
a leading role in the establishment of an implemen­
tation mechanism to ensure that the Convention is 
put into practice. 

In addition to fighting corruption, it is impor­
tant to identify stolen assets from developing coun­
tries by means of corruption and ensure their 
return. In 2008, the UN Office on Drugs and Crime 
(UNODC) and the World Bank established the Sto­
len Assets Recovery Initiative to promote interna­
tional commitments, knowledge and cooperation 
in this field. 

The UN Convention against Transnational 
Organized Crime entered into force in 2003. Its 
protocols deal with human trafficking, smuggling 
of migrants and illicit trade in firearms. Norway is 
playing a key role in establishing a monitoring 
mechanism for the convention. The Council of 
Europe Convention on Action against Trafficking 
in Human Beings, which entered into force in 2008, 
is also important for Norway’s efforts in this area. 

The Government will: 

•	 offer selected developing countries technical 
and financial support to strengthen their tax 
legislation, tax collection systems and anti-cor­
ruption efforts 

•	 maintain its focus on the need for new interna­
tional rules to ensure disclosure and transpar­
ency in the international financial system and 
thus prevent illegal activities in tax havens 
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•	 support research and analysis that can 
improve understanding of the scale of illicit 
financial flows and the methods and actors 
involved 

•	 cooperate with other countries and multilateral 
organisations to prevent illicit financial flows, 
and take steps for the return of assets removed 
from developing countries through corruption 

•	 promote universal adherence to and effective 
implementation of the UN Convention against 
Corruption 

•	 promote universal adherence to and imple­
mentation of the UN Convention against Tran­
snational Organized Crime and its protocols on 
human trafficking, smuggling of migrants and 
illicit trade in firearms. 

6.3	 Aid and new sources of financing 
for development 

Aid from the OECD countries almost doubled in 
the period 2000–2005, greatly helped by rapid glo­
bal growth. However, after successful debt relief 
initiatives, there has been a certain decline in aid 
compared with the record year 2005. This trend is 
in sharp contrast to pledges made by the interna­
tional community on a number of occasions. 

One result of the international financial crisis 
and the poorer outlook for growth in OECD mem­
ber states may be that they give lower priority to 
aid and higher priority to steps to deal with national 
problems. So far, however, there has been broad 
international agreement that aid commitments 
must be upheld during the economic downturn. 

Norway has a high international profile as a prime 
mover for more aid. The Government will ensure 
that Norway demonstrates solidarity with poor 
countries in the way that it deals with the financial 
crisis, so that we can play a leading role in promot­
ing a similar approach internationally. 

Countries that are not OECD members, such 
as China, India and a number of Arab countries, 
also provide aid. Although it is difficult to ascertain 
the exact amounts involved, there is little doubt 
that these countries are of considerable and grow­
ing importance. For example, aid from Saudi Ara­
bia corresponded to around NOK 11 billion in 
2007. China has pledged the equivalent of about 
NOK 100 billion to the African Development Bank, 
earmarked for trade and infrastructure projects. 
China has cancelled debt corresponding to more 
than NOK 7 billion from 21 African countries. Aid 
from India is estimated to be the equivalent of at 
least NOK 10 billion a year. So far, Bhutan and 
Nepal have been the largest recipients, but devel­
opment cooperation with African countries is 
becoming increasingly important. 

Many countries, including Norway, consider it 
important to develop new and innovative financing 
mechanisms to promote development and 
strengthen global public goods. Through active 
participation in international cooperation, Norway 
is taking part in the implementation of the Monter­
rey Consensus, which was adopted at the Interna­
tional Conference on Financing for Development 
in 2002. This is a UN-led process focusing on 1) 
mobilising developing countries’ own resources 
for development, 2) mobilising international 
resources: foreign direct investment and other pri-
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Figure 6.6  Official development assistance (ODA) from OECD countries, 2000–2007. 
Source: OECD, 2008 
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vate flows, 3) international trade as an engine for 
development, 4) increasing international financial 
and technical cooperation for development, 5) 
external debt and 6) reform of the international 
monetary, financial and trading systems. Progress 
in each of these areas and adaptation to new global 
challenges were discussed at the Doha Review 
Conference on Financing for Development in 
November–December 2008. 

A number of new initiatives have been started 
as an extension of this cooperation. Long-term, 
binding commitments on support for the develop­
ment of new vaccines and immunisation pro­
grammes have been converted to bonds, which 
can be sold on the international market. While aid 
donors will honour their commitments over a 
period of 5 to 20 years, revenues from the sale of 
«vaccine bonds» can be used immediately. Norway 
is one of the seven countries that have helped to 
develop this initiative. Norway is also involved in 
an initiative under which private companies that 
wish to develop and produce new vaccines for 
developing countries are given guarantees of 
future purchases at a fixed price. So far, guarantees 
worth more than NOK 8 billion have been pro­
vided. Certain countries have introduced an air 
passenger solidarity tax, which has so far provided 
the equivalent of about NOK 2 billion for purchases 
of medicines to fight HIV/AIDS, malaria and tuber­
culosis. 

Funding of measures to address global climate 
and environmental problems is another important 
priority for Norway. The Clean Development 
Mechanism under the Kyoto Protocol plays a cru­
cial role here. Norway is working towards further 
development of the CDM so that the poorest coun­
tries have more opportunity to take part. 

Funding for women’s rights and gender equality 

Women’s access to and control of financial 
resources is important for development. Education 
and paid employment have been an important 
basis for gender equality for Norwegian women. 
Financial independence is important both for 
women themselves and as a way of promoting gen­
der equality within families. At the same time, 
women’s entry into the workforce over the last 30– 
40 years has been important for Norway’s eco­
nomic growth and prosperity. 

Norway has therefore given high priority to 
promoting women’s rights and gender equality as 
a cross-cutting issue in the negotiations on financ-

Box 6.1  Equal opportunities 

«The greatest gains countries can achieve, 
economically as well as politically, come with 
empowering women, ensuring equal opportu­
nity and health care, and increasing the ratio 
of women’s active participation in working 
life.» 

Source: Prime Minister Jens Stoltenberg’s keynote add­
ress at the opening of the High-level Segment of ECO­
SOC, 3 July 2006 

ing for development. This is not merely a question 
of aid, although Norway as a donor country does 
measure and monitor the proportion of aid funding 
used to promote women’s rights and gender equal­
ity. What is most important is that the developing 
countries understand the value of giving priority to 
women and gender equality in employment policy, 
trade and industry policy, and when developing 
services and welfare schemes. The administration 
of public funding in a way that promotes gender 
equality is one important approach. Many of Nor­
way’s partner countries have already introduced 
initiatives to ensure that public funds are budgeted 
in a way that is more likely to promote gender 
equality. One important reason for the lack of 
progress towards Millennium Development Goal 5 
on improving maternal health is that services to 
protect women’s sexual and reproductive health 
and rights, such as qualified midwifery services 
and maternity clinics, are not given sufficient prior­
ity. These problems need to be addressed by reor­
ganising priorities and addressing skewed power 
structures. 

The Government will: 

•	 maintain the level of Norwegian aid so that it 
corresponds to at least one per cent of gross 
national income 

•	 take part in international cooperation on new 
and innovative financing mechanisms, focus­
ing particularly on better regulation of interna­
tional financial flows and measures to address 
global climate and environmental problems 

•	 work to improve understanding of the links 
between gender equality and economic 
growth, and of the need to manage public fund­
ing in a way that promotes gender equality. 
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6.4 Debt relief and responsible lending 

During the past 10 years, the international commu­
nity has cancelled a large proportion of the debts of 
the poorest and most heavily indebted countries. 
This is the result of two major international initia­
tives, the Heavily Indebted Poor Countries Initia­
tive (HIPC) and the Multilateral Debt Relief Initia­
tive (MDRI). However, much remains to be done, 
particularly for conflict-affected countries and post-
conflict countries. One reason for this is that coun­
tries must provide guarantees that the funds 
released by debt relief are used for the benefit of 
the poorest groups. Debt relief alone is not 
enough. It must be accompanied by a policy to pro­
mote development. 

In the wake of international debt operations, it 
is essential for both lenders and borrowers to 
behave responsibly. The growth in private and 
domestic debt and the emergence of new major 
lenders in Africa is changing the patterns of debt, 
and new challenges are arising. It is now essential 
to prevent a new debt crisis. The financial crisis is 
highlighting the need for guidelines on how devel­
opment can be responsibly funded through loans. 

An important task in the development of such 
guidelines is to agree on a definition of the concept 
of illegitimate debt. In the last few years, a number 
of civil society organisations that are working on 
debt issues have been calling for the concept to be 
expanded to include loans given to undemocratic 

regimes, debt related to purchases of weapons, 
and debt that is being repaid at the expense of 
basic human rights. On the other hand, there are 
creditors who see no reason to discuss illegitimate 
debt at all. This illustrates the differing views in the 
debate. Norway takes an intermediate standpoint. 
Our view is that earlier lending practice should be 
carefully considered so that good routines can be 
developed for the future. This will also provide a 
basis for evaluating whether old outstanding debt 
is legitimate. However, it will be necessary to agree 
on criteria that can be used in practice. The Gov­
ernment is maintaining a satisfactory dialogue and 
close contact with civil society on debt issues. 

Norway has several times been one of the first 
countries to announce contributions to interna­
tional debt operations. This has proved to have a 
positive effect on participation by other countries. 
One example is our contribution to efforts to pre­
vent «vulture funds» from exploiting poor coun­
tries. Vulture funds are companies that buy up old 
debts at deep discounts and then require payment 
from the debtor based on the face value of the orig­
inal debt instruments, plus interest. Vulture funds 
often target countries that will be eligible for inter­
national debt relief and that will afterwards be in a 
better position to repay old debts. Their put for­
ward their claims through negotiations, litigation 
and the seizure of assets. 

Through cooperation with the World Bank, 
Norway has contributed to the buy-back of com-
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Figure 6.7  Debt servicing and poverty-related expenditure 
So far, 33 countries have received debt relief under the Heavily Indebted Poor Countries Initiative (HIPC) and the Multilateral Debt 
Relief Initiative (MDRI), corresponding to a reduction of more than 90 per cent in current value. Lower debt servicing costs have 
made it possible for these countries to increase poverty-related expenditure. 
Source: World Bank, 2008 
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Box 6.2  Cancellation of debt from the 
Norwegian Ship Export Campaign 

(1976–80) 

In 2007, the Government cancelled the remai­
ning debts from the Norwegian ship export 
campaign of 1976–80. This campaign was a 
development policy failure. As creditor, Nor­
way shares responsibility for the resulting 
debt. By cancelling the debts, Norway has 
taken responsibility, and Ecuador, Egypt, 
Jamaica and Peru do not have to pay back 
their outstanding debts. 

The debts were cancelled unilaterally and 
unconditionally. 

mercial debt in Nicaragua. The agreement 
involved purchasing USD 1.3 billion of Nicaragua’s 
private debt for USD 64.4 million, and then cancel­
ling the debt. Norway has also helped Zambia with 
investigation and legal counselling in connection 
with a lawsuit brought by the vulture fund Donegal 
International. The case was heard by the High 
Court in London. In a ground-breaking judgment, 
Donegal International’s claim for USD 55 million 
for a debt instrument for which it had paid only 
USD 3 million was ruled to be unreasonable. How­
ever, Zambia was held to be liable for part of the 
claim. 

Norway is the largest donor to the Public 
Finance and Trade Programme run by the United 
Nations Institute for Training and Research, UNI­
TAR, and plays a leading role in the international 
debate on debt management. Norway has also 
been involved in the preparation of principles and 
guidelines for sustainable lending by the OECD. 
China has also been invited to take part in this 
work, and is showing growing interest in coopera­
tion. 

In accordance with Norway’s policy, funding 
for debt cancellation for poor countries is allocated 
from outside the aid budget. Thus, this funding 
comes in addition to other aid. Norway is the only 
creditor country in the OECD that follows this 
principle, and this has elicited favourable 
responses from international organisations that 
are working on debt issues. 

The Government will: 

•	 continue to pursue a progressive debt policy 
and take part in international debt operations 

•	 continue to uphold the principle that funding 
for debt relief is not to be allocated at the 
expense of the aid budget 

•	 work towards a new and more comprehensive 
mechanism for relieving the debt burdens of 
poor countries 

•	 pursue an active policy vis-à-vis international 
financial institutions and other creditors to 
ensure responsible lending. 

6.5	 International trade and 
development 

The 2002 Conference on Financing for Develop­
ment and the Doha Review Conference in Novem­
ber–December 2008 highlighted not only the need 
to increase transfers from rich to poor countries in 
the form of development assistance and debt relief, 
but also the need to mobilise private resources and 
foreign investment, and the importance of reve­
nues from participation in international trade. The 
conferences also stressed that trade is an impor­
tant engine for development. 

Without revenues from export of its own goods 
and services, a country will not in the long term be 
able to import the goods and services needed for 
economic development and to improve the quality 
of life for its population. Division of labour and spe­
cialisation in the production of goods and services 
that can be sold at a profit are an important basis 
for economic growth. Nevertheless, greater partic­
ipation in international trade and increased export 
revenues are not sufficient in themselves to ensure 
sustainable social and economic development. 
Trade is an important engine of development, but 
must form part of a broad-based, integrated 
national development strategy. 

In a long-term development perspective, a gen­
eral increase in production capacity, a more pro­
ductive agricultural sector and a higher degree of 
processing, industrialisation, and better provision 
of services will be of crucial importance for the abil­
ity of developing countries to make use of trade as 
a means of development This is why international, 
regional and bilateral trade rules must ensure that 
developing countries have the market access and 
policy space they need to develop their production 
capacity and implement restructuring processes, 
such as those mentioned above, through an active 
industrial and employment policy. 

For a growth in trade to lead to poverty reduc­
tion, the country concerned must also pursue an 
equitable national employment and distribution 
policy and take a responsible approach to environ­
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mental concerns. Increased exports and participa­
tion in international trade are therefore a neces­
sary but by no means sufficient condition for devel­
opment. 

The World Trade Organization 

The multilateral trading system in the World Trade 
Organization (WTO) provides an important frame­
work for developing countries’ opportunities to 
benefit from participation in international trade. In 
principle, the WTO rules mean that all members 
are subject to the same rules and have the same 
rights, and thus give protection against arbitrari­
ness and the abuse of power. However, this does 
not mean that prevailing power structures do not 
make themselves felt in the WTO. But power 
imbalances are counteracted by rules that all coun­
tries are bound by and by the fact that countries 
can strengthen their position through alliances and 
cooperation with other countries that are in the 
same situation. 

Insufficient competence and capacity is a major 
problem for many poor developing countries, 
affecting their ability to take part in negotiations 
and other work in ordinary WTO bodies, and espe­
cially their ability to make full use of the WTO dis­

pute settlement system. Various funds and mecha­
nisms have therefore been established to promote 
competence and capacity building in developing 
countries, and the Advisory Centre on WTO Law 
(ACWL) has been set up to provide legal advice 
and support for developing countries in dispute 
settlement proceedings. Norway is one of the larg­
est contributors to the ACWL and other multilat­
eral competence-building mechanisms. 

By becoming members of the WTO, countries 
agree to comply with the multilateral trade regime, 
which by definition limits national freedom of 
action. The benefits of participation in the interna­
tional trading system must therefore be weighed 
against the freedom of action needed in national 
policy. On the other hand, the international trading 
system must take into account the very different 
situations of the member states. 

The WTO rules already provide for a considera­
ble degree of special treatment of developing coun­
tries. The scope of commitments in particular areas 
is different for developed and developing countries, 
and there are special rules for the least developed 
countries (LDCs) in a number of areas. However, it 
is important to continue the development of the 
multilateral trading system to include opportunities 
for accommodating developing countries. 

Box 6.3  The World Trade Organization 

The WTO has three main functions: administe­
ring existing agreements, dispute settlement 
and acting as a forum for negotiations. On 1 
January 2009, the WTO had 153 members. 

The fundamental principles of all WTO rules 
are: 
• Most-favoured nation treatment – in other 

words, no discrimination, all countries must 
be treated equally 

• National treatment – no discrimination 
between domestic goods and firms and a 
country’s own citizens on the one hand and 
foreign goods, firms and citizens on the 
other 

• Binding commitments – member states can­
not withdraw from their commitments other 
than through negotiations with the other 
members. 

There may be several reasons why a country 
chooses to join the WTO and bind itself to follo­
wing trade rules that limit national freedom of 
action: 
• the country’s economic policy becomes more 

stable and predictable, making it less risky 
for its own people and others to invest there 

• it can improve governance and strengthen 
institution-building in the country and make 
it more difficult for strong entities, whether 
multinationals or an elite within the country, 
to exploit weak institutions and political sys­
tems 

• it provides better and more predictable 
access to member countries’ markets, based 
on the principles of most-favoured nation 
treatment and national treatment 

• it ensures the right to take part in negotia­
tions that affect market opportunities and 
the country’s freedom of action 

• it means that a country can make use of the 
WTO’s dispute settlement system if it is 
treated unreasonably by another country. 
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The special situation and interests of the devel­
oping countries are the main focus of the current 
round of WTO negotiations, which began with the 
Ministerial Conference in Doha in 2001 and is 
therefore officially called the Doha Development 
Agenda. The aim is to help developing countries, 
including the poorest of them, to benefit from the 
welfare improvements and increase in prosperity 
that trade can provide, by enabling them to partici­
pate more fully in the multilateral trading system 
and the global economy. The Doha Ministerial 
Declaration particularly highlights the importance 
for developing countries of improved market 
access, balanced rules that give countries the nec­
essary freedom of action to implement a develop­
ment policy adapted to their own needs and stage 
of development, and technical assistance and 
capacity-building programmes. 

The Government will, as a matter of priority, 
seek to ensure that the WTO negotiations result in 
a balanced agreement that also safeguards devel­
oping countries’ interests. Poor countries must not 
be deprived of the right to govern or the instru­
ments that have been important for the develop­
ment of our own nation into a welfare state, and the 
WTO rules must give developing countries suffi­
cient freedom of action to pursue a policy suited to 
their own level of development and circumstances. 

Regional and bilateral trade agreements 

It is becoming increasingly common for developed 
and developing countries to conclude bilateral or 
regional trade agreements, or for developing coun­
tries to do so among themselves. Such agreements 
can be a supplement to the WTO system and 
encourage regional integration and boost trade. 

However, in negotiations between rich and 
poor countries, or between countries from differ­
ent categories of developing countries, the uneven 
distribution of power and negotiating capacity 
often represents a challenge. If the stronger party 
is able and willing to enforce its demands, there 
may be a greater risk that poor countries will be 
pressured into accepting agreements and condi­
tions that they do not want. 

If developing countries choose to conclude 
bilateral agreements, due regard should be paid to 
their level of development and need for political 
freedom of action. 

Aid for trade 

However, better market access and adjustments to 
the international trade regime are not enough. The 

Box 6.4  Norwegian imports from 
developing countries 

In addition to a number of special adjustments 
for developing countries, the WTO rules pro­
vide for special treatment to be given to 
developing countries through lower import 
tariffs (known as «preferences»). The Norwe­
gian Generalised System of Preferences 
(GSP) and the arrangements for duty-free and 
quota-free access for imports of all goods 
from the least developed countries (LDCs) 
and from 14 low-income countries are key 
instruments for increasing imports of goods 
from developing countries. 

The Norwegian market has a great deal of 
purchasing power. Increasing Norwegian 
imports from developing countries is one way 
of encouraging growth and fighting poverty 
in these countries. Norway’s imports from 
developing countries can be summarised as 
follows: 
• In 2007, imports from developing coun­

tries corresponded to about 13 per cent of 
total imports to Norway, and the total value 
was NOK 61 billion, a rise of 16 per cent 
from 2006. 

• The sharp growth in imports in recent 
years is to a large extent explained by a 
rise in imports from China. In 2007, goods 
to a total value of about NOK 28 billion 
were imported from China. This corre­
sponds to about 6 per cent of Norway’s 
total imports. 

• Imports from LDCs totalled approxi­
mately NOK 1.8 billion in 2007, or 0.38 per 
cent of Norway’s total imports. However, 
almost the entire volume of imports from 
LDCs was from only four countries – 
Bangladesh, Cambodia, Equatorial Guinea 
and Liberia – and consisted mainly of 
clothing and textiles from the first two of 
these and oil and ships from the latter two. 
Thus, imports from the 46 other LDCs, 
including all of Norway’s partner coun­
tries in Africa, totalled about NOK 373 mil­
lion, corresponding to only 0.07 per cent 
of Norway’s total imports. 

poorest countries will often not be able to take 
advantage of an open, rule-based international 
trade regime without substantial and effective 



 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 
 

 
 

88 Report No. 13 to the Storting 2008– 2009 
Climate, Conflict and Capital 

development assistance. Norway’s own experience 
shows that granting tariff-free access for imports 
from the least developed countries (LDCs) does 
not necessarily lead to a significant increase in 
imports. There may be various reasons for this, but 
a lack of production capacity and infrastructure, 
weak institutions and insufficient competence are 
serious barriers in many countries. Moreover, 
many poor countries find it very difficult to meet 
standards in areas such as food safety. 

Aid for trade is therefore an important focus 
area, and greater priority will be given to imple­
mentation of the Norwegian action plan Aid for 
Trade, which was launched in 2007. This focuses 
on three priority areas: good governance and the 
fight against corruption, regional trade, and 
women and trade. By giving higher priority to aid 
for trade, the Government wishes to help even the 
poorest countries to take advantage of opportuni­
ties to increase their export revenues. In the Gov­
ernment’s opinion, this will become increasingly 
important in the years ahead. Africa and the LDCs 
will be given priority in Norway’s aid related 
efforts to promote trade. 

Trade barriers and the lack of effective infra­
structure prevail at both national and regional lev­
els. A special challenge for Aid for Trade is to pro­
mote regional integration and trade, especially in 
Africa. Regional cooperation is also necessary to 
meet the special challenges faced by landlocked 
countries. Sustainable trade development is condi­
tional upon trade becoming more diversified, and 
upon breaking the uniform pattern of north-south 
trade. It is therefore essential to develop trade with 
neighbouring countries, but it is also important to 
further develop south-south trade across regional 
borders. 

Trade, environment and development 

Another issue being discussed in the WTO negoti­
ations is liberalisation of trade in environmental 
goods and services. Such goods and services may 
for example be used to measure, prevent or limit 
environmental damage to air, water and soil, or 
may help to increase the production of renewable 
energy (examples are solar panels and wind tur­
bines). By eliminating barriers to trade in environ­
mental goods and services, it may be possible to 
speed up the transfer of environmentally friendly 
products, technology and production systems to 
developing countries. In addition, a number of 
developing countries can offer environmentally 
sound solutions, for example energy solutions, that 
are well adapted to the needs of many poor coun­

tries. Better access to environmentally sound, 
renewable forms of energy can be a means of 
reducing poverty and at the same time reducing 
impacts on the climate. However, in the WTO 
negotiations, agreement has not been reached on 
which goods and services are to be included here, 
and this is therefore a key topic of the negotiations. 
Norway is seeking to ensure that the negotiations 
apply to goods and services that give clear environ­
mental benefits. 

The Government considers that as a general 
rule, the multilateral trading rules and the multilat­
eral environmental agreements should be mutually 
supportive. Norway is working actively within the 
WTO to ensure that this principle continues to be 
applied. It is also the Government’s policy to con­
sider bilateral agreements and EFTA agreements 
in the context of cooperation on environmental 
issues and goals for sustainable development. 

Sustained improvement of welfare requires a 
management regime for the environment and nat­
ural resources that is sound in ecological, social 
and economic terms. Rising production and a 
growth in exports can result in over-exploitation of 
natural resources. This is a particular problem in 
developing countries where there are weaknesses 
in governance and the legal system, and insuffi­
cient capacity to implement national environmental 
policy. Support for establishing and strengthening 
institutions and good governance is therefore also 
an important means of promoting sustainable 
social and economic development. Support for 
national implementation of the multilateral envi­
ronmental agreements is an important contribu­
tion to the development of sound environmental 
and natural resource management. For example, 
the Cartagena Protocol on Biosafety sets out a 
framework for biotechnology and the use of 
genetic resources, something that many develop­
ing countries need. 

Trade and intellectual property rights 

The WTO Agreement on Trade-Related Aspects of 
Intellectual Property Rights (the TRIPS Agree­
ment) is largely based on existing international 
conventions administered by the World Intellec­
tual Property Organization (WIPO), a specialised 
agency of the UN. The TRIPS Agreement protects 
things such as patents, trademarks, and copyright 
against use or copying without permission. Patents 
are particularly important for products that are 
expensive to develop but easy to copy, such as 
pharmaceuticals. 
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The economic and social effects of patents have 
long been debated. In the absence of alternative 
products, the monopoly provided by the patent will 
generally result in higher prices for consumers. At 
the same time, the development of new products 
and production processes will benefit society. A 
fine balance is required to design rules that will 
protect immaterial property rights and at the same 
time not be an obstacle to research and develop­
ment, and to ensure that incentives to develop 
knowledge do not result in a monopoly on knowl­
edge. There has therefore been considerable 
debate on the TRIPS Agreement and its develop­
ment impact in the broad sense, and particularly 
on its effects as regards public health, medicine, 
biodiversity and climate. 

Negotiations are in progress within the frame­
work of the Doha Development Agenda on amend­
ments to the TRIPS Agreement. A large group of 
developing countries is calling for the agreement 
to be amended to harmonise more closely with the 
Convention on Biological Diversity and thus ena­
ble these countries to enjoy more of the benefits 
from the utilisation of their genetic resources. Nor­
way has supported this initiative, and has proposed 
that it should be obligatory to disclose the origin of 
genetic resources that are used in a biotechnologi­
cal invention. Norway is the first OECD country to 
support amendment of the TRIPS Agreement on 
this point, and the proposal was very well received 
by a number of developing countries in the Council 
for TRIPS. Norway has been a strong supporter of 
safeguarding opportunities to maintain local seed 
supplies by not setting too rigid requirements for 
plant variety protection, as well as of providing bet­
ter and cheaper access to essential medicines. 

The Government is also of the opinion that 
developing countries should not be pressured to 
accept provisions in bilateral or regional trade 
agreements under EFTA that restrict their free­
dom of action as regards patent protection, the pro­
tection of confidential test data and plant breeders’ 
rights. 

The Government will: 

•	 contribute to a balanced new WTO agreement 
that gives developing countries better market 
access and freedom of action to pursue a 
national policy adapted to their level of develop­
ment and circumstances 

•	 take developing countries’ level of develop­
ment and need for political freedom of action 
into account in Norway’s trade agreements 

with developing countries, both bilaterally and 
through EFTA 

•	 assist developing countries to increase their 
exports by giving greater priority to the imple­
mentation of the Aid for Trade action plan 

•	 contribute to competence and capacity build­
ing that will improve the ability of developing 
countries to play an effective part in the WTO, 
among other things by making better use of its 
dispute settlement system 

•	 seek to ensure that the WTO negotiations on 
environmental goods and services result in 
both developmental and environmental bene­
fits 

•	 seek to ensure that environment is included as 
a separate topic in negotiations with countries 
that play an important role in economic and 
environmental terms 

•	 seek to ensure that the principle that the multi­
lateral trading rules and the multilateral envi­
ronmental agreements should be mutually 
supportive is upheld in the WTO negotiations 

•	 work towards amendments to the TRIPS 
Agreement requiring disclosure of origin in 
patent applications, and flexible implementa­
tion of the provisions on plant breeders’ rights. 

6.6 Private remittances from migrants 

Figures from the World Bank show that legal flows 
of remittances sent by migrants from developing 
countries to their countries of origin total USD 
200–300 billion per year. This is more than twice 
the total allocations of aid from OECD countries. 
Remittances to the very poorest countries total 
around USD 15 billion. There are wide variations 
between countries. In certain countries, remit­
tances are extremely important, whereas in others 
remittance flows are very low. Remittance flows 
are also affected by developments in the world 
economy. Weaker global growth, which is now 
resulting in rising unemployment in many coun­
tries, may therefore have a major impact on remit­
tance flows. 

Remittances from migrants to poor countries 
can have positive effects at both micro- and macro­
economic level. Foreign currency can fund capital 
investments and other imports that promote devel­
opment. At household level, remittances are an 
important source of income and lead to a rise in the 
standard of living. They can have a considerable 
poverty-reducing effect. Calculations show that 
access to this kind of extra income has reduced 
poverty in Uganda by 11 per cent. And it is esti­



 

 

 
 

  
 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
 

 
  

 
 

 

 

 

90 Report No. 13 to the Storting	 2008– 2009 
Climate, Conflict and Capital 

mated that on average, every Bangladeshi working 
abroad sends home remittances that lift one and a 
half more people above the poverty line – thus 
helping a total of seven million people. 

Research also shows that remittances have 
other positive ripple effects, such as better access 
to services and more resources for education for 
members of the family. Girls in particular receive 
more schooling. On average, girls in families that 
receive remittances go to school for two years 
longer than other girls. This in turn reduces the 
scale of child labour. Remittances have more effect 
when male family members send the funds and the 
women of the family manage their use. Improving 
migrants’ opportunities to transfer money to their 
home countries is therefore an important develop­
ment policy measure. 

However, it is important to distinguish between 
aid, which is used to fund specific development 
goals, and private transfers, which do not necessar­
ily benefit the most vulnerable groups in a country. 
Moreover, there are no international systems to 
ensure that the poor countries, where under­
employment is most prevalent, are given first prior­
ity when it comes to access to the international 
labour market. The distributional effects of remit­
tances are thus highly variable both within and 
between countries, particularly in comparison with 
aid. 

Members of the immigrant community in Nor­
way already send large sums of money to families 
in their countries of origin. Transaction costs are 
relatively high in Norway. A report drawn up by 
the International Peace Research Institute in 2007 
shows that large sums, up to 20 per cent, are 
absorbed by middlemen. 

Facilitating cheaper, more efficient and more 
transparent transfer mechanisms is important in 
both humanitarian and development terms. The 
Ministry of Foreign Affairs has therefore initiated 
a dialogue with relevant authorities and the finan­
cial sector to find good ways of doing this. The Min­
istry is supporting a pilot project for improving the 
website Finansportalen.no. This is intended to pro­
mote competition between actors involved in trans­
fers of money to developing countries. 

Cheaper and more effective transfers through 
legal channels are a means of reducing the scale of 
informal and illegal forms of money transfers. In 
areas where infrastructure is poorly developed, 
such as Somalia and the Kurdish areas in northern 

Iraq, it is almost impossible to transfer money 
through official channels. People are therefore 
dependent on informal channels. The Government 
will continue the dialogue on money transfers with 
the financial sector in developing countries, with 
immigrant groups in Norway, and with the author­
ities in their countries of origin. The aim is to sim­
plify and lower the cost of such transfers, while at 
the same time maintaining the necessary controls, 
as discussed in the white paper on labour immigra­
tion (Report No. 18 (2007–2008) to the Storting) 
and the subsequent recommendation of the Stand­
ing Committee on Local Government and Public 
Administration. 

So far, there have been no applications for 
licences under the current rules to broker cross-
border payments using informal channels such as 
the Hawala system. Licensing requirements, 
inspection and enforcement systems, and meas­
ures to combat money laundering for legal cross-
border payment services are intended to ensure 
confidence in such systems and to prevent tax eva­
sion and possible financing of terrorism. Adjust­
ments to these rules to increase the proportion of 
cross-border money transfers that are made 
through formal, legal mechanisms to countries 
where financial services are poorly developed are 
currently being considered. Any changes will be 
considered in the context of implementation of the 
EU Payment Services Directive, which will enter 
into force on 1 November 2009. The directive sets 
out minimum requirements for cross-border pay­
ment service providers and provides for less strict 
requirements for smaller enterprises. The Govern­
ment will consider whether it would be appropriate 
to make use of these provisions to facilitate the 
establishment of legitimate services targeted spe­
cially towards migrants in Norway. 

The Government will: 

•	 continue its dialogue with relevant actors in 
Norway and in countries that are major recipi­
ents of remittances, in order to facilitate more 
transparent and effective systems for money 
transfers 

•	 upgrade the website Finansportalen.no to 
make it easier to make cross-border money 
transfers, focusing particularly on developing 
countries. 
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7 Actors and arenas
 

The composition and organisation of the various 
aid and development actors, which is often 
referred to as aid architecture, is undergoing rapid 
development and change. Previously, it largely 
consisted of various UN organisations, the World 
Bank and the regional development banks, and 
bilateral donors from the OECD countries, in addi­
tion to a wide range of national and international 
NGOs. 

Now, new private actors are entering the arena 
and making large cash donations to aid-related 
activities. The largest and best known of these is 
the Bill and Melinda Gates Foundation, which 
received USD 26 billion from its founders during 
the period 1994 to 2006. The foundation also 
receives funds from other donors, the best known 
being the billionaire Warren Buffet, who has prom­
ised to transfer a major shareholding to the founda­
tion. The transfer will take place over many years. 
When the donation was announced in June 2006, 

its value was estimated at USD 31 billion, more 
than ten times the Norwegian aid budget for the 
same year. 

A number of new funds, initiatives and organi­
sations have been established to work on develop­
ment issues, many of which are very specialised 
with a narrow thematic focus. Several of them were 
started by rich philanthropists such as Gates and 
Buffet. Others stem from the involvement of 
former politicians, such as the Clinton Foundation. 

At the same time, the expanding economies are 
establishing development and aid activities outside 
their own countries. This is particularly the case 
with the BRICS countries (Brazil, Russia, India, 
China and South Africa), but other countries are 
also becoming involved. 

Institutions and forums that previously focused 
on economic and security policy issues are also 
becoming important arenas for discussing issues 
relevant to development policy. This is the case, for 

Box 7.1  Arab aid 

Arab aid has made an important contribution to 
international development efforts since the 
early 1970s. During periods with high oil prices, 
the aid from these countries has been extensive. 

Arab donors are not part of the Organisation 
for Economic Co-operation and Development 
(OECD) and are therefore not obliged to keep 
statistics for their aid contributions. However, 
official statistics from Saudi Arabia, Kuwait and 
the United Arab Emirates show that the largest 
contributions are given in connection with bila­
teral cooperation, largely in the form of develop­
ment loans. Studies show that substantial unre­
ported funds are also channelled via the authori­
ties and prominent private individuals, such as 
members of the Saudi royal family. Around 80 
per cent of official Arab aid comes from Saudi 
Arabia, which had an aid budget of USD 2.1 bil­
lion in 2007. 

Arab aid primarily goes to countries that are 
members of the Organisation of the Islamic 
Conference. In addition to other Arab countries, 

the main recipients include Egypt, Morocco, 
Sudan and the Palestinian Territory. A study 
carried out by Chr. Michelsen Institute shows 
that Arab aid is largely linked to strategic inte­
rests relating to trade, business, religious cau­
ses and foreign policy. Aid is also used to pro­
mote solidarity between Arab countries. Alt­
hough many of the poorest countries in the 
world are on the list of recipients, there is little 
to indicate that they are given larger amounts 
than less poor developing countries. 

Saudi Arabia’s contribution to the Palesti­
nian Territory is of the same magnitude as the 
Norwegian contribution. Saudi Arabia has also 
made a mark as an important donor to earthqu­
ake victims in Pakistan, and is actively involved 
in the reconstruction of Afghanistan, Iraq and 
Lebanon. A contribution of USD 500 million to 
the World Food Programme that was announ­
ced in connection with the High-Level Meeting 
on Food Security in 2008 attracted extensive 
international attention. 
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Figure 7.1  Status of the Millennium Development Goals 
The Millennium Development Goals were adopted by heads of state and government at the UN Millennium Assembly in 2000. The 
Millennium Campaign has set the international agenda for development. 
Source: UN, The Millennium Development Report 2008 
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example, at the G8 meetings, the Davos meeting 
and in various forums in the EU, NATO and the 
WTO (World Trade Organization). 

New arenas for development policy dialogue 
have also been established. The last three years, 
the EU has arranged European Development 
Days. Since its inception in 2005, the annual meet­
ing of the Clinton Global Initiative, which is held in 
New York before the UN General Assembly, has 
become an increasingly important forum for politi­
cians with international ambitions. 

The large increase in the number of arenas and 
actors in the field of development policy reflect 
both the diversity and fragmentation of the aid 
architecture. Diversity can lead to better funding 
for unsolved tasks and provide greater freedom of 
choice for recipient countries in relation to policy 
and partners. On the other hand, extensive frag­
mentation can lead to double work and extra 
administrative costs for both recipients and 
donors. For example, it is not unusual for the 
health sector in a given country to receive support 
from various funds and UN organisations, the 
World Bank and various NGOs, as well as govern­
ment-to-government aid from a number of donors. 
In some countries, there may be more than 20 
donors in one sector, which represents a substan­
tial administrative burden. In addition, one donor 
country may channel funds through all these dif­
ferent channels to the same sector in the recipient 
country. Critics argue that this makes overall plan­
ning in recipient countries more difficult. 

In any case, the changes in the aid architecture 
necessitate a more strategic approach to our inter­
national cooperation. Norad’s Result Report for 
2008 points out that Norway does not make suffi­
cient use of the strategic advantages of the various 
channels. The Government intends to address this 
issue. 

Pursuing all development policy goals through 
all channels and arenas is neither strategic nor 
effective. The Government will therefore focus on 
the comparative advantages of the various chan­
nels and arenas. 

7.1 Multilateral actors 

The main role of multilateral aid is to co-finance 
tasks that the world community has agreed should 
be addressed in a joint effort. This either involves 
donors making core contributions – i.e. contribu­
tions that are not earmarked for specific purposes 
– to the organisation in question, or co-financing 

larger intenventions, such as UNICEF’s pro­
gramme to secure education for girls in Africa. 

The Government believes that multilateral 
organisations are particularly well suited to play a 
leading role in situations where they have particu­
lar expertise, where the task is part of their man­
date and where their approach has broad donor 
support. Relevant areas include health, education, 
infrastructure, aspects of the fight against HIV/ 
AIDS, agriculture and good governance. 

However, the multilateral organisations are 
also important arenas for exerting an influence 
regarding issues with which Norway is particu­
larly concerned. We pursue the Norwegian politi­
cal agenda through active participation on commit­
tees and boards. This enables us not only to influ­
ence the organisations themselves, but also to 
influence other member countries. Strengthening 
women’s rights and empowerment is one area 
where Norway works systematically in various 
multilateral forums. 

We also use our engagement in multilateral 
organisations to strengthen efforts in areas in 
which Norway has a particular political interest, 
but where Norway’s own expertise or capacity is 
limited. Efforts to prevent deforestation are an 
obvious example, as are environmental efforts in 
general. The situation for important target groups 
such as children, the disabled and indigenous peo­
ples can also be improved through targeted multi­
lateral funding. For example, the United Nations 
Development Fund for Women (UNIFEM) is an 
important tool for strengthening the rights and job 
opportunities of women and their families. 

In some cases, Norway can make the greatest 
contribution to multilateral efforts by influencing 
the way the much greater funding provided by the 
other donors is used through our work on various 
boards. In other cases, it is important to ensure 
that other countries are able to exert a greater 
influence, even where the issue concerned is not 
so important for Norway. This applies in particular 
to our cooperation with the World Bank, as well as 
with various UN organisations and global funds 
and foundations. 

Norwegian contributions can also act as a cata­
lyst in terms of bringing new money into develop­
ment efforts. Or we may earmark multilateral aid 
for areas that are of particular importance to us. 
Multilateral aid that is reserved for specific coun­
tries is called multi-bilateral aid. In some countries 
in Latin America, for example, Norway has wished 
to show solidarity and support new governments. 
In such cases, it has been an advantage to channel 
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funds through UN organisations as the UN is 
already established in the countries in question. 

The multilateral organisations are important 
for meeting humanitarian needs following man-
made or natural disasters, which often requires 
extensive international coordination. They also 
have an important role to play in the prevention of 
humanitarian disasters and in reconstruction. In 
addition, multilateral aid has a special function in 
what are known as aid orphans – countries that 
receive limited government-to-government sup­
port and would otherwise be at risk of losing out in 
the aid context. 

The multilateral organisations have a key role 
in the work of implementing the Millennium Devel­
opment Goals agenda. If they are to succeed in 
meeting this challenge, it is important that their 
quality and effectiveness are continuously 
improved. 

The United Nations 

The UN has a broad presence and is represented in 
a large number of countries. When a crisis arises, 
the UN will be one of the first international organi­
sations to provide help. The UN maintains close 
contact with the authorities in the countries con­
cerned, and often raises controversial issues with 
them. 

Through the various UN organisations, Nor­
way can channel aid to groups and initiatives in a 
way that reduces the administrative burden both 
on ourselves and on the recipients. 

The effectiveness of the UN’s aid efforts can be 
hampered by the fact that its capacity and exper­
tise is spread over a large number of entities that 
work in a fragmented fashion and without ade­
quately coordinated strategies and goals. The gap 
between the tasks the member states impose on 
the UN and the resources made available to it 
comes in addition. The fact that the various UN 
organisations are constantly having struggle to 
secure funding – often in competition with each 
other – also reduces the UN’s effectiveness and 
ability to achieve goals. This demands time and 
energy that should be concentrated on solving the 
tasks at hand. 

In 2006, the then UN Secretary-General, Kofi 
Annan, asked Prime Minister Jens Stoltenberg to 
co-chair a high-level panel on UN reform, with par­
ticular focus on its performance as a development 
actor. The panel’s report, which was presented in 
November the same year, recommends the estab­
lishment of One UN at country level, with one 
leader, supported by a country team consisting of 

Figure 7.2  Norway is working for a UN-led world 
order. 
Photo: UN Photo/John Isaac 

all the UN organisations present in the country in 
question. Clear priorities for the UN’s efforts in the 
country are to clarified through the adoption of one 
programme, which is to by funded via one budget. 

The high-level panel’s report has acted as a cat­
alyst for an extensive and concrete reform process. 
The panel’s recommendations have been tested in 
eight pilot countries (Albania, Cape Verde, Mozam­
bique, Pakistan, Rwanda, Tanzania, Vietnam and 
Uruguay) since the beginning of 2007. The feed­
back from the authorities in these countries is that 
they now find the UN’s activities more straightfor­
ward and relevant, and better able to address the 
countries’ needs and priorities. The increased visi­
bility and clarification of the UN’s role also appears 
to have improved funding of the UN’s programme 
in the pilot countries. 

The high-level panel pointed out that the mem­
ber states should look more closely at their fund­
ing of the UN. Unpredictability and widespread 
and detailed earmarking of contributions makes it 
difficult for the UN organisations to plan and allo­
cate resources in accordance with the priorities 
imposed on them. The panel therefore emphasised 
the importance of giving as much funding as possi­
ble in the form of core contributions that are as pre­
dictable as possible. Earmarking should be 
reduced to a minimum. 

The Government will therefore continue to 
attach importance to maintaining a high propor­
tion of core contributions and will continue the 
practice of making indicative multi-year commit­
ments to the key UN organisations. As regards 
other contributions, emphasis will be placed on 
linking earmarking to the main priorities adopted 
by the organisations’ governing bodies. The Gov­
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ernment will combine increased financial predicta­
bility with clear requirements and expectations of 
the UN organisations concerned. If these expecta­
tions are not met, funds may be reallocated to other 
UN organisations or other actors. 

Norway maintains a critical but constructive 
dialogue with the UN and its various organisations 
on the need for reform and improvement. A great 
deal remains to be done before the UN can fully 
deliver the results we, as member states, want and 
expect. However, the substantial progress made 
during the last two years gives grounds to hope 
that the UN will succeed in making the adaptations 
necessary to ensure that it remains a key develop­
ment actor, also at country level. 

The World Bank 

The World Bank has an office in every partner 
country and its aid delivery is regarded as effec­
tive. The bank’s employees are generally very 
highly qualified, and they can seem domineering in 
their dealings with national public administrations, 
which are often weak. It is important for the bank’s 
credibility that it broadens its expertise base, with 
greater diversity in terms of qualifications and 
country of origin. There is currently a great pre­
ponderance of economists. 

The World Bank has been criticised for acting 
as a proponent of a free market economy and pro­
moting conditionality in economic policy. In many 
Latin American countries, the World Bank has 
been perceived as an agent of the US, particularly 
following the debt crisis in the 1980s. Norway’s 
view is that it is wrong to impose economic models 
and solutions on countries. However, the emphasis 
on national ownership and the fact that many coun­
tries have undemocratic regimes may constitute a 
dilemma. Countries should decide themselves 
which policies and measures they wish to imple­
ment, but in certain areas it is also legitimate and 
necessary for donors to attach conditions to grants 
and loans, for example to ensure that these are 
used as agreed. Aid without conditions is aid with­
out policy and without proper control. We should 
rather ask what conditions are legitimate to set in 
connection with debt relief and lending. 

Norway has, for several years, promoted a 
reduction in the number of conditions the World 
Bank and the International Monetary Fund attach 
to their loans in general. Several studies, including 
a review initiated by Norway in 2006, show that 
conditionality has been reduced. There is now 
broad agreement about the need to reduce the 
number and scope of conditions. The Government 

still wishes the World Bank to set conditions that 
ensure that funds are spent on reducing poverty 
and do not go astray, but an independent country 
should be able to decide itself which tasks are to be 
a public sector responsibility and what should be 
left to the private sector. This principle should also 
apply to borrowing countries. 

In connection with the Conference on Condi­
tionality that was held in Oslo in 2006, four country 
studies were carried out on privatisation and liber­
alisation requirements in connection with loans 
from the international financial institutions (IFIs). 
The conclusions from Mozambique were particu­
larly interesting. It turned out that the World Bank 
had originally insisted on privatisation of the 
energy sector, but, on the basis of an analysis from 
the Scandinavian countries, the bank agreed to the 
adoption of a different model. This shows that it 
can be important to develop alternative analyses 
and models. It is difficult for a poor country that is 
not in a position to carry out analyses and studies 
itself to know what the alternatives are to the 
advice given by the IFIs. It must be possible for 
other partners to provide alternative assessments 
and to strengthen and utilise local expertise before 
a final decision is reached. Experience shows that 
it is in countries where ownership of reforms and 
development strategies is strong that the greatest 
progress is made. 

The International Monetary Fund 

The International Monetary Fund (IMF) works 
within three main areas: macroeconomic surveil­
lance, the provision of short-term loans to coun­
tries experiencing balance of payment difficulties, 
and technical assistance. The IMF is not a develop­
ment institution like the World Bank, and it has no 
special expertise in relation to combating poverty. 

Efforts to promote sound economic policies 
take place in all of these areas. The IMF furnishes 
loans to countries with balance of payment prob­
lems. Low-income countries can receive loans at a 
very low or concessional interest rate through var­
ious facilities, including the Exogenous Shocks 
Facility, which helps countries to deal with eco­
nomic shocks as a result of external factors. The 
IMF provides technical assistance in a number of 
areas in the finance sector. The surveillance of 
member countries’ economic development is also 
important. The economy of low-income countries 
with an IMF programme is monitored very closely, 
and development reviewed regularly. Many donors 
of government-to-government aid want assurance 
that recipients are pursuing an economic policy 
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that ensures that the money is well spent. While 
there is no formal connection between the IMF’s 
evaluations and financial flows, the IMF can influ­
ence the provision of aid and private capital 
through its assessments. 

However, there are aspects of the IMF’s activi­
ties that are problematic and that have been the 
subject of criticism. Although the fund has a remit 
to furnish short-term balance of payment loans, 
several of its loans to developing countries have 
been more long-term in nature as the balance of 
payments deficit in many countries has been more 
long-term. The IMF has thus acquired a develop­
ment role that it was not intended to have. 

In addition, the IMF has not given countries 
sufficient room for manoeuvre when loan pro­
grammes have been drawn up. A report from its 
Independent Evaluation Office shows that the 
guidelines have not been followed up. Require­
ments are stipulated for structural changes that are 
too extensive and detailed and that concern areas 
in which the organisation does not have sufficient 
expertise. 

The IMF has recently undertaken an extensive 
quota and voice reform to ensure better represen­
tation for low-income countries and emerging 
economies. This is an important step towards mak­
ing the IMF more democratic. 

The Government believes that the IMF should 
continue to have an important role in promoting 
economic growth and reducing poverty, but that 
there is also room for improvement. The IMF 
should concentrate on its core tasks and not make 
liberalisation or privatisation a condition for loans. 

The Government would like to see reforms that 
strengthen the IMF’s legitimacy and effectiveness. 
A key goal in this context is to ensure constructive 
cooperation and dialogue between the IMF and 
international development institutions in order to 
ensure effective poverty reduction. 

Global funds 

The global funds involve a wide range of partners 
and are characterised by a particular focus on 
results. Norway has contributed to the establish­
ment of several of the global health funds. Today, 
we have a central role in two of them: GAVI (the 
Global Alliance for Vaccines and Immunization) 
and the Global Fund to Fight AIDS, Tuberculosis 
and Malaria (GFATM). Global funds are managed 
along the lines of multilateral organisations. In a 
few years, they have achieved a prominent role in 
their respective fields, in terms of both size and 
results. In 2007, the Global Fund to Fight AIDS, 

Box 7.2  Global funds have large target 
groups 

During the five years since its inception, the 
Global Fund to Fight AIDS, Tuberculosis and 
Malaria has funded AIDS treatment for 1.4 
million people and tuberculosis treatment for 
3.3 million. Forty-four million people have 
received treatment for malaria. In 2007, the 
fund provided 46 million mosquito nets, an 
increase of 155 per cent compared with 2006. 
The increase in the proportion of people who 
received treatment for AIDS was 88 per cent 
and 65 per cent for tuberculosis. Since it was 
established in 2002, the fund has provided 
more than USD 10 billion for more than 550 
programmes in a total of 136 different coun­
tries. 

Figures from the World Health Organiza­
tion (WHO) show that, at the end of 2008, 
GAVI had helped to vaccinate 213 million chil­
dren and had saved 3.4 million lives. 

Tuberculosis and Malaria funded around 20 per 
cent of the international effort to combat AIDS, 
two-thirds of the fight against tuberculosis and 
three-quarters of the fight against malaria. 

The funds have been established to boost 
efforts in specific areas that can produce rapid 
results without undermining other efforts. The 
establishment of global schemes and funds reflects 
the need to find new ways of achieving results 
faster and more effectively. At the same time, these 
efforts must be based on the UN’s normative man­
date. The multilateral health organisations are 
therefore part-owners of the global funds on a par 
with donors from the private, public and voluntary 
sectors. The funds are intended to co-exist along­
side the traditional health organisations, and to 
supplement them, not replace them. 

The global funds and various recently estab­
lished foundations have been criticised for increas­
ing the fragmentation of aid efforts. It has been 
claimed that they undermine the UN system by 
taking over tasks that should really be the job of 
the UN. On the other hand, it has been pointed out 
that the traditional institutions are benefiting from 
this competition and effectiveness is being 
improved. 

The Government believes that these funds and 
the UN system supplement each other well and 
have a mutually stimulating effect. The global 
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Box 7.3  The EU Commission 

In 2006, aid channelled through the EU Com­
mission by EU member states amounted to 
EUR 7.5 billion, more than three times as 
much as Norway’s aid budget for the same 
year. In all, the EU countries account for 
around 60 per cent of aid worldwide. The 
EU’s strength as a regional actor and catalyst 
for European development is probably best 
manifested in the regional dialogues the EU 
conducts, for example with the Asian-Pacific 
region and the African Union. 

As a result of the EU’s enlargement east­
wards, there are now new European donor 
states. These donors are an important 
resource for the EU’s development policy in 
that they have different international contacts 
and domestic experience. Poland, the Czech 
Republic and Slovakia appear to have progres­
sed furthest in terms of developing an inde­
pendent development policy. Ireland has also 
gone from being a recipient of aid to beco­
ming an important donor. The EU’s goal is for 
the new member states to achieve an aid 
volume of 0.33 per cent of gross national 
income, while the old member states are 
expected to achieve the target set by the 
Organisation for Economic Co-operation and 
Development of allocating 0.7 per cent of 
gross national income to aid by 2015. 

The fact that the EU countries channel 
funds through the EU Commission and that 
the EU Commission is becoming a multilate­
ral actor entails a diversion of funds that these 
countries would otherwise have allocated to 
bilateral efforts or measures funded via the 
UN or the World Bank. This may lead to 
increased fragmentation, but the coordination 
of aid efforts could also improve. It is likely 
that most importance will be attached to the 
latter. 

funds have produced good results in the space of 
just a few years. In part, this has been made possi­
ble by the UN system, while the UN’s own results 
are in part due to the work of the funds. 

It has also been claimed that the funds’ focus on 
specific areas weakens national structures and sus­
tainable systems. This may be a particular problem 
in weak states where capacity is already low. In its 
work on various boards, Norway has strongly 

advocated that funds should focus more on work­
ing within the framework of national systems, 
while at the same time focusing on and increasing 
the added value they generate, including mobilis­
ing broad groups of actors. 

Norway was one of several key partners that 
worked towards the adoption of a more efficient 
governance structure for GAVI in 2007. It has also 
been emphasised that the funds must continue to 
be based on the UN’s normative mandate for the 
field of health, even though they are now too large 
to be administered by WHO and UNICEF. Norway 
is also at the forefront of efforts to ensure that glo­
bal funds coordinate their procedures and proc­
esses more closely with other multilateral actors, 
without reducing the added value they generate 
and their focus on results. 

Multilateral aid, including multi-bilateral aid, 
accounted for 50 per cent of Norwegian aid in 2007. 

The Government will: 

•	 continue to contribute to strengthening the 
international system, through both funding and 
active work on boards 

•	 continue to pursue its strong commitment to 
UN reform and follow up good results with 
indicative commitments over several years 

•	 continue its efforts to ensure that the World 
Bank does not press for privatisation 

•	 strengthen developing countries’ own capacity 
to develop and assess political alternatives 

•	 be a driving force in the efforts to ensure that 
the global health funds strengthen the whole 
health system in a country and not just individ­
ual bodies 

•	 continue its efforts to foster new, non-tradi­
tional ways of mobilising funds for develop­
ment 

•	 channel more funding to sectors in which Nor­
way wishes to support agreed international 
efforts through multilateral actors 

•	 continue to exert pressure on the multilateral 
organisations to work systematically and pur­
posefully for women’s rights and gender equal­
ity. 

7.2	 Government-to-government 
cooperation 

Government-to-government cooperation is 
based on political dialogue and aid that is provided 
directly by the Norwegian authorities to the 
authorities in the recipient country. The dialogue is 
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conducted both at top level and in connection with 
the actual use of Norwegian funds. These funds 
are included in the country’s ordinary budget sys­
tems and are specified in the national budget. Aid 
may be given in the form of sector support or 
directly to concrete projects. Some is given in the 
form of general budget support, i.e. to be allocated 
according to the priorities set by democratic struc­
tures and with the approval of the parliament in 

Box 7.4  International cooperation for 
increased aid effectiveness 

The Paris Declaration, which was adopted in 
2005, is the most important international 
framework for increasing the effectiveness of 
development aid. Its three main principles 
are: mutual agreement to use the recipient 
countries’ national development strategies 
(ownership), the use and thereby strengt­
hening of the recipient countries’ systems 
(alignment) and collaboration and division of 
labour between donors (harmonisation). The 
goal is to strengthen the position of recipients 
in their cooperation with donors, and not least 
to make them more accountable to their own 
citizens. 

The Evaluation of the Paris Declaration – 
Synthesis Report that was produced ahead of 
the High-Level Forum on Aid Effectiveness in 
Accra in September 2008 showed that pro­
gress is being made, but that improvements 
are less extensive than hoped. There are, 
however, variations between developing coun­
tries, between donors and also between the 
different commitments in the declaration. 
The report shows that donors’ use of the reci­
pient country systems has not increased in 
step with improvements in these systems. In 
many countries, a great deal of aid to the 
public sector is still not reflected in the coun­
tries’ national budgets. This is serious 
because the use of the aid funds received is 
thereby excluded from the democratic decis­
ion-making process, at the same time as 
access to information and control is difficult. 

In the international context, Norway has 
advocated working on the aid effectiveness 
agenda from a broader development perspec­
tive. The Paris Declaration allows for this, and 
the issue received considerable attention at 
the Accra meeting. The Government attaches 
great importance to this issue. 

connection with its consideration of the national 
budget. Budget support both provides funding for 
important sectors and strengthens democratic 
budget processes in the countries concerned. 

The recipient country’s own poverty reduction 
strategy forms the basis for long-term develop­
ment cooperation. The Government will use tar­
geted budget support in order to underpin the part­
ner country’s own efforts and help it to develop a 
well-functioning state, strengthen democratic proc­
esses and improve public welfare services. In its 
dialogue with recipient countries, Norway will con­
tinue to emphasise good governance and good 
framework conditions for economic development. 

As countries establish better systems for budg­
eting and financial management, the aim is that an 
increasing proportion of government-to-govern­
ment aid will be given as general budget support or 
as programme support to priority sectors. 

Government-to-government cooperation is a 
useful instrument for strengthening direct cooper­
ation between Norway and recipient countries. It 
gives Norway a quite different role than we have 
through other aid channels. It provides a good 
arena for discussions about values and policy 
development and for the exchange of experience. 
It gives us an opportunity to bring to the fore issues 
that are particularly important to us, such as 
human rights, good financial management with a 
view to preventing corruption, and the rights of 
particularly vulnerable groups such as children 
and young people, sexual minorities, indigenous 
peoples and the disabled. We can share Norway’s 
experience in important areas such as women’s 
rights and empowerment, our distribution policy 
and the development of our welfare state. And, not 
least, it also provides a good platform for direct dis­
cussions about how the country’s development 
plans can incorporate measures to address climate 
and environmental challenges. 

Government-to-government cooperation also 
provides a good basis on which to build alliances 
that can be useful in other arenas. For example, the 
extensive political capital we have accumulated 
over many years of bilateral cooperation was an 
important factor in connection with the Convention 
on Cluster Munitions that was signed in Oslo in 
December 2008. 

Government-to-government cooperation 
means that recipients have a broad range of donors 
and can choose between these donors’ different 
approaches to the various sectors. On the other 
hand, a large number of donors also leads to frag­
mentation of the overall aid effort. The administra­
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Box 7.5  Strategic development cooperation generates huge gains in Zambia 

Zambia earned very little from its copper mines 
for many years despite huge price increases and 
large profits in the industry in general. Its 
mining agreements were unfavourable with a 
tax rate of between three and five per cent of the 
value of the country’s copper exports. This was 
very low compared with other countries. Calcu­
lations showed that Zambia was missing out on 
the equivalent of the total international develop­
ment aid to the country every year. 

Using Norway’s experience of managing 
natural and mineral resources as a basis, the 
Norwegian Embassy worked together with the 
UK Department for International Development 
to provide technical and financial support to the 
Zambian authorities. The goal was to prepare 
and implement changes in the conditions for 
international mining operations. Reasonable 
consideration of the international mining com­
panies’ needs for profitability, investment and 
technology transfer had to be weighed against 
the need to ensure that Zambia had a reasona­
ble share of the profits. 

The main principle underlying the coopera­
tion was to increase access to broad independent 
analyses, experience and information so that the 

Zambian authorities could make independent 
political decisions concerning the overall stra­
tegy and reforms. The Zambian authorities were 
in charge of the process of procuring and selec­
ting consultants and companies, and they estab­
lished direct relations with them. 

In 2008, the Zambian authorities introduced 
a new tax regime that increased the average 
effective tax rate in the mining sector from 31 
per cent to 47 per cent. This corresponds to the 
level in other major mining countries. Zambia 
thus increased its revenues in the first quarter 
of 2008 by 300 per cent compared with the previ­
ous year. If global copper prices stabilise at a 
high level, it is estimated that, in the space of a 
few years, Zambia’s annual tax revenues will 
correspond to its annual development aid. The 
next challenge will be to ensure that this money 
is spent in a sustainable manner. 

With the help of some NOK 5 million provi­
ded by Norway and good use of Norwegian 
expertise, Zambia increased its tax revenues by 
more than NOK 1 billion in 2008 alone. This is 
an outstanding example of the strategic use of 
aid and expertise to influence large financial 
flows. 

tive burden on the recipient country may become 
very high. 

Through the Paris Declaration on Aid Effec­
tiveness, substantial efforts have been made to 
reduce this burden, but there is still a long way to 
go. The Accra Agenda for Action of 2008 empha­
sises that it is vital to further improve the division 
of labour between donors in order to reduce the 
administrative burden on recipients. 

In the Government’s view, therefore, it is 
important for Norway to continue to concentrate 
aid on fewer sectors. We should primarily limit our 
bilateral cooperation to areas in which Norway has 
particular expertise and where this expertise is in 
demand. Our bilateral cooperation may also be 
linked to areas where Norway’s political weight 
can increase recipient countries’ attention to key 
issues on the Norwegian agenda, such as climate 
change and the rights of vulnerable groups. The 
areas in which Norway becomes involved must be 
determined through dialogue with the authorities 
in the country concerned. 

Government-to-government aid accounted for 
18 per cent of Norwegian aid in 2007. 

The Government will: 

•	 concentrate government-to-government coop­
eration on sectors where Norway has expertise 
that is in demand 

•	 reduce the number of sectors for government­
to-government cooperation at the country level 
administered by individual embassies 

•	 use the political dialogue with recipient coun­
tries to promote women’s rights and gender 
equality. 

7.3 Civil society and NGOs 

Non-governmental organisations (NGOs) have tra­
ditionally been based on broad popular participa­
tion and have been a channel for privately raised 
funds. Over time, however, public funding has 
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come to account for an increasingly large share of 
their budgets. NGOs have become a major channel 
for Norway’s development aid. In 2007, funding via 
international and local NGOs amounted to NOK 
4.3 billion, or roughly a fifth of the total aid budget. 

The Government believes that NGOs have a 
particular role to play in building up their sister 
organisations and interest groups in developing 
countries and in strengthening the role of local 
spokespersons in areas such as environmental 
issues, human rights, freedom of the media and 
anti-corruption. One of their advantages in aid 
delivery is their ability to reach areas and popula­
tion groups whose needs the state is unable to 
meet. NGOs also have a high degree of flexibility 
in critical situations where a swift response is 
required. They can often be in place very soon 
after both man-made and natural disasters. 

NGOs are important service providers that 
help to ensure that the fundamental rights to life, 
health, education and participation in society are 
attainable for an increasingly larger proportion of 
the population. Sami organisations and institutions 
have long had extensive contact with other indige­
nous peoples elsewhere in the world, and they 
have built up substantial expertise. This expertise 

can prove valuable in connection with efforts in 
areas with indigenous populations. In addition to 
providing services, NGOs are expected to realise 
the opportunities for achieving ripple effects in the 
form of capacity building and changes in attitude. 

A series of evaluations since 2006 have docu­
mented that Norwegian NGOs have become 
highly professional actors. However, it is more dif­
ficult to ascertain whether they have made a signif­
icant contribution to strengthening civil society in 
poor countries through partnerships with local 
actors. Local partners often state that they are una­
ble to distinguish between Norwegian NGOs’ roles 
as donors and partners, and as actors with their 
own agendas. It is also claimed that foreign NGOs, 
Norwegian ones included, have a tendency to dom­
inate civil society organisations and their agendas 
in the partner countries concerned. This also 
applies to cooperation at the global level. 

In this complex situation, it is important that 
Norwegian NGOs assess the effectiveness of their 
efforts and their role in relation to the overall 
development agenda in the countries in which they 
operate. It is also necessary to increase focus on 
cooperating with legitimate and representative 
local partners who cover a broad spectrum of inter-

Figure 7.3 NGOs play an important role in crises 
Photo: Yasuyoshi Chiba/Scanpix 
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ests and agendas, with which various groups are 
concerned in developing countries. Work will con­
tinue on exploring and implementing alternative 
forms of support for civil society in poor countries, 
such as direct support for funding mechanisms 
and national umbrella organisations that channel 
funds to the organisations in the recipient coun­
tries. The aim is to boost local ownership. 

In the space of a few years, globalisation and 
new communications technology have opened up 
new opportunities for international awareness-rais­
ing efforts. NGOs have successfully grasped 
opportunities to mobilise international public opin­
ion on fundamental issues relating to development. 
They have become actors to reckon with in all 
international contexts. 

It is an important task for the Government to 
support the international efforts of civil society 
organisations in areas such as environment and cli­
mate change, deforestation and forest degradation, 
gender equality, anti-corruption, conflict resolution 
and peace-building. It is crucial that representa­
tives of civil society in poor countries have the 
opportunity to participate fully in this work. Nor­
wegian NGOs have a particular responsibility for 
helping their partners to gain the access and exper­
tise they need to make use of information, commu­
nication channels and forums. 

By extension, it is also important to implement 
information and awareness-raising measures in 
Norway regarding environmental and develop­
ment issues in a global perspective, and this should 
be an integrated part of Norway’s international 
development cooperation efforts. Civil society has 
an important role as a driving force and watchdog 
– in both rich and poor countries. 

Migrant communities – diasporas 

A diaspora is a group of immigrants and their 
descendants who have an attachment to a specific 
country of origin. Large groups from Pakistan and 
Somalia live in Norway, but there are also groups 
from Iraq, Vietnam, Iran and Sri Lanka, as well as 
the US, Russia, Turkey and a number of European 
countries. 

These minority groups have resources that 
have been utilised too little in the Norwegian devel­
opment policy context. They possess valuable 
knowledge about culture, language, society, his­
tory, religion and politics. Both individuals and 
organisations have good contact with key milieus 
in their own or their parents’ country of origin. 

They can provide important information and 
improve our understanding of ongoing political 
processes. 

In 2008, the Ministry of Foreign Affairs 
launched Pilot Project Pakistan with a view to 
increasing the local development effect of remit­
tances. Under this scheme, Norwegian–Pakistani 
organisations can apply for funding corresponding 
to the amount they themselves are sending. The 
project will increase awareness about development 
efforts in the groups concerned, thus facilitating 
cooperation with development aid organisations. 
The pilot project will also strengthen the position 
of diaspora and immigrant organisations in the 
competition for aid funds. The pilot project is for 
projects in Pakistan. The experience gained will be 
an important factor for assessing whether the 
model can be expanded to include other countries. 

It is also important for other bodies in Norway 
to realise what a resource communities and groups 
with links to relevant developing countries can rep­
resent. NGOs, research communities and, not 
least, the development aid administration have a 
great deal to gain from closer collaboration with 
these groups. This is a good basis for forming stra­
tegic alliances in the time ahead. 

Recruiting people from multicultural back­
grounds will be an important contribution towards 
ensuring that the foreign service reflects develop­
ments in Norwegian society, and will also help to 
ensure that the particular competence that these 
groups possess is used. 

Support channelled via Norwegian, interna­
tional and local NGOs accounted for 21 per cent of 
Norwegian aid in 2007. 

The Government will: 

•	 continue its close cooperation with Norwegian 
NGOs, with regard to both their development 
aid work and their information and lobbying 
activities in Norway 

•	 continue to support NGOs’ global efforts in 
key areas 

•	 emphasise closer cooperation with migrant 
communities in Norway and organisations that 
work on development issues 

•	 carry out a pilot project in Pakistan based on 
co-financing by the Pakistani diaspora and the 
public sector. Consider the possibility of corre­
sponding initiatives in other countries 

•	 ensure the recruitment of persons from multi­
cultural backgrounds to the foreign service. 
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7.4 Business and industry and the 
private sector 

The Government is encouraging Norwegian enter­
prises to become more strongly involved in the pri­
vate sector in developing countries. In addition to 
providing valuable capital, which provides a basis 
for economic growth, such involvement can help to 
promote important values and principles in the 
development of the country’s own private sector. 

There are therefore a number of publicly-
funded support schemes aimed at promoting such 
partnerships and reducing the risk for Norwegian 
companies of participating in developing these 
markets. Norad (the Norwegian Agency for Devel-

Box 7.6  Norfund 

Norfund is a state-owned investment fund 
that seeks to strengthen the private sector 
and hence the development of poor countries 
through profitable investments. The aim is to 
increase these countries’ ability to create 
value, generate economic growth and develop 
a sustainable economy. In addition to its com­
mercial goal, Norfund must conduct its activi­
ties in accordance with fundamental prin­
ciples for Norwegian development policy and 
contribute to a better working environment 
and working conditions in the countries con­
cerned. 

Norfund invests in private enterprises, 
thus helping to boost employment, facilitate 
the transfer of technology and expertise, and 
increase tax revenues. It has an equity of 
NOK 4.5 billion. It is Norway’s largest inves­
tor in microfinance and hydroelectric power 
in Africa, Asia and Latin America. Norfund’s 
investment capital comes from annual allocati­
ons from the development aid budget. 

In step with the higher priority given to 
private sector development in development 
policy, Norfund has been assigned more 
wide-ranging tasks relating to renewable 
energy and microfinance, and to cooperation 
between public and private actors on finan­
cing. The fund’s strategy is based on a sector-
by-sector focus within geographically limited 
areas in which the fund itself has expertise 
and capital to offer partners. Norfund also 
facilitates investment projects in the poorest 
countries, with a view to becoming more 
active in these. 

opment Cooperation) and Norfund (the Norwe­
gian Investment Fund for Developing Countries) 
have cooperated on the establishment of an advi­
sory office for enterprises that wish to make use of 
these schemes. 

Embassies can also provide country-specific 
knowledge and open doors in the countries con­
cerned. 

The objective of Norfund is to contribute to eco­
nomic development in poor countries through 
profitable investments. In recent years, Norfund 
has received almost NOK 500 million annually in 
new investment capital. The fund has also been 
assigned new tasks through strategic escalation of 
collaboration between public and private actors. 

There is a substantial flow of direct Norwegian 
investments to developing countries. The largest 
flows relate to investments made by the largest 
companies in Norway, primarily in countries with 
oil and gas or other natural resources. An impor­
tant task for Norwegian development policy is to 
increase the private sector’s willingness to make 
direct investments in developing countries in other 
areas as well. 

An important factor in this context is the Nor­
wegian Microfinance Initiative, in which the Nor-

Box 7.7  The Norwegian Microfinance 
Initiative 

Many poor people are unable to obtain bank 
loans because they do not have a regular 
income or are unable to provide security. This 
is particularly true for women, because in 
many countries their rights to inherit and own 
land, housing and other property are weak. 
Microfinance provides financial services for 
poor people. In addition to providing loans, 
emphasis is also placed on facilitating saving, 
insurance schemes, money transfers and 
such like. 

The Norwegian Microfinance Initiative 
was established in September 2008 as a 
public–private partnership between the Nor­
wegian authorities and the private sector 
actors Ferd, DnB Nor, KLP and Storebrand. 
The fund has a total equity capital of NOK 600 
million, which is used to invest in microfi­
nance institutions. The goal of the Norwegian 
Microfinance Initiative is to strengthen the 
position of the poor in developing countries 
by helping to create jobs and welfare on a sus­
tainable basis. 
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wegian state and private investors have each con­
tributed 50 per cent to a fund that will invest in 
microcredit activities in developing countries. 

It is also possible to develop corresponding col­
laborations in areas such as renewable energy and 
in strategic cooperation agreements between the 
state and major investors. The Government’s stra­
tegic partnerships with Yara and SNPower are 
examples of the latter. 

Support for private sector engagement in devel­
oping countries accounted for eight per cent of 
development aid in 2007. 

The Government will: 

•	 help the Norwegian business community to 
increase its involvement in developing coun­
tries through various support schemes and 
active facilitation on the part of embassies in 
relevant countries 

•	 help to develop public–private partnerships 
between the Norwegian authorities and private 
sector actors with a view to mobilising private 
capital for viable investments in the private sec­
tor in developing countries. 

7.5 Choice of partner countries 

Traditionally, Norway has used the terms «partner 
countries» and «main partner countries» to 
describe the main groups of recipients of govern­
ment-to-government aid. These countries have 
received support for long-term development 
efforts under regional allocations (category 03.10 
in the budget proposal). The arrangement meant a 
high degree of predictability for recipient coun­
tries, but in practice there was little connection 
between how the countries were categorised and 
how much aid they received. Sudan and Afghani­
stan were among Norway’s largest recipient coun­
tries, but because funding came from budget cate­
gories other than 03.10, they were not referred to 
as partner countries. Since category 03.10 only 
accounts for 16–18 per cent of the aid budget, these 
designations were not very informative. Adminis­
tration of this budget category was transferred 
from Norad to the Ministry of Foreign Affairs in 
2004 as part of a process to improve coordination 
of the aid system. The discontinuation of these des­
ignations was a natural consequence of this step. 

The fact that only category 03.10 could be used 
in countries designated as «partner countries» also 
restricted Norway’s ability to respond rapidly in 
specific situations. One example is the change that 

took place in Burundi when the humanitarian cri­
sis became less acute, and the international com­
munity needed to focus on stabilisation and state-
building efforts. When Liberia finally succeeded in 
holding free elections and Ellen Johnson Sirleaf 
became Africa’s first female president, there was 
also a need for swift political and practical support 
from the international community. 

The Government clearly stated in its 2008 
budget proposal that it was no longer expedient to 
continue with the distinction between main partner 
countries and other partner countries. A majority in 
the Storting supported this in its subsequent 
budget recommendation, and requested a discus­
sion about these concepts and the classification and 
selection of countries, and that possible alterations 
should be presented to the Storting. This was fol­
lowed up in the 2009 budget proposal, which also 
does away with the classification «partner countries 
for long-term bilateral development cooperation», 
and instead describes how different types of coop­
eration is combined in different types of countries. 

In addition to category 03.10, partner countries 
also receive aid from a number of other chapter 
items. Roughly 40 countries receive funds from 
allocations managed and allocated to individual 
countries by the Ministry. In 2009, the largest 
recipients of Norwegian aid will be Afghanistan, 
the Palestinian Territory, Sudan, Tanzania and 
Mozambique. 

There are several reasons why we should be 
flexible in relation to our choice of partner coun­
tries. The Government wishes to use development 
aid more strategically. In some countries, coopera­
tion will be very extensive, while in others it will be 
more narrowly targeted. In some cases, short-term 
humanitarian aid may be needed, or a rapid 
response to a changing conflict situation, while in 
others extensive long-term efforts are required. 
The nature of the cooperation will also change over 
time in step with the development and needs of the 
partner country in question. In countries such as 
Angola and Vietnam, our efforts have changed 
from extensive cooperation in a wide range of 
areas to focus on private sector development and 
technical cooperation. 

Norway is engaged in broad long-term cooper­
ation with a number of countries. Some of these are 
relatively stable states such as Tanzania, Mozam­
bique, Zambia, Malawi and Nicaragua, where Nor­
way’s efforts are primarily aimed at supporting 
these countries’ fight against poverty. 

In other countries such as Afghanistan, Sudan, 
Nepal and the Palestinian Territory, the goal of 
poverty reduction can only be achieved through 
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Figure 7.4  Largest recipients of Norwegian development aid. 
Source: Norad 

focusing much of our efforts on stabilisation, rec­
onciliation and state-building, because these coun­
tries are in a highly vulnerable situation. Coopera­
tion with these countries requires quite different 
insight and political sensitivity. 

In relation to all of these recipients, Norway 
has a broad engagement based on the country’s 
own poverty reduction strategy, with a substantial 
volume of assistance and an extensive local pres­
ence. The funding is provided via several budget 
chapters. Both our efforts in, and funding to fragile 
states have increased in recent years. The Govern­
ment wishes to continue its extensive engagement 
in these countries. 

In countries such as the Philippines, Haiti, 
Columbia and the Balkan countries, cooperation is 
linked to peace and reconciliation processes. The 
amount of support varies, and this is a demanding 
form of political engagement, requiring a long-
term approach. A common feature for these efforts 
is that they involve major political risk. In some 
cases, Norway itself is a facilitator in peace proc­
esses, but in most cases, Norway’s role is to sup­
port the efforts of the UN or other organisations to 
promote peace and reconciliation. 

In a significant number of countries, our efforts 
have a more thematic or strategic character. Bilat­
eral efforts to combat child and maternal mortality, 
for example, are limited to Nigeria, India, Tanzania 
and Pakistan. So far, Norway’s International Cli­

mate and Forest Initiative entails bilateral coopera­
tion with two countries, Brazil and Tanzania. Sub­
stantial funding is also being provided for projects 
in the Congo basin through the African Develop­
ment Bank, and to a number of other countries 
through UN and World Bank forest programmes. 
The Oil for Development initiative cooperates with 
Angola, Mozambique, Ghana, Madagascar and 
Afghanistan. Norway is also engaged in private 
sector and technical cooperation with a number of 
countries, including China, India, Angola and Viet­
nam. 

Humanitarian aid is provided through multilat­
eral funds or concentrated on countries and areas 
with major unmet humanitarian needs, where Nor­
way is particularly well qualified to contribute, and 
where the efforts can support peace and reconcili­
ation processes. The volume of humanitarian 
assistance provided to different regions and coun­
tries depends on shifting needs. In countries with 
ongoing crises, the level of humanitarian assist­
ance may be maintained for some time. Children, 
minorities and indigenous peoples are priority 
groups. Empowerment and protection of women 
are also priorities. These priorities are reflected in 
our involvement in countries such as Somalia, 
Burma, the Democratic Republic of Congo, Colom­
bia, North Korea and Iraq. 

The Government will continue to focus on pro­
viding aid to fragile states. This will include human­
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itarian aid, support for peace and reconciliation 
processes and long-term development aid. Norway 
is also strongly engaged in conflict resolution and 
peace efforts in a number of fragile states. The 
increased emphasis on fragile states is creating 
closer links between foreign policy and develop­
ment policy. It makes Norway an important actor at 
both country level and in international forums. 

Norway’s policy towards fragile states is in line 
with the international community’s focus on build­
ing stable states where the authorities can attend 
to the population’s needs and take responsibility 
for addressing international problems such as ter­
rorism and climate change. The closer links 
between foreign policy and development policy 
tools highlight the need to respond rapidly to acute 
needs in fragile states. The Government therefore 
sees it as inexpedient to classify countries accord­
ing to the budget category through which they 
receive support. The Government wishes to 
encourage discussion about the aid budget as a 
whole, with emphasis on the objective of the sup­
port given to individual countries. 

The Government will: 

•	 be more flexible in the selection of countries 
that receive aid 

•	 continue to emphasise fragile states in our 
development policy 

7.6 Key arenas 

There is a difference between arenas in which 
binding resolutions with normative guidelines are 
passed and funds allocated, and discussion forums 
where ideas are exchanged and developed. 

Binding agreements shift power. They assign 
responsibility, obligations and rights that have a 
bearing on national policy. Such agreements 
acquire great legitimacy and normative power. At 
the same time, however, less binding processes 
have a key role to play in the work of developing 
new ideas and approaches. Many important inter­
national processes have originated in arenas of this 
type. In many cases there is massive pressure from 
grassroots organisations. With the help of modern 
information technology, NGOs, networks and 
lobby groups are able to launch effective, targeted 
campaigns and can thus set the agenda. Success 
stories, such as the political decisions on debt 
relief, the prohibition of cluster munitions and pro­
tection of rainforests are all examples of how grass-
roots initiatives can influence global politics. 

The G8 is a forum that has succeeded in putting 
important development policy issues high up on 
the international agenda. This became clear at the 
Gleneagles Summit in 2005, at which the member 
countries agreed to double their aid by 2010, USD 
25 billion of which was to be earmarked for Africa. 
That was a strong signal, but follow-up has been 
weak. However, the G8 has also addressed other 
important global challenges with a bearing on 
development policy, such as climate issues, the 
food crisis and corruption. As the financial crisis 
developed, it became clear that the G8 would have 
to expand its membership in order to play the role 
it wished to play. The expansion resulted in the 
G20, which includes the world’s 20 most important 
economies. Norway has frequently had bilateral 
discussions with the individual member countries 
of the G8 on its work. We are not part of the G20, 
and we need to find good forms of cooperation, 
both with the group as a whole and with the indi­
vidual member countries. 

The World Economic Forum (WEF), which 
meets every year in Davos, increasingly includes 
development-related issues on its agenda. Innova­
tive financing mechanisms are a recurring topic. 
For several years, the Davos meetings have been a 
key forum for Norway to discuss the vaccination 
campaign that Prime Minister Jens Stoltenberg 
has spearheaded together with Gordon Brown and 
Tony Blair. In the time ahead, the Government will 
also focus on its policy relating to illicit financial 
flows and tax havens at these meetings. 

Decisions made in NATO are binding on its 
member states. In recent years, NATO has become 
more involved in issues relating to development 
policy. Experience from Afghanistan in particular 
has shown how important security is for develop­
ment, and, conversely, how important develop­
ment is for security. This creates grey areas where, 
in practice, the dividing line between military and 
humanitarian assignments is unclear. 

Norway has emphasised the established princi­
ple for civil-military cooperation, that international 
humanitarian efforts should primarily be carried 
out by civilians and coordinated by the UN in as 
close consultation as possible with local authori­
ties. In exceptional cases, the need for rapid and 
effective aid may necessitate drawing on military 
resources, particularly in relation to logistics and 
transport. NATO should also be able to contribute 
to aid efforts in connection with major natural dis­
asters. However, it must be a precondition that it 
does so at the direct request of the UN or the coun­
tries that are directly affected. As a rule, assistance 
from NATO should be limited to the initial phase of 
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Figure 7.5  The financial crisis requires broad international cooperation. It cannot be solved by Western 
countries alone. The first meeting of the G20 group in November 2008 was an important milestone in 
relations between new and established major economies. 
Photo: Stephen Jaffe/Scanpix 

emergency efforts, during which rapid distribution 
is a crucial consideration. After that, civilian actors 
should take over. NATO’s assistance must give 
added value and must not outcompete other actors. 
This necessitates close and regular coordination 
with the UN. A dialogue on disaster relief should 
be included in the broader cooperation between 
the UN and NATO. 

The EU has long shown interest in Norway as 
a development actor, and it wishes to have a closer 
dialogue with us on issues such as the connection 
between climate change and development, finan­
cial flows, tax havens and oil for development. The 
EU, on its part, conducts a development policy dia­
logue with actors with which Norway would like to 
have closer contact. The tripartite dialogue 
between the EU, Africa and China is of particular 
interest. 

Norway has participated in informal meetings 
with EU at ministerial and senior official level. Nor­
way also takes part in the European Development 
Days. This is to our mutual benefit. The EU is an 
important alliance partner in development policy. 
The Government wishes to strengthen its develop­
ment policy cooperation with the EU in the time 
ahead. 

The Government will: 

•	 use international arenas more strategically to 
promote Norwegian development policy posi­
tions 

•	 initiate closer cooperation with the EU in the 
field of development policy. 

7.7 A future without aid? 

The purpose of aid is twofold: to finance important 
initiatives and to give donors an opportunity to take 
part in discussions about development in individ­
ual countries. Both these dimensions – the political 
and financial – are crucial for combating poverty 
and building democratic societies. There has been 
increasing emphasis on the political dimension, 
particularly the efforts to promote human rights 
and combat corruption, during the 50 years that 
the rich countries have been involved in organised 
aid efforts. 

There will probably be a great need for aid in 
many countries for many years to come. For some 
countries, however, other sources of development 
financing could gradually become more attractive 
to recipients because they are less tied to issues 
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Box 7.8  Attractive investments 

«We like Chinese investment because we have 
one meeting, we discuss what they want to do, 
and then they just do it. There are no bench­
marks and preconditions, no environmental 
impact assessment. If a G8 country had offe­
red to rebuild the stadium, we’d still be having 
meetings about it.» 

Source: Sahr Johnny, Sierra Leone’s Ambassador to the 
People’s Republic of China, who was showing Chinese 
investors around potential development sites, New States­
man 4 July 2005. 

relating to governance and rights. Remittances, 
investments, tax revenues and loans and support 
from countries outside the OECD already account 
for larger financial flows than aid. Seen in isolation, 
this is obviously positive; aid should never be a 
goal in itself, merely a means to an end. However, 
it could also weaken the general political dialogue 
with countries facing major challenges in relation 
to human rights, corruption and governance, in 
addition to extensive poverty problems. Having 
pursued an active development policy for 50 years, 
Norway is regarded a credible and desirable part­
ner for many countries, and for numerous organi­
sations and centres of expertise. A large number of 
these have expressed a strong desire to continue 
close cooperation with Norway in future, regard­
less of the framework this entails. 

The Government therefore feels that it would 
be wise, even now while aid is still very much in 
demand, to actively strengthen strategic alliances 
with recipient countries with a view to continued 
cooperation in the future when aid may not be the 
cornerstone of our relations. Research communi­
ties and academia, the business community, 
NGOs, media, and political and cultural coopera­
tion could be the pillars on which such a collabora­
tion could be built. 

The Government will: 

•	 prepare an action plan for strengthening strate­
gic alliances that can form the basis for partner 
relations in countries in which aid gradually 
ceases to be the key element. 

7.8 Results, quality assurance and 
potential for improvement 

Aid works – but not well enough was the main mes­
sage of Norad’s Results Report for 2007, which 
emphasised that aid produces important results, 
but that aid alone cannot promote development in 
the country concerned or reach the ambitious 
goals set by the international community. 

Aid has helped to increase life expectancy and 
improve health and education. These are impor­
tant results, particularly in light of the strong 
growth in the world’s population in recent years. 
Calculations also show that aid has led to annual 
economic growth in African countries in the region 
of one per cent. This may seem modest, but it 
means that without aid Africa would have been 25 
per cent poorer. 

Evaluations of Norwegian-financed aid pro­
grammes show that many good results are 
achieved. This is confirmed by findings from sev­
eral hundred reviews of projects that receive Nor­
wegian funding. The long-term social conse­
quences are difficult to quantify, however. Norway 
is just one of many donors in a country, and there 
are many factors unrelated to aid that influence 
development. It is therefore difficult to trace 
results at the national level directly to specific 
projects or programmes supported by Norway – or 
by other donors for that matter. 

The Results Report for 2008, Development assis-
tance – no shortcuts to good results, shows that good 
results are achieved via all channels; Norwegian 
aid reaches the target groups. However, the report 
also points out that the various advantages of the 
different channels are not utilised systematically 
enough. 

The results are substantial seen in relation to the 
amount of Norwegian aid. There are two ways in 
particular that Norwegian efforts have influenced 
international development cooperation over the 
years: the early emphasis on recipients’ responsibil­
ity for their own development; and the recognition 
that no society can be developed from the outside. 
Moreover, the Norwegian focus on the opportuni­
ties available to and rights of women, indigenous 
peoples and other vulnerable groups has also been 
important and valuable. 

Cooperation based on both technical and politi­
cal dialogue produces good results. Likewise, 
more goals are achieved when efforts focus on 
areas that are high priority and in demand in the 
country concerned. Budget and sector support 
have become important instruments in this con­
text, and the results are good. 
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It is easier to measure the results of efforts in a 
delimited thematic area, such as the global health 
initiatives, than long-term sector initiatives. This 
makes thematic initiatives well-suited to mobilising 
political will for joint efforts that will make a differ­
ence at the global level. 

There are many indications that long-term 
cooperation may be needed to achieve lasting 
results. It is necessary to think 20 to 30 years ahead 
in the least developed countries. Another impor­
tant lesson is that good technical assistance and 
exchanges do not automatically result in capacity-
and institution-building. Competence-building is 
often valuable for the individuals concerned, while 
the results at the institutional level may be limited. 
This means that we have yet to find the best form 
of technical cooperation and training. 

Following up results 

Although it is difficult to measure the effect of aid 
on development in a particular country, it is still 
necessary to verify and document results. Good 
information about results is important to maintain 
confidence in aid both in Norway and in partner 
countries. We know from our own experience that 
it is difficult to measure the results of allocations of 

public funds. It is no easier in countries with weak 
institutions and limited capacity. 

The public, private and civil sectors all deliver 
services that are important to people’s welfare and 
to nation- and state-building. Well-functioning insti­
tutions are essential for a well-functioning state. It 
is necessary, therefore, to strengthen partner 
countries’ institutional competence and capacity 
with regard to result-oriented planning and man­
agement, and their ability to report on and learn 
from results and experience. 

Norway increasingly participates in joint evalu­
ations and reviews, in international work to 
develop methodology for evaluating and following 
up results, and in international forums aimed at 
increasing aid effectiveness. 

The Norwegian aid administration has estab­
lished extensive procedures for following up 
results at project, sector, country and agency level. 
Plans, results, budgets and expenditure are docu­
mented through three-year rolling strategic plans 
for Norwegian aid to more than 30 partner coun­
tries. Adjusted plans and strategies are then drawn 
up on the basis of the results achieved and experi­
ence gained and both Norway’s and the recipient 
country’s political priorities. A corresponding sys­
tem is used in connection with Norad’s cooperation 
with NGOs. 

Box 7.9  Budget support 

The term «budget support» refers to funds that 
are paid into the recipient country’s treasury, 
where they are pooled with the country’s own 
revenues. How the money is spent is decided by 
the parliament through normal budgetary pro­
cesses. The donors stipulate joint conditions 
relating to improving public financial manage­
ment systems, strengthening the poverty profile 
in the national budget and implementing anti­
corruption measures. 

In 2006, a multi-donor report on the results 
of budget support was produced. It covered the 
period from 1994 to 2004 and included seven 
countries: Malawi, Mozambique, Nicaragua, 
Uganda, Vietnam, Burkina Faso and Rwanda. 

The report concluded that budget support 
has had positive effects on public financial 
management. It has increased the authorities’ 
ownership and accountability and led to more 
systematic links between strategic planning and 
results. 

The report also concluded that budget support 
can be an effective, expedient and sustainable 
method for supporting poverty reduction strate­
gies. Budget support has clearly played a posi­
tive role in five of the seven countries studied 
(Burkina Faso, Mozambique, Rwanda, Uganda 
and Vietnam). In Nicaragua, budget support 
efforts have not come far enough for reliable 
conclusions to be drawn. In Malawi, budget sup­
port was deemed to be unsuccessful and it was 
stopped. It has subsequently been resumed fol­
lowing adjustments to the programme. The 
Malawian authorities have substantially impro­
ved financial management. 

The report shows that budget support is no 
more vulnerable to corruption than other forms 
of aid. Budget support has contributed to the 
prioritisation of efforts that are important to the 
poorest, and that expenditure on health and edu­
cation increased during the period studied. 
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Quality assurance 

Few sectors are subjected to such frequent and 
extensive control as the «aid industry». In addition 
to the regular reviews of the Norwegian aid admin­
istration carried out by the Office of the Auditor 
General, a number of control and quality assurance 
measures have been initiated by the Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs and Norad with a view to uncover­
ing and remedying any weaknesses in the system. 

New guidelines have been drawn up, and a cen­
tral support function has been established with 
overall responsibility in the Ministry for ensuring 
uniform administration of Norwegian grants. 

In order to ensure that rules and procedures 
are complied with, frequent performance reviews 
are carried out at embassies, in the Ministry and in 
Norad. Good systems have been developed for fol­
lowing up findings and recommendations. 

Mandatory procedures have been developed 
for assessing the risk of corruption and following 
up suspected irregularities in all projects. Every­
one who works in the foreign service receives anti­
corruption training. Norway promotes greater 
transparency with respect to the use of aid funds. 
We support the Publish What You Pay campaign. 
The Ministry of Foreign Affairs and Norad have 
established whistle-blowing systems for reporting 
suspected cases of corruption. 

Despite good systems for control, cases are 
regularly uncovered in which funds have been mis­
appropriated and planned outcomes have failed to 
materialise. There are several reasons for this, and 
it serves to demonstrate how challenging aid 
efforts are. The Ministry of Foreign Affairs and 
Norad deal with these challenges by continuously 
updating and revising their control and quality 
assurance systems. Targeted efforts to increase 
our partners’ capacity and competence to develop 
and apply their own systems are equally important. 
Thorough and comprehensive evaluations of all 
partners are carried out in advance. Particular 
emphasis is placed on their capacity and compe­
tence to manage Norwegian funds and to achieve 
planned outcomes. 

A special toolbox has been developed for qual­
ity assurance in the form of a series of handbooks 
and guides. They are based on a broad range of 
international experience. Everyone who adminis­
ters aid funds can also request sector or adminis­
trative advice. Continuous legal quality assurance 
of agreements, contracts and procurements also 
helps to reduce risk and increase the possibility of 
achieving the planned results. All foreign service 
staff with administrative responsibility undergo 

mandatory administrative training. Much of this 
training is open to partners in Norway and abroad. 

Developing knowledge 

The development of new knowledge largely 
involves research, but it can also entail other fac­
tors. These include studies or comparisons of avail­
able research results by expert committees such 
as the Norwegian Policy Coherence Commission 
and the Commission on Capital Flight from Devel­
oping Countries, as well as the systemisation of les­
sons learned and experience gained from work in 
the field. 

In this connection, it is also necessary to 
include the perspectives of developing countries to 
ensure that the knowledge gained is less biased by 
a Western perspective. In this connection, there 
are two tasks that need to be fulfilled at the same 
time: increasing the quality and relevance of 
research; and strengthening research institutions 
in developing countries. The active recruitment of 
Norwegian researchers from multicultural back­
grounds will give added value to Norwegian 
research institutions. 

There is a great deal of research on and evalua­
tions of aid programmes and the effect they have. 
The Government wishes this to continue, but with 
more emphasis on how aid can best be used strate­
gically in connection with important development 
processes. Aid is often evaluated in a vacuum, 
rather than as one of many factors that contribute 
to development. 

More systematic use of current knowledge 

There is already a great deal of relevant knowledge 
about development, but it is a challenge for the 
administration to utilise it. 

Norad is the centre of technical expertise for 
the Ministry of Foreign Affairs and the embassies. 
It has solid, broad-based expertise in a number of 
fields within the aid sector. It also cooperates with 
a number of external expert groups, including 
research institutions, ministries and directorates, 
and other expert bodies. 

Efforts are being made to ensure that the Min­
istry of Foreign Affairs and Norad become even 
better at using available knowledge more system­
atically in their day-to-day work. In 2007, Norad 
entered into agreements with the Research Coun­
cil of Norway and the Centre for Development and 
Environment on various communication activities 
to improve knowledge in the government adminis­
tration. All aid programmes are also required to 
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include communication plans and to organise 
expert conferences to which the public administra­
tion is invited. Norad and the Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs also invite researchers from abroad to 
come and present results in relevant fields. During 
the current parliamentary period, the Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs established the project «Refleks – 
globalisation and national interests» (the Refleks 
project) under the auspices of the Minister of For­
eign Affairs, as well as the Minister of International 
Development’s policy analysis unit. Both of these 
are responsible for following up international and 
national knowledge development. 

It has been found that commissioned research 
and studies are the most used forms of research. 
These are delivered quickly and often have a form 
that is well suited to respond to particular needs. 
However, a dilemma may arise, since the assign­
ment is defined by the client and is not subject to 
an academic quality assurance process. Normally 
research programmes are subject to competition, 
both in advance, in the selection process, and sub­
sequently, through peer reviews prior to publica­
tion. This quality control is not as systematic in 
commissioned research and studies. 

The Research Council of Norway and research 
institutions need to discuss more closely the devel­

opment of good systems for supporting long-term 
research and, at the same time, ensuring that the 
knowledge produced through research pro­
grammes, including basic research, is made availa­
ble to users in a suitable form and time frame. One 
way forward is to use research programmes to 
build up stronger long-term centres of expertise 
specialising in priority areas in Norwegian devel­
opment and foreign policy, and to further 
strengthen existing centres of expertise. 

The Government will: 

•	 strengthen focus on results and aid effective­
ness 

•	 ensure transparency and access to information 
with regard to the Norwegian aid administra­
tion 

•	 seek to make relevant knowledge about devel­
opment more readily accessible to the aid 
administration 

•	 promote research in Norway into priority 
areas for development policy and into the com­
plex factors that promote or impede develop­
ment. 
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8 Coherence between domestic and development policy
 

Most policy areas in Norway are, as in all other 
countries, designed to serve national interests and 
objectives. At the same time, these policy areas 
affect, to varying degrees, the situation in poor 
countries. Some policies support the development 
objectives we have committed ourselves to, others 
do not. The Government’s aim is to ensure that the 
overall effect of Norwegian policy in a range of 
areas promotes economic growth and poverty 
reduction in developing countries. This requires 
coherence in policy development. 

According to the Organization for Economic 
Cooperation and Development (OECD), policy 
coherence for development means working to 
ensure that the objectives and results of a Govern­
ment’s development policies are not undermined 
by other policies of that Government that impact 
on developing countries, and that these other poli­
cies support development objectives. The OECD is 
the organisation that has worked the longest with 
policy coherence for development. Responsibility 
for this field has been placed directly under the 
Secretary General, which reflects the fact that pol­
icy coherence spans all the areas dealt with by the 
organisation. In 2001, the OECD published the 
DAC Guidelines on Poverty Reduction, which 
included a checklist for policy coherence for use in 
developing new policy. 

Policy coherence for development is not just 
the responsibility of rich countries. All countries’ 
policies have an effect on each other. The policies 
of major economies obviously have a greater effect 
than those of more minor ones. The emerging 
economies in Asia and Latin America should there­
fore be expected to exercise the same caution 
towards poor countries as the OECD countries. 

Putting policy coherence for development into 
practice is difficult, particularly in areas such as 
trade and migration, but also in areas such as pat­
ent rights, climate change and investment. Con­
flicts can easily arise when national interests have 
to be weighed against the interests of developing 
countries. 

In its annual Commitment to Development 
Index, the think tank Center for Global Develop­
ment in Washington ranks 22 OECD countries 
according to how development-friendly their over­

all policies are. In the 2008 index, Norway shares 
second place with Sweden. The Netherlands is in 
first place. Japan and South Korea come last, 
mainly due to their weak contribution to develop­
ment through their aid, migration and trade poli­
cies. Norway’s high score is due to our particularly 
development-friendly aid, climate and security pol­
icies. We are among the top 30 per cent in most 
areas, apart from trade, where we rank 20th due to 
our high tariffs on agricultural products. 

Coherence and other countries 

In several of its reviews of Norwegian development 
policy, the OECD has pointed out that Norway has 
good intentions, and has implemented measures to 
achieve broad policy coherence with its develop­
ment objectives. However it also notes that Norway 
is not working systematically enough in this field. In 
this respect Norway differs from, for example, Swe­
den, which in 2003 was the first country in the world 
to enact legislation providing for an overall policy 
for global development with a common objective for 
all policy areas. Each ministry is responsible for 
this work within its own policy areas. The Swedish 
Ministry for Foreign Affairs submits an annual 
report to the Riksdag on Sweden’s policy for global 
development. The OECD has proposed that Nor­
way should introduce a similar system. 

The UK has two statutes governing develop­
ment issues. One sets out the principles for what 
aid funds can be used for, and how this spending is 
to be reported to Parliament. The other, the 
International Development (Reporting and Trans-
parency) Act 2006, sets out that the Secretary of 
State for International Development is to report to 
Parliament on progress towards the UN target of 
spending 0.7 per cent of gross national income on 
aid, aid effectiveness and UN Millennium Develop­
ment Goal (MDG) 1 (eradication of extreme pov­
erty and hunger), MDG 7 (environmental sustain-
ability), MDG 8 (global partnership for develop­
ment), and policy coherence. The UK Department 
for International Development (DFID) has an 
annual dialogue with other relevant ministries and 
departments. All this is reported on in a separate 
chapter of DFID’s Annual Report. 
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Figure 8.1  Coherent for development? (NOU 
2008:14) was submitted in September 2008. 

The Netherlands has established a unit in the 
Ministry of Foreign Affairs that examines propos­
als from the European Commission to identify any 
negative effects for developing countries. In 2005, 
the EU adopted a communication on policy coher­
ence in efforts to achieve the MDGs. Twelve policy 
areas have been identified as particularly impor­
tant. These include aid, trade, migration, transfer 
of technology, investment, security and the envi­
ronment. The European Commission produces an 
annual report on progress in this area on the basis 
of reports from individual countries. 

Norway’s work in this area 

The white paper Fighting Poverty Together (Report 
No. 35 (2003–2004) to the Storting), which was 
presented by the Bondevik II Government, dis­
cussed the importance of policy coherence for 
development. The present Government (Stolten­
berg II) wanted to continue and concretise this 
work, and therefore appointed the broadly based 
Norwegian Policy Coherence Commission in 2006 
to study this area further. The Commission’s 
report Coherent for development? (NOU 2008:14) 
was submitted in September 2008. It examines 

Norwegian policy on trade, investment, financing 
for development, climate change and energy, 
migration, transfer of knowledge and technology, 
and peace, security and defence. The report 
describes and analyses Norwegian policy in all 
these areas and recommends a considerable 
number of measures to increase policy coherence 
with Norway’s development goals. 

In this white paper, the Government has pre­
sented a policy for following up many of the areas 
covered by the Coherent for development? report. 

The broad approach of the report means that it 
is relevant not only for this white paper, but also for 
a number of other ongoing processes. The task of 
making Norway’s overall policy more develop­
ment-friendly is a difficult and long-term process. 

The Government intends to follow up the Pol­
icy Coherence Commission’s and the OECD’s rec­
ommendations and work more systematically on 
policy coherence for development. In this connec­
tion, the Storting is requested to consider estab­
lishing a system whereby the Government reports 
annually on what is being done to ensure that poli­
cies in various areas promote development in poor 
countries. These reports could, for example, 
describe both the actual or expected effects of Nor­
wegian policy on developing countries and Nor­
way’s actions in this area, for example with regard 
to legislation, strategies and the positions taken in 
international negotiations. These reports should 
also deal with the framework conditions for the 
Norwegian business sector. 

The Government will: 

•	 seek to make all Norwegian policy more devel­
opment friendly 

•	 request the Storting to consider establishing a 
system whereby the Government reports 
annually on the coherence of Norwegian pol­
icy in relevant areas with its development 
objectives. 

The Ministry of Foreign Affairs 

h e r e b y  r e c o m m e n d s :  

that the recommendation from the Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs concerning climate, conflict and 
capital – adapting to change, dated 13 February 
2009, should be submitted to the Storting. 
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